
(Nov. 30, 2023) Coming on the 
heels of the insanely popular Ice Ice 
Berlin event on Friday night is the 
Christmas Parade, set 7-9 p.m., 
Thursday, Dec. 7. 

Santa will be riding high in a 
Berlin fire engine as he leads the pa-
rade, which will include participants 
from a variety of schools, marching 
bands, fire departments, local busi-
nesses, nonprofits and car clubs, ac-
cording to Ivy Wells, the director of 
economic and community develop-

ment for the Town of Berlin.  
DJ Big Al Reno will emcee the event 

from a stage near the Taylor House 
Museum. The parade starts at The 
Berlin Welcome Center and proceeds 
north to the Berlin Fire Company. The 
judging stand is  located on 
West/Baker Street.  

Veterans of the event know to ex-
pect big crowds, similar to Ice Ice 
Berlin, and Wells anticipates about 
5,000 people will attend the parade.  

Turnout for Ice Ice Berlin was far 
beyond that of any other year, Wells 
said, with some stores having to insti-

tute a one-in, one-out policy to man-
age the crowd sizes in their shops. 
While most stores will not be open 
during the parade, most restaurants 
will be. Visitors are advised to plan 
ahead if they want to eat at a restau-
rant in town. 

Main Street will be closed from 5-
10 p.m. from Roadie Joe’s Bar and 
Grill to the Berlin Library, according 
to Allison Early, the administrative 
assistant for the economic and com-
munity development department. 
Visitors to town should park at the 
Berlin Intermediate School on 

Franklin Avenue, where a shuttle bus, 
sponsored by the Casino at Ocean 
Downs, will take them to the parade 
viewing area. 

For those making plans to bring in 
the new year, Berlin with its two ball 
drops will be the place to be. The first 
drop will be for the kids at 6 p.m. and 
the other will be at midnight. The 
New Year’s Eve party will feature 
laser shows, dancing and more. The 
event is free. 

“New Year’s Eve will probably be 
just as crowded and just as much 
fun,” Wells said.  
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Berlin Christmas parade could draw 5,000

Pay structure to be 
reformed per study

(Nov. 30, 2023) The Town of 
Berlin will revamp its wage scales 
based on a study conducted by Pay-
Point HR, an Anne Arundel County 
professional services firm, which 
found compensation of municipal 
employees lagging by an average of 
8.5 percent across all departments. 

The economic development de-
partment was the lowest at 22 per-
cent below market and electric 
utilities was closer to on par with the 
market at 0.1 percent above market.  

PayPoint HR recommended in its 
report that the town consider com-
pensation adjustments for all job ti-
tles, a comprehensive approach, with 
no wage reductions.  

The cost would be about $370,000 
to bring every employee to 50 percent 
of the market rate for their positions, 
according to Berlin Human Re-
sources Director Kelsey Jensen. 

While the goal is to bring wages up 
to competitive levels with other small 
towns, the council decided that the 
focus should be to get all staff estab-
lished in a newly developed grade 
and step structure similar to what the 
federal government uses. 

The structure has 25 grades and 21 
steps in each grade. Salaries range 
from $31,200 to $164,883. 

“This will give employees consis-
tency year after 
year,” said 
Councilmember 
Dean Burrell.  

“This is a win 
for employees, a 
win for council 
and a win for 
residents due to 
its trans-
parency,” Coun-
cilmember Jay 
Knerr said.  

Jensen told 
the council the 
grade and step 
structure makes 
it easier to build 
a budget and is 
more transpar-
ent for hiring and current staff. 

With this structure agreed to, 
Jensen and Town Administrator 
Mary Bohlen will assign a grade to 
each position and present that pro-
posal to the council. The council will 
not vote on the assigned grades but 

 Jay Knerr: 
‘This is a win for 
employees, a win 
for council and a 
win for residents 

due to its 
transparency’

By Cindy Hoffman 
Staff Writer

By Cindy Hoffman 
Staff Writer

See BERLIN Page 4
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TOWN SPIRIT 
The staff of the Town of Berlin decorated the Christmas tree outside of the Atlantic Hotel before 
the big Ice Ice Berlin event, which drew thousands to the town last Friday. 
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Poll shows Berlin residents 
happy with town’s services

(Nov. 30, 2023) An overwhelming 
majority of residents are satisfied 
with the quality of life provided by the 
Town of Berlin, according to a survey 
of the public’s view of municipal serv-
ices conducted by BEACON (The 
Business Economic And Community 
Outreach Network) at Salisbury Uni-
versity. 

The survey, which was mailed out 
in residents’ utility bills, was con-
ducted as phase one of a strategic 
planning process embarked by the 
town. 

After much debate over the suc-
cess of phase one, the Town Council 
voted Monday to allow BEACON to 
proceed with phase two of the strate-
gic planning process, with Coun-
cilmembers Steve Green, Jay Knerr 
and Dean Burrell voting in favor and 
Councilmembers Jack Orris and 
Shaneka Nichols voting against it.  

The concern raised by Orris and 
Nichols was the survey’s low level of 
response. 

“I would have preferred to see a lit-
tle more outreach for the strategic 
plan,” council member Jack Orris 
said.  

Nichols noted that those receiving 
the utility bill are property owners, 
but could be renting the home to a 
resident who then did not receive the 
survey.  

BEACON received 111 survey re-
sponses from Berlin residents, a 2 
percent return. 

Mayor Zack Tyndall reminded 
council members that that was a 
larger rate of response than the 
turnout in the last town elections. 

“BEACON has done a fabulous job 
with phase 1.  Phase 2, that’s where it 
will start to take shape,” Tyndall 
said.  

Green noted that there were no 
surprises in the survey’s results, so he 
was not too concerned about the low 
response rate.  

Ninety percent of respondents said 
they were either satisfied or very sat-

isfied with the quality of life in Berlin, 
the survey found. 

BEACON surveyed residents and 
conducted a separate phone survey of 
council members and two Worcester 
County commissioners, with resi-
dents and the elected officials provid-
ing similar responses.  

Both residents and elected officials 
noted strengths such as the small 
town charm of Berlin, sense of com-
munity and safety.  

Elected officials also noted cus-
tomer service, unique town events, 
and transparency by the local govern-
ment.  

Similar to residents’ responses, the 
elected officials surveyed said they 
were concerned about parking, af-
fordable housing, an aging infrastruc-
ture and stormwater management. 

Elected officials thought town pri-
orities should include building a new 
community center, plans for Heron 
Park and the skate park, stormwater 
management, sidewalks, and funding 
for infrastructure and the fire depart-
ment.  

When asked what specific commu-
nity services or facilities are lacking, 
60 percent of those polled identified 
recreational facilities and 32 percent 
said affordable housing. 

Sixty-three percent of the respon-
dents thought the local government 
involved residents in the decision-
making process. 

When residents were asked what 
specific goals the town should priori-
tize in its strategic planning, the most 
mentioned objective was environ-
mental conservation. Historic preser-
vation and fiscal responsibility tied 
for second and infrastructure and 
services came in third.  

BEACON also convened a stake-
holders meeting with representatives 
from Atlantic General Hospital, the 
Worcester County Board of Educa-
tion, Berlin Police Department, 
Tourism and various town employ-
ees.  

During the session, the representa-

By Cindy Hoffman 
Staff Writer

See SURVEY Page 4
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will have the opportunity to comment 
on them.  

Employees can expect wage/step 
increases on their anniversary date 
and will be able to see and know that 
increase by looking at a grade and 
step chart. Current employees will be 
placed in a grade based on their posi-
tions and Jenson and Bohlen will de-
termine their step based on the 
length of time in the position and in 
the town’s employ. 

Those with long-term tenure could 
max out on the steps and at that 
point, only get cost-of-living or COLA 
increases in their salary. Bohlen esti-

mated that there are less than 10 em-
ployees who are in that position.  

New employees will be placed on 
the grade scale based on their posi-
tion and then the step will be deter-
mined based on their experience, 
training and if they held a previous 
position in the town.  

The pay structure should be in 
place for next fiscal year, according to 
Jensen. The town attempted a similar 
structure years ago but did not fully 
implement it.  

“We need to make sure we are im-
plementing what we are putting out 
there,” Councilmember Shaneka 
Nichols said. 

Page 4 Bayside Gazette November 30, 2023

CINDY HOFFMAN/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 
Berlin council members discuss an employee wage structure with Kelsey Jensen, the director of human resources for the Town of Berlin during their Monday meeting. 

Berlin worker salaries adjust
Continued from Page 1

tives discussed the strengths and 
weaknesses of the town with the team 
from BEACON, with the results mir-
roring those of the residents and 
elected officials replying to the survey. 

In addition, the representatives 
noted a limited workforce to fill posi-
tions in public services and concern 
over infrastructure, including fiber 
optic internet.  

The group then drafted examples 
of vision statements for the town. 
One example of a vision statement 
created said, “At the heart of the 
Town of Berlin lies our unwavering 
commitment to fostering a commu-
nity that embodies a clean, safe, en-
joyable, and affordable environment 
for residents, workers, and visitors 
alike. We envision a town where 
these core values serve as the founda-
tion for a vibrant and thriving com-
munity, creating a harmonious 
balance between tradition and 

progress.”  
Based on the discussion with the 

council, BEACON will delay its public 
meeting, scheduled for Dec. 4 to Jan-
uary. The hope is that after the holi-
days attendance will be greater. Two 
meetings will take place, one at the 
Berlin Library and one at St. Paul’s 
UMC on Flower Street. Dates and 
times have yet to be set.  

The meetings will give residents 
another opportunity to share their 
thoughts. BEACON representatives 
will be asking the same questions as 
those provided in the print survey in 
hopes of getting more perspective 
from residents. 

“The public will have multiple op-
tions to comment throughout the 
process,” Tyndall said. 

Also included in phase two is a 
half-day strategic planning retreat for 
a targeted group of officials and con-
stituents. Phase 3 will be the develop-
ment of the strategic plan.

Survey results identify town 
strengths and weaknesses
Continued from Page 3
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Berlin Council Briefs 

(Nov. 30, 2023) The Berlin mayor 
and Town Council discussed events, 
police pension funding and roads dur-
ing their Monday meeting.  

Events 
A motion was approved for two 

changes to the 2024 town event 
schedule. The Fall Cruisers event was 
moved to Saturday, Oct. 12 to coin-
cide with the Ocean City Fall cruisers 
event. That move caused the Oktober-
fest to move to Saturday, Oct. 19 with 
a rain date of Sunday, Oct. 20.  

LEOPS 
A motion to phase out the planned 

use of casino funds for Law Enforce-
ment Officers Pension System 
(LEOPS) was tabled until the Decem-
ber council meeting.  

Currently, the town covers all of the 
expenses for LEOPS with casino 

funds in its multi-year spending 
plan. This was approved earlier this 
month by the Local Development 
Council (LDC) of Worcester County, 
with the caveat that the town would 
agree to phase out relying on casino 
funds for LEOPS in its next multi-year 
plan.  

But Mayor Zack Tyndall noted that 
the council cannot legally bind future 
councils, obligating the council to 
table the motion so members can 
look at language that will acknowl-
edge the request of the LDC without 
locking in a future council to a deci-
sion.     

Roads 
In an email poll vote, the council 

unanimously approved proceeding 
with Straight Line to perform striping 
and related work on Seahawk Road 
between Route 50 and Flower Street. 
The cost of the project is $20,000 
and will be covered with reallocated 
money from this year’s budget.

By Cindy Hoffman 
Staff Writer

CINDY HOFFMAN/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 

CHRISTMAS IN BERLIN 
(Left) Hundreds of people join the Delmarva Chorus in singing Christmas tunes during the tree 
lighting event at White Horse Park on Saturday night. (Right) A cheery archway entrance to the 50  
decorated trees sponsored by local businesses and organizations in White Horse Park.   
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Mailloux lawyers file brief affirming dismissal

(Nov. 30, 2023) The appeals case 
of Tyler Mailloux, 23, of Berlin, con-
tinues moving forward with the filing 
of an appellee brief that argues the 
state’s attorney charged the defen-
dant in the wrong court. 

On Nov. 17, the Appellate Court of 
Maryland filed received brief from 
Mailloux’s defense team, Natasha 
Dartigue, public defender from the 
state’s appellate division, and Celia 
Anderson Davis, an assistant public 
defender.  

In the document, the two assert 
that Dorchester County Circuit Court 
Judge Brett W. Wilson correctly dis-
missed all 17 of the counts Mailloux 
faced after Worcester County State’s 
Attorney Kristin Heiser charged him 
as the driver in the hit-and-run that 
killed Gavin Knupp, 14, of Ocean 
Pines in July 2022. 

Wilson decided to dismiss the 
charges at a motions hearing on Aug. 
18 at the Worcester County Circuit 
Court in Snow Hill. The dismiss came 
ahead of the September trial date in 
the case, thus removing it from the 

docket. 
Four of the 17 charges against 

Mailloux were felonies, and two car-
ried a maximum sentence of 10 years 
in prison. All the charges were related 
to Mailloux’s alleged failure to stop at 
the scene or report it later. 

At the hearing in August, Wilson 
agreed with Mailloux’s attorney, 
George Psoras Jr., of Rice Murtha & 
Psoras LLC in Lutherville, who filed 
a motion to dismiss the charges based 
on the claim that Worcester County 
District Court had “exclusive original 
jurisdiction” over the first eight 
counts, which are classified as viola-
tions of Maryland’s Transportation 
Code. 

Wilson cited a section from the 
Maryland Code’s Courts and Judicial 
Proceedings article that said district 
court holds exclusive original juris-
diction over these types of violations, 
whether they are a felony or misde-
meanor. 

By Wilson’s reasoning, prosecu-
tors should have filed the charges in 
district court first instead of going 
straight to circuit court. 

The Worcester County State’s At-
torney’s Office filed an appeal of the 
decision the same day. 

The appellee brief further declares 
the validity of Wilson’s decision and 
rebuts an appellant brief from Mary-

land Attorney General Anthony 
Brown that outlines the state’s objec-
tion to the dismissal of charges, 
which was filed into the appeals case 
on Oct. 19. 

In the new brief, Mailloux’s de-
fense says that the state is basing its 
argument on section 4-302(d)(1) of 
Maryland’s Courts and Judicial Pro-
ceedings article, which says that dis-
trict court has concurrent 
jurisdiction with circuit court when 
the penalty of a charge is three or 
more years in prison or a $2,500 or 
greater fine.  

Counts one through eight met that 
threshold, according to the state’s ap-
pellant brief from October. With con-
current jurisdiction, the charges 
could have been filed in either court 
at the prosecutor’s discretion. 

Mailloux’s attorneys have base 
their counter-argument on section 4-
301(b)(17) of the same courts article, 
which says that district court has ex-
clusive original jurisdiction over both 
felony and misdemeanor charges 
against anyone 18-years-old or over 
who is charged with a violation of the 
transportation article.  

The public defenders say in the 
brief that section 4-301(a) further 
helps their case since it says district 
court has exclusive original jurisdic-
tion over vehicle law violations when 

the defendant is at least 16 years old.  
“This court is tasked with deter-

mining which of the two statutes 
takes precedence at the charging 
stage,” according to Mailloux’s ap-
pellee brief.  

The defense says that since 4-301 
is the “first and more specific” of the 
two sections should take precedence 
and supersede the exception given to 
charges that meet the penalty thresh-
old outlined in 4-302.  

“The state would have the excep-
tion swallow the rule,” according to 
the brief from Mailloux’s lawyers.  

Arguments in the brief also say 
that prosecutors stripped Mailloux of 
his Fourteenth Amendment right to a 
fair trial by filing the charges in cir-
cuit court.  

If prosecutors had originally 
charged Mailloux in district court, he 
would have had the choice to con-
tinue the trial in district court or 
move the case into circuit court for a 
judge or jury trial. Defense attorneys 
claim that the state deprived Mail-
loux of his right to choose by deciding 
for him. 

“Given Maryland’s two-tiered trial 
court system, there could have been 
concurrent jurisdiction for trial of the 
misdemeanors and felonies charged, 
but not for charging them,” according 
to the defense’s brief.

By Hunter Hine 
Staff Writer

Appeals case about Knupp 
hit-and-run charges sees 
arguments over court code 
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(Nov. 30, 2023) Maryland’s sports 
wagering market had the best month 
yet this October, with the 13 retail and 
12 mobile sportsbooks combining to 
generate more than $5.8 million in 
contributions to the state.  

Each sportsbook, including the re-
tail establishment at Ocean Downs off 
of Route 589, pays 15 percent of tax-
able wins to the Blueprint for Mary-
land’s Future Fund, which supports 
public education programs. 

According to a news release, 
statewide handle in October totaled 
more than $483 million, with mobile 
handle accounting for almost 96 per-
cent. Mobile wagering delivered over 
$5.5 million in contributions to the 
state, while retail sportsbooks con-
tributed $310,717. 

The release said the latest contribu-
tion was the best single-month total by 
a margin of 9.5 percent, surpassing 
the more than $5.3 million generated 
in March.  

October’s handle was Maryland’s 
second-best single-month total, trail-
ing only December 2022.Through the 
first four months of Fiscal Year 2024, 
sports wagering has contributed more 
than $14.9 million to the Blueprint 
fund. 

“People love to bet on football, and 
that is certainly reflected in the handle 
this time of year,” Maryland Lottery 
and Gaming Director John Martin 
said in the release. “The Ravens’ suc-
cess and college football are contribut-
ing factors, and there is a convergence 
of the seasons in October, with the 

baseball playoffs and World Series 
and the start of hockey and basketball. 
From an overall perspective, the re-
sults show that a robust market has 
taken shape here in Maryland and is 
making a steady contribution to the 
state’s education programs.”  

A detailed summary of each 
sportsbook’s October 2023 results, in-
cluding handle, hold percentage, 
prizes paid, promotional play, taxable 
win, and contribution to the state, 
along with a summary of statewide 

handle and hold by sport is available 
for viewing and download at mdgam-
ing.com. 

Maryland’s sports wagering market 
launched with five retail locations, in-
cluding Ocean Downs, in December 
2021. The first seven mobile sports-
books launched in November 2022. 
As of the end of October, the release 
said the state had a total 13 retail loca-
tions and 12 mobile operators. More 
retail and mobile sportsbooks are ex-
pected to launch in the near future.
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Sports betting generated $5.8M for state
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TREE LIGHTING 
Thousands turned out for Ice Ice Berlin on Friday night to bring in the holiday season.

CINDY HOFFMAN/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 
Numerous ice sculptures, sponsored by local 
business and organizations lined Main Street 
for the annual Ice Ice Berlin holiday event on 
Friday. 

BOY SCOUT TROOP 2173 

CHRISTMAS CRAFT FAIR
SAT., DEC. 9TH  10AM – 3PM • SELBYVILLE B.P.O. ELKS LODGE
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HOMEMADE SCENTED CANDLES & JEWELRY  
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– BRING THEM TO THE EVENT!

13308 WORCESTER HWY/RT. 113 BISHOPVILLE, MD 
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For additional information, call Eileen Dudley 443.880.7180 
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(Nov. 30, 2023) Throughout the 
month of December, the Ocean Pines 
Farmers & Artisans Market will host 

“Tinsel & Twine” markets featuring 
holiday cheer, family friendly activi-
ties, fresh local produce and hand-
made gift items.  

Market Manager David Bean said 
in a news release that the holiday-
themed markets will be held every 
Saturday, from Dec. 2-23. 

“The winter holiday season at the 
Ocean Pines Farmers & Artisans 
Market is a wonderful time of year,” 
he said. “Come get all the trimmings 
at the market for the most delicious 
holiday meal ever, and don’t forget to 
get your fresh produce, floral 
arrangements, and goodies while 
you’re here.”  

Bean said market merchants are 
taking special orders for the holiday 
season, and the marketplace is full of 
great holiday gift ideas.   

“Homemade jams and jellies make 
a wonderful gift for a co-worker or 
neighbor,” he said. “Guys, you’ll find 
that one-of-a-kind, hand-crafted jew-
elry she’ll cherish for years to come.”  

He added that bakers have selec-
tions of homemade goods, from cook-
ies to made-from-scratch pies.  

Fresh, local oysters are another 
holiday favorite. The release said Dize 
Seafood will stock oysters each week, 
just hours out of the local waters and 
sold both shucked and in the shell.   

On Saturday, Dec. 9, there will be 
a candy cane scavenger hunt.    

“Shoppers will receive a scavenger 
hunt clue board that will direct them 
to participating market merchants, 
community partners and artisans,” 
Bean said. “When the shoppers fol-
low the clues and arrive at the market 
location, they’ll be rewarded with a 
small token, like a mini candy cane or 
some other small gift.”  

Once the scavenger hunt clue 
board is filled out, shoppers can re-
turn their board to special market 
guest Miss Ginger, the head baker 
from Santa’s workshop at the North 
Pole.   

Local singer and keyboardist 

Logan Oluvic will be on the market 
stage performing holiday music. Peatl 
Moon Facepainting will offer special 
holiday facepainting as well. 

Bean added that his office recently 
confirmed with the North Pole that 
Mrs. Claus plans to attend the scav-
enger hunt.  

“Mrs. Claus shops at the Ocean 
Pines marketplace each year to 
gather items for her holiday dinner 
needs,” he said. “It’s a big honor for 
all of us.”  

This year, Christmas and New 
Year’s Day fall on Mondays. Because 
of that, Bean said in the release that 
there would be no disruption to the 
market’s regular schedule.   

The Ocean Pines Farmers & Arti-
sans Market is open 9 a.m. to noon on 
Saturdays in White Horse Park, next 
to the Ocean Pines Administration 
Building and Police Department.   

For more information, visit ocean-
pines.org/web/pages/farmers-arti-
sans-market. 
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‘Tinsel & Twine’ OP holiday farmers markets
Prepare for the season with 
baked goods, gifts, fresh 
produce, oysters and more

Marine Debris Summit set Dec. 6 
(Nov. 30, 2023) The Mid-Atlantic 

Regional Council on the Ocean’s 
2023 Mid-Atlantic Marine Debris 
Summit will be held at the Ocean City 
Convention Center Dec. 6 and 7. 

According to a news release, the 
event is free to attend and open to the 
public, though pre-registration is es-
sential due to limited capacity. 

Organized biennially by regional 
council, the release said the summit 
aims to foster collaboration among a 
diverse range of stakeholders tackling 
marine debris and its sources. The 
agenda is designed to spark dialogue 
on inclusive strategies, enhance coor-
dination efforts, explore current and 
future marine debris concerns, and 
spotlight prevention and reduction 
solutions. 

The comprehensive program will 
cover topics such as the impact of mi-
croplastics and nanoplastics on hu-
mans, wildlife, and ecosystems; 

strategies for managing debris from 
coastal storms; and discussions on 
large-scale removal initiatives and 
policy development. 

In a blend of education and enter-
tainment, the release said a Marine 
Debris Trivia Night will be hosted at  
6 p.m. after the first say of the sum-
mit at Seacrets. 

The Maryland Coastal Bays pro-
gram has also invited students and 
early-career professionals to partici-
pate in a dedicated poster session at 
the summit. 

The release said the session allows 
participants to showcase innovative 
research and contribute to the 
broader conversation on marine de-
bris solutions. It is not only a chance 
to gain visibility for the participants’ 
work, but also to receive valuable 
feedback and foster connections.  

Details on submission guidelines 
and deadlines can be found on the 

summit’s registration page. 
The Mid-Atlantic Regional Council 

has limited space for nonprofit or-
ganizations and universities to show-
case projects at exhibit tables during 
the two day-summit. The release said 
there is no cost to table for universi-
ties and nonprofit organizations and 
opportunities will be on a first come 
first serve basis. 

Visit midatlanticocean.org/2023-
mid-atlantic-marine-debris-summit/ 
to see the full agenda and to register 
for the summit. 

The Maryland Coastal Bays Pro-
gram encourages all residents and 
community groups to attend the 
summit to learn more about marine 
debris to better understand the im-
pact on the region’s coastal bays. 

For questions or sponsorship op-
portunity inquiries, email 
mcbp@mdcoastalbays.org or 
info@midatlanticocean.org.

 
TOWN OF BERLIN 

REQUEST FOR   
PROPOSALS 

RFP # 2024 – 01 
Heron Park Building Demolition 

 
 Due Date: Wednesday, January 3, 

2024 
Time: 3:00 PM EST 

 
The Town of Berlin is seeking Pro-

posals for building demolition of des-
ignated areas, removal of debris on 
the interior, and site clearing of des-
ignated areas.  Work also includes 
closing up of existing openings in 
buildings to remain and 
flashing/sealing the edges of roof 
lines exposed after demolition, and 
all other work as described in the 
plans and specifications entitled 
Heron Park Building Demolition, 
prepared by Davis, Bowen, & Friedel 
Inc, dated November 2023. There is 
a mandatory Pre-Bid Meeting sched-
uled for Wednesday, December 13, 
2023, at 11:00 AM. Qualified con-
tractors are encouraged to visit the 
Town of Berlin website at 
berlinmd.gov/government/request-
for-proposals/ or contact Town Ad-
ministrator Mary Bohlen at 
4 1 0 - 6 4 1 -
4314/mbohlen@berlinmd.gov for the 
official RFP.  EEO. 

OCD-11/30/2t _________________________________ 

Town of Berlin 
Public Notice



Coastal Hospice offers grief 
support for loss of loved one

(Nov. 30, 2023) Coastal Hospice 
now offers grief support to family and 
friends of loved ones who have lost 
their lives due to overdoses. 

A news release said the free pro-
gram focuses on providing grief sup-
port and resources to people in the 
four counties the organization serves, 
regardless of whether they are di-
rectly supported by Coastal Hospice.  

“With this program, families from 
the four counties we serve will be able 
to receive specialized grief support 
for the loss of a loved one related to 
an overdose death,” Program Coordi-
nator Alvin Harmon said in the re-
lease. “When a death of this nature 
happens in a family, it is often sud-
den, traumatic, and can be sur-
rounded by stigma for survivors. Our 
goal is to provide them with a safe 
space to process these losses and 
offer them resources to help them de-
velop coping skills to deal with grief.” 
Coastal Hospice Bereavement Coun-
selors are available to provide: 

• Up to three sessions of private 
grief counseling  

• Grief support groups  
• Information about ongoing sup-

port and resources  
• Referrals to treatment, recovery, 

and/or harm reduction resources  
• Referrals to long-term peer-

based, local grief support  
• Follow up with the family to co-

ordinate support and resources 
• Compassion, fatigue and sensi-

tivity training 
• Mental health provider educa-

tion.
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Be ‘Santa to a Senior’ and 
bring joy this holiday season 

(Nov. 30, 2023) The Ocean Pines 
Recreation and Parks Department is 
participating once again in the coun-
tywide “Be a Santa to a Senior” pro-
gram, organized by Home Instead.   

Recreation and Parks Director 
Debbie Donahue said in a news re-
lease that the program helps brighten 
the hearts of seniors in the commu-
nity by giving thoughtful gifts they 
might not otherwise receive.  

In Ocean Pines, ornaments with 
the names of local seniors are placed 
on a Christmas tree in the Commu-
nity Center lobby. Each ornament in-
cludes a list of requested items for 
each senior.   

Crystal Heiser, who coordinates 
the program, said last year nearly 
900 local seniors received gifts 

through the program, with almost 
200 coming from the Ocean Pines 
community.  

“This cause is important because 
these seniors are asking for essentials 
– not for what they want,” she said in 
the release. “That said, most of the 
‘Santas’ that take a tag will tuck in a 
special treat or item that wasn’t asked 
for to make the giving more per-
sonal.”  

Anyone interested in participating 
in the program can stop by, pick up 
an ornament, buy the requested 
items, wrap them, and bring them 
back to the community center by Dec. 
6. Home Instead will do the rest.  

For more information, email 
Heiser at crystal.heiser@homein-
stead.com. 

A tree with wish list 
items for seniors 
stands outside the 
East Room in the 
Ocean Pines 
Community Center. 
The Pines rec and 
parks department 
is once again 
hosting a “Be a 
Santa to a Senior” 
program that hooks 
donors up with 
senior citizens to 
provide Christmas 
gifts. 
SUBMITTED PHOTO/ 
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From 

grass 

roots to  

tree tops,  

we have  

all of your  

tree and  

landscaping 

needs  

covered.

302-337-3346

Serving Maryland and Delaware  
for over 35 years

Extreme Winter Deal 
15% OFF 

Jobs Contracted And Completed 
Between Now & March 31 
Now Includes Hardscaping 

Some exclusions apply. 
Expires March 31, 2024

e Cl



Pine Tones Chorus Christmas concert Dec. 8
(Nov. 30, 2023) Members of the 

Pine Tones Chorus will hold their an-
nual Christmas concert at 7:30 p.m., 
Dec. 8, at the Atlantic United 
Methodist Church in Ocean City on 
Baltimore Ave. and Fourth Street.    

The concert, “A Very Jazzy Christ-
mas,” will feature “spirited and syn-
copated selections as well as some 

with dream-like harmonies,” accord-
ing to a news release.s 

“My favorite song is our arrange-
ment of ‘It Came Upon the Midnight 
Clear’ with its jazzy, spirited sound,” 
Chorus President, Dave Holloway 
said in the release. 

Other songs set to be performed 
include “Perfect Christmas Night” 

from the movie “How the Grinch 
Stole Christmas,”  and a “rollicking 
version” of “Joy to the World.”  

From “A Charlie Brown Christ-
mas” comes the song “Christmas 
Time is Here,” a well-known popular 
theme.  Other songs reflecting mel-
low, contemporary harmonies will in-
clude “White Christmas” and “I’ll be 
Home for Christmas.”   

The Pine Tones Chorus is made up 
of about 50 singers from Ocean 
Pines, Ocean City, and nearby areas. 
The chorus is under the direction of 
Jenny and Pete Anderson. Guest mu-

sicians will accompany the chorus 
with Tom Baione playing string bass 
and Frank Pasqualino adding percus-
sion. 

Admission is free and an offering 
will be received. After the concert, 
guests may enjoy refreshments in the 
church social hall.   

The Pine Tones Chorus has been 
entertaining local audiences in the 
Ocean Pines and Ocean City areas 
since 1984.  

For more information, call Hol-
loway at 410-641-5672, or Jenny An-
derson at 443-655-5636.
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Members of the Pine Tones Chorus pose during their Christmas concert last year. 
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MS in Cybersecurity  
Engineering Technology

Cyber Warrior  
Diversity Program

The 34-credit program is offered completely 

online with courses in the fall, spring and 
summer terms. 
 
The program focuses on: 
 

• Network Security 

• Mobile Wireless Networking & Security 
• System Integrity and Cybersecurity 
• Cybersecurity Administration 

This program offers Comp TIA certificates 
and is FREE.  The training takes place on our 

campus inPrincess Anne, MD 
 

The certificates offered are: 
 
• CompTIA A+ 
• Comp TIA Network + 

• Comp TIA Security + 

FIND OUT MORE ON OUR WEBSITE: WWW.UMES.EDU/CSET

FOR MORE INFORMATION PLEASE CONTACT: 
Mrs. Jennifer Whittington, Academic Support Coordinator 

410-651-8593 / Jakenney@UMES.edu 

CYBERSECURITY 
PROGRAMS 

AT THE 
UNIVERSITY OF MARYLAND 

EASTERN SHORE



(Nov. 30, 2023) As part of Worces-
ter County Public Schools’ celebra-
tion of National Farm to School 
Month, students at Buckingham Ele-
mentary School recently met a local 
farmer, received nutrition lessons 
and sampled fresh kale from Cross 
Farms. 

In 2010, Congress declared Octo-
ber National Farm to School Month 
in recognition of the role farm-to-
school plays in promoting well-being 
among children and building strong 
local economies. According to a news 
release, the program helps cultivate 
the connection communities have 
with fresh, healthy food and local 
food producers.  

The release said it is important for 
students to have a greater under-
standing of where their food comes 
from and how agriculture has an im-
pact on their health. Farm-to-school 
empowers children and their families 
to make informed food choices, which 
leads to a healthier community.  

As part of the celebration, Buck-
ingham Elementary School welcomed 
Supplemental Nutrition Assistance 
Program Education Educator Caitlin 
Daw and local farmer Carol Cross to 
school last week to provide lessons in 
nutrition and host a school-wide taste 

test of local produce.  
The release said Daw told the stu-

dents the importance of making 
healthy meal choices to build a 
healthy lifestyle that can last through 
their entire lives. Using tools like the 
U.S. Department of Agriculture’s My-
Plate, students learn how balanced 
meals can keep their bodies fit and 
ready for activity such as sports and 
play.  

Cross, who owns and operates 
Cross Farms in Berlin, brought kale 
from her farm to provide a school-
wide taste test of a sweet potato and 
kale salad. Worcester County Public 
Schools recently incorporated Cross 
Farms’ naturally grown produce into 
school breakfasts and lunches. The 
collaboration helps students gain ac-
cess to healthy foods and also 
strengthens the local economy.  

“Giving students the opportunity 
to taste nutritious foods in school at 
an early age is vital to establishing a 
lifelong commitment to a healthy 
lifestyle,” Coordinator of Food Serv-
ice Odtis Collins said in the release. 
“We’re grateful to both Cross Farms 
and the SNAP-Ed program for en-
abling us to bring such a wonderful 
experience to the children of Buck-
ingham Elementary.” 
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DNR Police hosting toys for 
tots drive Dec. 2 in Berlin

(Nov. 30, 2023) The Maryland De-
partment of Natural Resources Police 
is conducting its annual Boatload of 
Toys drive at several locations in the 
coming weeks, including one in 
Berlin. 

Locally, the drive, which is part of 
the national United States Marine 
Corps Toys for Tots initiative, will be 
set up for collection of new, un-
opened toys for children in need from 
10 a.m. to 4 p.m., Dec. 2, at the Berlin 
Walmart on Ocean Gateway. 

According to a news release, mem-
bers of the police volunteer reserve 

officer program and staff will collect 
the toys at drop-off locations in each 
region of the state — southern, east-
ern, central, and western.  

New additions to the program this 
year include an increase in donation 
drop off points and a partnership 
with Amazon, which is offering Mary-
landers the opportunity to donate 
toys online through a Toys for Tots 
Registry hosted on Amazon’s plat-
form. Donations can be added to an 
Amazon cart, choosing the “NRP 
Safety Education Unit” gift registry 
address listed.

Buckingham Farm to School month event

SUBMITTED PHOTO/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 
Pictured, from left, are local farmer Carol Cross from Cross Cross Farms in Berlin and Assistance 
Program Education Educator Caitlin Daw addressing Buckingham Elementary School students 
about nutrition and healthy lifestyles on Oct. 18 in recognition of National Farm to School Month.
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with other offers or specials.
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Coupons cannot be combined 
with other offers or specials.

COUPON GOOD FOR ONLY 1 PERSON. 
Coupons cannot be combined 
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COUPON GOOD FOR ONLY 1 PERSON. 
Coupons cannot be combined 
with other offers or specials.
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Snapshots

PHOTO COURTESY DAVIS J. LANDIS SR. 

RED KETTLE AWARD 
The Salvation Army kicked off its 2023 Red Kettle Campaign in the Civic Center in Salisbury on 
Nov. 8 with the organization’s annual breakfast and 2022 award presentations. The Kiwanis Club 
of Ocean Pines-Ocean City and the club-sponsored Key Club at Stephen Decatur High School both 
received awards for first place in the Bell Ringer Civic Group. Pictured, from left, holding the awards 
are Kiwanians Tom Southwell, Diane Denk, Diane Sparzak and David J. Landis Sr.

SUBMITTED PHOTO/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 

BEACH RESPITE DONATION 
Members of the Eastern Shore Association of Golf Course Superintendents recently donated 
$11,000 to the Believe In Tomorrow beach respite program on the Eastern Shore. Pictured with 
the check are John Bartlett and Joe Perry with the golf association and Mary Decker Brown and 
Amanda Koontz from Believe In Tomorrow.

SUBMITTED PHOTO/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 

TRIP TO PARSONS 
Worcester Prep kindergartners recently took a field trip to Parsons Farms in Dagsboro, 
Delaware. The students rode the tractor to the pumpkin fields and picked their own 
pumpkins to take home, learned about different crops grown at the farm and the 
lifecycle of pumpkins, visited with the animals, and played games. Pictured, 
kindergartners Will Rafinski, Carter Grahn and Barney Hall ride the tractor out to the 
pumpkin fields.

HONOR SOCIETY 
The Charles R. Jenkins Chapter 
of the National Honor Society 
at Worcester Preparatory 
School recently inducted 30 
new members. Pictured are the 
inductees after the ceremony. 
They are, front row from left, 
Angeline Todorov, Frank Miller, 
Sydney Tingle, Lydia Schwartz, 
Avery Roselle, Emma Zajdel 
and Danielle Carr. Second row, 
from left, are Abigail Ament, 
Lindsay Bruner, Nazli Unal, 
Aurora Holland and Nathan 
Montague. Third row, from left, 
are Jayden Scopp, Lucas 
Nicastro, Michael DePalma, 
Owen West, Landon Schul, Ryan 
Mann, Edward Martikyan, and 
Aleksey Klimins. Back from, 
from left, are Travis Netting, 
Ryan Lenox, William Wells, 
Jackson Fernley, Allen Zhang, 
James Haley, Jack Lynch, 
Benjamin McGovern, Dillon 
Scopp and Andrew McCormick. 
SUBMITTED PHOTO/BAYSIDE GAZETTE
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Kindergartner Harper Hunt gives Fiona the 
horse a kiss during the field trip. 

SUBMITTED PHOTO/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 
Kindergartners Winslow Ross and Arden Pyne show off their 
pumpkin picks.



(Nov. 30, 20230) Ten Worcester 
County public schools are equipped 
to enhance programs and educational 
resources thanks to the Community 
Foundation of the Eastern Shore. 

According to a news release, 
schools in Somerset, Wicomico and 
Worcester counties have been 
awarded a total $116,144 through the 
foundation’s education grants pro-
gram. 

The grants are issued annually to 
schools that have developed innova-
tive programs to enhance education 
and improve the social, emotional 
and physical wellbeing of students 
and communities.  

The release said a “record-break-
ing number of requests” came in this 
year for the funds, which are awarded 
in conjunction with National Educa-
tion Week through a competitive 
process to public and private schools 
on the Lower Eastern Shore of Mary-
land. The requests covered a wide va-
riety of needs at each of the county 
schools. 

A total of 40 programs within the 
counties, 10 of which are in Worces-
ter County schools, were ultimately 
chosen to receive grants. 

“The Community Foundation is 
proud to offer support to our schools, 
educators and students,” Community 
Foundation President Erica Joseph 
said in the release. “When we invest 
in education, we are building long 

term impact for the future of our local 
community and the success of our fu-
ture leaders.” 

In Worcester County, the follow-
ing schools and programs received 
grants for the 2023-24 academic 
year: 

• Ocean City Elementary will pro-
vide targeted enrichment instruction 
for Tier 1 students through literature 
text sets, improve the school’s library 
collection and increase student en-
gagement in recreational reading. 

• Stephen Decatur Middle will ex-
pand the library’s nonfiction re-
sources and build a collection of 
books written in Spanish. 

• Showell Elementary will install a 
book vending machine to promote 
excitement about reading and buy 
iPads and Lego education kits to en-
hance the school’s makerspace. 

• Berlin Intermediate will stock the 
school’s house store with incentive 
items for their positive behavior pro-
gram.  

• Cedar Chapel Special School will 
purchase adaptive tricycles for stu-
dents with diverse abilities and use a 
curriculum that teaches students 
with diverse abilities about bound-
aries and self-awareness. 

• Snow Hill Elementary will ex-
pand the school library’s picture book 
and chapter book selections to en-
gage readers. 

• Snow Hill High School will boost 

the school’s positive behavior pro-
gram with rewards and incentives 
and host a Friday Night Book Club 
that allows students to select titles 
from current and engaging themes.  

• Snow Hill Middle’s RISE and 
program will allow at-risk students to 
practice life skills and social etiquette 
in real-world social settings. The 
school’s Pathways to Resilience ini-
tiative will fortify the library’s Social-

Emotional Learning resources. 
• Pocomoke Elementary School 

will install a book vending machine to 
promote excitement about reading 
and create a diverse outdoor class-
room space for art, music, physical 
education, and STEM lessons.  

• Pocomoke High School will part-
ner with Cedar Chapel Special School 
to bring awareness and acceptance of 
those with special needs. 
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Local public schools get foundation grants

Josh Alton celebration and 
toy collection set for Dec 16

(Nov. 30, 2023) The Ocean Pines 
Yacht Club will host a Christmas 
event this year in honor of 18-year-
old Ocean Pines resident Josh Alton, 
who passed away of cancer last De-
cember. 

The Celebration for Josh is set for 
5 p.m., Dec. 16, at the yacht club.  

The event will feature a DJ playing 
Christmas songs, hot chocolate and 
cookies, and Santa riding in on a fire 
truck.  

Organizers will also be collecting 
toys for local shelter Diakonia. 

Anyone who would like to donate 
cookies to the event is asked to con-
tact Colby Phillips at 
santaphilips@yahoo.com.

FILE PHOTO/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 
Ocean Pines resident Josh Alton, who passed 
away last December after battling cancer, 
accepts gifts from Santa during a Christmas-
themed event in September 2022.

PHOTO COURTESY WORCESTER COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 
Ocean City Elementary School students, staff and parents walk into school on the first day of the 
2023-24 academic year in September. The school was one of ten countywide that recently received 
grants from the Community Foundation of the Eastern Shore for a variety of programs and 
resources. 

INJURED ON THE JOB, IN A MOTOR VEHICLE 
ACCIDENT, OR AS A PEDESTRIAN?

WORKERS COMPENSATION, INJURIES, AUTO ACCIDENTS, 
PEDESTRIAN ACCIDENTS.

LAW OFFICES OF JOHN P. ZANELOTTI, P.C. 
11022 Nicholas Lane #2 • Ocean Pines, MD 21811 

johnzlaw.com • (410) 975-4441

John P. Zanelotti, Esquire

Experienced and 
Aggressive Representation 
with 35 years in practice.

Free Office consultations 
in the Eastern Shore and 

Maryland Metro area.

Now Is The Time 
To Get Your Affairs In Order

wills • powers of attorney  health care directives



Page 14 Bayside Gazette November 30, 2023

Please send all letters and other editorial submissions to  
editor@baysidegazette.com by 5 p.m. Monday.Opinion

EDITOR ............................................ Stewart Dobson 

MANAGING EDITOR ............................ Mallory Panuska 

STAFF WRITERS ..................Cindy Hoffman, Hunter Hine 

ACCOUNT MANAGERS.......... Mary Cooper, Vicki Shrier 

..................................................................Renée Kelly 

CLASSIFIEDS/LEGALS MANAGER ............ Taylor Sloan 

PAPER COMPOSITION/PAGE DESIGN ...... Susan Parks 

GRAPHIC ARTISTS ............ Kelly Brown, Jane Leibowitz  

PUBLISHER........................................ Christine Brown 

ADMINISTRATIVE ASSISTANT ...................... Gini Tufts

The Bayside Gazette is published weekly by FLAG Publications, Inc. 
11934 Ocean Gateway, Suite 6, Ocean City, Md. 21842.  

The Bayside Gazette is available by subscription at $75/year or $40/6 mos.  
Visit us on the Web at www.baysideoc.com.

11934 Ocean Gateway, Suite 6, Ocean City, Md. 21842 
Phone: 410-723-6397 / Fax: 410-723-6511. 

Copyright 2023

Ocean Pines Police are reminding home-
owners and residents that the holiday sea-
son is often a time when online scammers 
are especially active. Because of that, it’s 
important to use caution, check your bank 
balances regularly, and only shop on 
trusted websites when possible.  

Ocean Pines Police Chief Tim Robinson 
offered the following safety tips for online 
holiday shopping: 

• Always know where you’re shop-
ping online. Major sites like Amazon.com 
and Walmart.com offer shoppers an extra 
layer of security, but some scam sites try 
and mimic the appearance of trusted sites. 
Check your browser and make sure the 
URL (such as www.amazon.com) matches 
up. 

• Monitor your bank account and 
regularly verify your credit card 
statements. If fraudulent charges appear 
or you think your account has been com-
promised, contact your financial institution 
right away.  

• Change any passwords regularly. 
Resetting your password is often as easy as 
sending an email. Also, avoid common or 
easily guessed passwords. 

• Beware of unsolicited emails. Es-

pecially this time of year, people will get 
emails from companies pretending to be 
Amazon and saying a payment has been 
declined and needs to be verified. Never 
send credit card or bank information by 
email, and always make sure the sender’s 
email address matches the site they claim 
to be from.  

When scheduling package deliveries, 
Robinson recommends doing so on days 
when you’ll be at home. If possible, request 
a signature upon delivery.  

“If you won’t be at home, a lot of places 
will allow you to make a schedule modifica-
tion like to a neighbor’s house,” Robinson 
said. “Many companies, like Amazon, will 
also give you notices if you sign up that tell 
shoppers when their packages are in tran-
sit, and even send notifications upon deliv-
ery.” 

Robinson said residents should also re-
port suspicious activity around the neigh-
borhood. 

“If you see a stranger going up on other 
people’s porches, call the police depart-
ment, we’ll come check it out,” he said.  

Report any potentially fraudulent activ-
ity to Ocean Pines Police by calling 410-
641-7747.

OCEAN PINES ASSOCIATION REPORT

Beware of holiday scammers
A message from the Ocean Pines Police Department

(Nov. 30, 2023) Ocean 
Pines Public Works is lead-
ing an effort to make the 
community merry and 
bright this holiday season.    

General Manager John 
Viola said in a news release 
that spending was increased 
for holiday decorations this 
year, thanks to a reallocation 
and repurposing of budget 
funds.    

The effort includes about 
25,000 lights, seven large 
and illuminated Christmas 
trees, and live trees at both 
the north and south gates.   

Public Works also put in 

more than 50 live trees at 
White Horse Park, ahead of 
the annual Hometown 
Christmas tree lighting.    

The release said the com-
munity response to the in-
crease in decorations has 
been overwhelmingly posi-
tive.    

“I’m just so impressed with 
the decorations and the whole 
place,” resident Peggy Sedor 
said. “I rode through yester-
day and I said, ‘this is the best 
place in the world to live!’ It’s 
just beautiful and the decora-
tions are just exquisite. Every-
body is saying it.”  

Public Works Director 
Eddie Wells credited Tony 
Howard and his team for 
putting up decorations 
around the community.    

“Tony is a valued em-
ployee, and he has a great 
eye for landscaping and dec-
orating,” Wells said in the 
release. “He and his crew 
have done an awesome job 
with everything so far, and 
there’s more to come over 
the next several weeks.”   

Viola said roughly double 
the holiday decorations are 
going up this year.    

“We are getting many, 
many positive comments 
about all the new decora-
tions, and it’s a credit to 
Public Works,” he said. “We 
hope everyone in the Ocean 
Pines community enjoys all 
the new displays, and we 
hope everyone has a very 
merry Christmas and holi-
day.”  

OP doubles up holiday decorations
Residents enjoy extra 
lights and seasonal 
decor in community

We invite you to share your opinion, but all letters are subject to verification, so please 
include your name and phone number. All letters are subject to editing for space and to 
protect the author and this newspaper from legal action. Email letters to 
editor@baysidegazette.com. For questions, call 410-723-6397.

For many people, it often seems that no matter who con-
ducts a government pay study, the findings will show that the 
pay scales aren’t what they should be. Almost as frequently, 
the researchers conclude that the pay plan should be restruc-
tured. 

Skeptics might opine that the first conclusion arises out 
of the research firm’s desire to produce something to justify 
its efforts, or because it employed a formula out of sync with 
the local economic circumstances.  

But no, that isn’t it at all. The reason is that the consulting 
company found what the customer, in this case the Town of 
Berlin, already knew: that its wage scale was off as compared 
to similar government and private enterprise operations. 

What the mayor and council needed from their consultant, 
PayPoint HR, was independently produced evidence to bol-
ster their argument that something needs to be done. In 
other words, contracting for a pay study follows the trial 
lawyer’s rule of never asking a question in court without 
knowing in advance what the answer is going to be. 

Because the difficulty in raising wages for government em-
ployees is not about what government can afford, but what 
the taxpaying public is willing to afford, pay studies are used 
to convince the public they need to afford these changes if 
they wish to continue to maintain the level of service they 
now enjoy. This isn’t a criticism, it’s an unpleasant fact in the 
relationship between local governments and their con-
stituents. 

As for the second of the pay study’s two findings — that 
the compensation plan needs to be restructured — that just 
makes sense. The matter of who gets paid what can become 
less orderly over time and both the public and the employees 
need a better idea of where things stand. 

In business, pay disparities are easier to deal with, provid-
ing the money’s there. In government, not so much. Taking 
care of the public’s money and public employees at the same 
time can get complicated. Pay studies help by taking some of 
the pressure off the decision-makers.

Pay studies find what 
officials already knew
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Sen. Carozza participates in 
national leadership forum

(Nov. 30, 2023) Sen. Mary Beth 
Carozza (R-38) recently participated 
in the National Conference of State 
Legislatures Emerging Leaders 
Forum in Philadelphia.  

According to a news release, she 
was tapped by Sen. Pres. Bill Fergu-
son to participate in the leadership 
event along with Sen. Alonzo Wash-
ington (D-22) and Del. Tom Hutchin-
son (R-37B). 

“This leadership conference has 
been a tremendous opportunity to 
meet colleagues from across the 
country and discuss creative ways to 
communicate, persuade, and solve 
the many challenges we each face in 
our individual districts and states,” 
Carozza said in the release. 

She added that she appreciated the 

perspective of former 
state legislators who 
have held top leader-
ship positions. A 
highlight was hearing 
about the lessons of 
the Founding Fathers 
at the  Museum of the 
American Revolution. 

The conference is a 
nonpartisan public officials’ associa-
tion composed of current state legis-
lators from all 50 states, territories 
and commonwealths of the United 
States. The group’s mission is to ad-
vance the effectiveness, independ-
ence and integrity of legislatures and 
to foster interstate cooperation by fa-
cilitating the exchange of informa-
tion.

Hardwire in Pocomoke City 
earns economic dev. award 

(Nov. 30, 2023) Members of the 
Rural Maryland Council recently an-
nounced that Hardwire, a manufac-
turing organization in Worcester 
County, was selected to receive the 
Outstanding Rural Economic Devel-
opment Award at the 2023 Maryland 
Rural Impact Awards. 

According to a news release, the 
awards, hosted by the Rural Mary-
land Council, recognize individuals 
and organizations that have made 
noteworthy contributions to commu-
nities throughout rural Maryland. 
The awards ceremony was 
held Nov.13, at the Crowne Plaza 
Hotel in Annapolis. 

Hardwire, a HUBZone Small Busi-
ness based in Pocomoke City, special-
izes in protective armor systems for 

military, law enforcement and civil-
ian applications. The company has 
created a number of jobs and signifi-
cantly impacted economic develop-
ment through innovative and creative 
solutions, according to the release. 

The release added that the com-
pany’s commitment to a life-saving 
mission, demonstrated by the devel-
opment of protective armor systems, 
caught “the attention and admira-
tion” of members of the Rural Mary-
land Council.  

Hardwire CEO George Tunis ex-
pressed his gratitude for the award 
and recognition in the release. 

“We are honored to receive the 
2023 Maryland Rural Impact Award 
for Outstanding Rural Economic De-

Frontier Town recognized at 
hospitality conference expo

(Nov. 30, 2023) Blue Water De-
velopment recently announced that 
Sun Outdoors Frontier Town off of 
Route 611 in Berlin has earned a 
Mega Park of the Year Award at the 
2023 Outdoor Hospitality Confer-
ence & Expo in Kansas City. 

According to a news release, the 
award is a testament to Frontier 
Town’s “dedication to providing an 
exceptional outdoor hospitality ex-
perience to its guests.” 

The release said the Western-
themed park, founded in 1959, has 
been a destination for outdoor en-
thusiasts, campers and nature lovers 
for years.  

Visitors are treated to daily West-
ern themed shows by performers 
from throughout the country.  

Along with the performances and 
reenactments, the park offers a 
ropes and zip line courses, as well as 
camping. The campground features 
a recently renovated mini-golf 
course, full-service ice cream parlor, 
an oversized arcade, restaurants, 
stores, boat docks and piers, jet ski 

rentals, daily activities, nature trails, 
charter boast fishing, a dog park and 
more. 

“We are thrilled to receive the 
Mega Park of the Year Award at 
OHCE2023,” Frontier Ton General 
Manager Nicole Burrell said in the 
release. “This recognition recognizes 
our dedication to delivering memo-
rable outdoor experiences that ex-
ceed our guests’ expectations. Our 
gratitude goes out to our incredible 
staff, our loyal guests, and everyone 
who has contributed to Sun Out-
doors Frontier Town’s outstanding 
reputation.” 

The awards ceremony took place 
on Nov. 8 in Kansas City, Missouri, 
where Blue Water Development was 
presented the award in front of an 
audience of industry leaders, and fel-
low park operators.  

The award was presented by Out-
door Hospitality Industry, formerly 
known as the National Association 
of RV Parks and Campgrounds. The 
release said the award acknowledges 
Blue Water Development’s continu-
ous efforts to enhance park facilities 
and amenities. 

For more information about Sun 
Outdoors Frontier Town, or to plan 
a trip, visit the park’s site online. 

Western-themed park earns 
high honor at event held in 
Kansas City in early Nov.

Mary Beth 
Carozza

See COMPANY Page 17
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Reprint from Dec. 8, 2022 
Recently I started my 15th year in 

teaching. Four years at Worcester 
Technical High 
School was fol-
lowed by 10 
years at Wor-
Wic.  

Now, I find 
myself on the 
beautiful cam-
pus of Univer-
sity of 
Maryland East-
ern Shore. It 
has been quite a 
journey, but I 

have enjoyed every step of it. Well, 
most of it, but that’s for a different 
day. 

One of my favorite stories as a culi-
nary educator goes way back to my 
first year at the high school. The kids 
knew everything, they were belliger-
ent and angry that they had to deal 
with the “new guy”, and instruction 
was not necessarily something that 
they were about to take from me. 

So, they floundered in the kitchen. 
I would try to correct them, and they 
would snap back in their wonderfully 
angsty way. So, I did what any self-re-
specting high school lab teacher 
would do. I gave them enough rope. 
More precisely, I broke them into 10 
groups of two, facing each other 
across stainless steel tables that I had 
strategically lined up. 

Between each pair of two students, 
there was a pan with pan spray, but-
ter, cream, eggs, sugar, cocoa powder 
and anything else they would need to 
make a simple brownie using the 
creaming method. 

Each student had a recipe with 
thorough instructions, and I calmly 
announced “you guys apparently 
know what you’re doing, so make me 
brownies. They are due in an hour 
and 15 minutes. Oh, and it’s worth a 
hundred points.” 

They all stared blankly at me as I 
sat in a chair and reminded them of 
the time restraint. And then it hap-
pened. One kid, who obviously did 
not take the time to read the recipe, 
unwrapped the pound of butter and 
placed it in the pan. Then he poured 
cream on top. Now, no one was 
laughing, as they were taking this 
challenge quite seriously. One by one, 
each group mimicked the actions of 
the first and poured the cream on the 
butter. 

Then came the sugar, and the first 
group was banging on the butter with 
their spoons to get it to mix. Suffice it 
to say, by the time the eggs, sugar, 

cocoa powder et al had been added 
(incorrectly I might add), it was 
painfully obvious to the students that 
they perhaps should listen to the new 
guy. I waited for them patiently, and 
at last a young lady from Snow Hill 
announced, “We give up, Chef. What 
are we supposed to do?” 

And that was the beginning of an 
incredibly productive year for all of 
us. Did I process-shame them? Yes, I 
did. Were they better for it? Yes, they 
were. Was I able to teach them some 
invaluable skills that semester? Ab-
solutely. 

All they had to do was cream the 
butter and sugar together first. If they 
had done that, meaning that if they 
had read the recipe and followed in-
structions, they would have had a 
much easier time achieving their goals. 

The creaming method is the basic 
start for muffin batters, and in this 
case coffee cake batters. It is a rather 
sophisticated method, so pay atten-
tion and let me know if I need to back 
up and explain it further. 

Step one is to soften the butter and 
place it in a stand mixer, or a bowl 
with a hand mixer. It doesn’t really 
matter which one. Next you add the 
sugar, and then you mix it until it is 
what? You got it! Creamy. As butter 

is a water and fat emulsion, the sugar 
and butter mix and the sugar eventu-
ally dissolves in the water in the but-
ter and the homogenized mixture is 
smooth and creamy. And then you 
add the other ingredients and Bob’s 
your uncle. 

Ah, the halcyon years of instruct-
ing. I can only hope that they con-
tinue to be as entertaining as they 
have always been. 

And now that you have this 
process burnt into your brain, you 
may want to try this cake for your 
holiday guests and friends. It is the 
season for entertaining, after all. 

Coffeecake 
makes 1 tube cake 
1 1/2 Tbsp. AP Flour 
1 Tbsp. Ground cinnamon 
6 oz. Brown sugar 
4 oz. Pecans, chopped 
1 oz. Butter, melted 
4 oz. Butter, softened 
8 oz. Granulated sugar 
2 large eggs 
8 oz. Sour cream 
7 oz. Cake flour, sifted2 
1/4 Tsp. Salt 
1 tsp. Baking powder 
1 tsp. Baking soda 

1 tsp. Vanilla extract 
Blend the first five ingredients to-

gether in a bowl and set aside while 
you make your batter. 

For the batter, cream the butter 
and sugar together until they are … 
yes, creamy. 

Add the eggs one at a time while 
incorporating well. 

Add sour cream and beat until 
smooth. 

Add the flour, salt, baking powder, 
baking soda and vanilla and mix well. 

Spoon half of the batter into a 
greased tube pan. Top with half of the 
filling that you set aside earlier. 

Put remaining batter in the pan, 
and top with the remaining filling. 

Bake at 350F for about 35 min-
utes, or until a toothpick comes out 
clean. 

From On Baking 3rd edition by 
Sarah R. Labensky. 

If you don’t have cake flour, add a 
Tbsp. of cornstarch to each cup of AP 
flour. This increases the starch con-
tent and decreases the protein con-
tent, thus making it more suitable for 
tender cakes

Paul Suplee is the owner of Box-
car40 in Pittsville and senior lec-

turer of culinary arts at UMES.

By Paul Suplee,  
MBA, CEC, PC-3

Cuisine
Creaming integral part of coffeecake mix 



JOE WILFORD 
Long Neck 

Mr. Joe Wilford, of Long Neck, 
passed away peacefully at home on 
Thanksgiving Day with the love of his 
life, Liz Lindsey, present.   

Joe was born to Roger Ferdinand 
Berte Leon Dequick in Brussels, Bel-
gium, on June 3, 1935. After serving 
one year in the Belgian Air Force as a 
driver, Joe studied music at the Royal 
Academy of Music in Brussels and 
took private guitar lessons from his 
mentor, Jo VanWetter.  

Upon graduation in 1955, he 
signed onto a radio station and did 
recordings and live performances, in-
cluding live shows with Marlene Di-
etrich and Edith Piaf. Joe played lead 
jazz guitar in Belgium, Germany, 
Switzerland, Luxembourg and a year 

in Jordan from 1965 until 1966, 
where he played in various venues in-
cluding King Hussein’s Palace with a 
band from Spain.   

After Joe left the Middle East, he 
lived in England for a few months, 
then moved to Washington D.C., at 
which time he married and had one 
child, Nancy Wilford-Abramson.  

While Joe was in Washington, he 
opened his own restaurant and 
lounge called the BOCA JO and en-
tertained audiences from all over the 
world. He also played at the Shore-
ham Hotel for dozens of well-known 
artists, including Tony Bennett, 
Peggy Lee, Toots Thielmans, Gladys 
Knight, Petula Clark, Johnny Mathis, 
George Benson, Dionne Warwick and 
many others. Joe also had the occa-
sion to play for Billy Eckstine at the 
Playboy Cub in Baltimore, and 
claimed Billy had the best singing 
voice in the business.  

Music was Joe’s whole life and he 
played with many local jazz combos, 
big bands, orchestras, live TV, coun-
try, and rock and roll: but jazz was 
king in Joe’s musical world. He 
deeply admired guitarist Jim Hall 
from New York and had occasion to 
meet with Jim at his home.  

Joe was beloved by many people 
because he was the epitome of class 
and European style, generosity and 

genuine friendship. He also had a 
great sense of humor and enjoyed 
many happy times with people from 
everywhere. Most of all, he loved his 
partner of over 30 years, Liz Lindsey, 
his beloved home in Long Neck and 
his kitty cats.   

He leaves behind a sister-in-law 
Maureen Cloutier; stepdaughter 
Frances Cordell, her husband Gregg 
and their daughter Mary Cordell and 
Joe’s son-in-law, John Abramson.  
Joe was predeceased by his mother 
and father Germaine and Omer De-
quick of Brussels, Belgium. Any do-
nations should be directed toward 
your favorite animal rescue. 

A celebration will be announced at 
a future date.    

Arrangements are in the care of 
Eastern Shore Cremation and Fu-
neral Service, 504 Franklin Ave., in 
Berlin. To send condolences to the 
family, visit 
easternshorecremation.com. 

 
MELODY ANN JOHNSON 
Berlin 

Melody Ann Johnson, 70, passed 
peacefully into the hands of God on 
Sunday, Nov. 26, 2023, at Tidal 
Health in Salisbury. 

Melody was predeceased by her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Edward John-
son Sr.; and her brother, Edward 

Johnson Jr.  
She is survived by her brother, 

Patrick L. Johnson and his wife Car-
olyn T. Johnson; a niece, Genevieve 
Lee Johnson; sister-in-law Teresa 
Quillen Johnson; a niece, Amy J. 
Holloway; and her step-granddaugh-
ter Brittany L. Carey; along with her 
stepson and wife, Stacey and Karen 
Carey. 

Melody was a graduate of Stephen 
Decatur High School, class of 1971, 
and Frostburg State College class of 
1975. Her great loves in life were her 
family, the Stevenson United 
Methodist Church, hunting and fish-
ing, serving the Girl Scouts of the 
Chesapeake Bay, serving as a mem-
ber of the Boggs Disharoon American 
Legion Ladies Auxiliary Post 123 in 
Berlin, along with numerous commu-
nity activities involving veterans and 
assisting the elderly. 

Arrangements are in the care of 
Eastern Shore Cremation and Fu-
neral Service. Memorial donations 
can be made to the Boggs Disharoon 
American Legion Ladies Auxiliary, 
Boggs Disharoon Unit #123, P.O. Box 
412, Berlin, Maryland 21811 or to the 
Stevenson United Methodist Church 
Spirit Kitchen, 123 North Main 
Street, Berlin, Md 21811. 

A celebration of her life will be 
held at a later time.
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velopment,” he said. “This recogni-
tion is a testament to the hard work, 
dedication, and innovative spirit of 
the entire Hardwire team. At Hard-
wire, we believe in the transformative 
power of technology, collaboration, 
and community support. This award 
is a reflection of our commitment to 
not only creating jobs and driving 
economic development but also mak-
ing a meaningful impact on the well-
being of our community.” 

Supporters of Hardwire’s nomina-
tion include Sen. Mary Beth Carozza 
(R-38), Worcester Commissioner 
Caryn Abbott, Worcester County 
Workforce Development Specialist 
Nancy Schwendeman, and Melanie 
Pursel, the director of Worcester 
County Tourism and Economic De-
velopment. 

Hardwire also actively engages 
with local businesses, supports edu-
cation initiatives, and has played 
helped address challenges posed by 
the pandemic by producing over 
three million face shields and provid-
ing jobs to over 100 Marylanders, the 
release said. The company also do-
nated more than 1,700 Emergency 
Response Shields to schools in 
Worcester, Wicomico and Somerset 
counties for active shooter protec-
tion.

Continued from Page 15

Company stands 
out in rural Md.

Obituaries

Joe Wilford

$1,595.



Page 18 Bayside Gazette November 30, 2023

RACETRACK AUTO SALES 

410-352-5070

For Like New & Used Cars & Trucks
WE PAY CASH!

beer • wine • lottery • ProPane refillsbeer • wine • lottery • ProPane refills

11740 Worcester Hwy. Showell, MD 21862 • 410-352-5070 
(Located on Rt. 113 - 1 min. North of Racetrack Road) 

TAG & TITLE 
SERVICE

No Appointment Neccessary 
 Mon-Sat 8am - 4:45pm

No  
Wait

Walk 
In

NEW TRAILERS FOR SALE / MAINE TAGS AVAILABLE 

auto detailing available

“The Place That Does It All”

PREVIOUSLY OWNED VEHICLES FOR SALE
MD STATE INSPECTED BUY HERE  PAY HERE

‘12 hyundai accent • ‘17 honda crv lx • ‘14 chrysler town & country van

HARD – 62

Fill in the blank spaces  in 
the grid so that every vertical 
column, every horizontal row 
and every  3 by 3 box  contains 
the numbers  1 through 9, with-
out repeating any.  There is re-
ally only one  solution to each 
puzzle.

Answers to last 
 week’s puzzles

Puzzles
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Thurs., Nov. 30 
STORY TIME: ‘I SANG YOU DOWN FROM 
THE STARS’ 
Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 10:30 a.m. 
Celebrate Native American and Alaskan 
Native Heritage Month with this beauti-
ful story by Tasha Spillet-Sumner. Fol-
low with a fun craft. For ages 2-5 years. 
410-208-4014, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

STORY TIME ‘BIG RED BARN’ 
Worcester County Library - Snow Hill 
Branch, 307 N. Washington St., 10:30 
a.m.-1 p.m. Stories, songs and rhymes. 
For ages 2-5 years. 410-632-3495, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

CHESS CLUB 
Worcester County Library - Ocean City 
Branch, 10003 Coastal Highway, 10:30 
a.m. Come to the library and bring your 
boards. All are welcome. 410-524-1818, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

FIRESIDE CHAT 
Worcester County Library - Berlin 
Branch, 13 Harrison Ave., 3 p.m. Book 
discussion featuring books participants 
have read and want to share. Come find 
your next great read. 410-641-0650, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

ZUMBA 
Worcester County Library - Berlin 
Branch, 13 Harrison Ave., 4:30-5:30 
p.m. Join certified Zumba instruction 
Joyce Landsman for an hour of move-
ment. These classes uplift and improve 
mood. Registration required: 410-641-
0650. www.worcesterlibrary.org 

BEACH SINGLE 55 PLUS MEET AND 
GREET 
Thursdays - Harpoon Hanna’s, 39064 
Harpoon Road, Fenwick Island, DE, 4-6 
p.m. 302-436-9577, BeachSingles.org. 

Fri., Dec. 1 
FIRST FRIDAY OPENING RECEPTION & 
HOLIDAY FAIR 
Art League of Ocean City - Center for the 
Arts, 502 94th St., 5-7 p.m. Featuring 
award winning artists from the past 12 
months. Meet the artists, enjoy hors 
d’oeuvres and see the new exhibits by a 
variety of local and regional artists. 
https://artleagueofoceancity.org, 410-
524-9433 

MAHJONG CLUB 
Worcester County Library - Ocean City 
Branch, 10003 Coastal Highway, 10:30 
a.m. Enjoy a fun morning of playing tile 
Mahjong. Feel free to bring your own tile 
set. All are welcome. 410-524-1818, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

FIBER FRIENDS ANNUAL HAT SALE 
Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 12 p.m. 
Hats, headbands, scarves, cowls and 
mittens available. All are handmade 
items to benefit the Friends of the Ocean 
Pines Library. 410-208-4014, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

FLIGHT 
Worcester County Library - Pocomoke 
Branch, 301 Market St., 2 p.m. Learn 
about basic principles of flight while 
building a hovercraft and testing it in 
the wind tunnel. Experiment with film 
canister rockets and gliders. For ages 10 
years and older. 410-957-0878 

THE MAYOR’S OLD-FASHIONED  
CHRISTMAS EVENING 
Downtown Pocomoke City, 5:30-8:30 
p.m. Live music, s’mores, hot chocolate 
and cider, hot dogs, horse & carriage 
rides, ornament making, Mr. and Mrs. 
Claus and more. Tree lighting at 6 p.m. 
Nonperishables and paper products 
being collected. 410-957-1333, Ext. 111 

12 TOURNAMENTS OF CHRISTMAS 
Ocean Downs Casino, 10218 Racetrack 
Road, Berlin. Slot Tournaments: Dec. 1, 
2, 4, 6, 8, 9, 12. Blackjack Tournaments: 
Dec. 3, 5, 7, 10, 11. Benefits Toys for 
Tots. 
https://www.oceandowns.com/promo-
tions/12-tournaments-of-christmas-2/ 

Sat., Dec. 2 
40TH ANNUAL CHRISTMAS PARADE 
Proceeds along Coastal Highway from 
Old Landing Road north to 120th St., 11 
a.m. to 1 p.m. Awards and activities held 
at the Carousel after parade. 
https://oceancitymd.gov/oc/depart-
ments/special-events/christmas-pa-
rade/. 

CHRISTMAS COOKIE WALK AND CRAFTS 
Bethany United Methodist Church, 
8648 Stephen Decatur Highway, Berlin, 
8 a.m.-2 p.m. Cookies and other sweets 
sold by the pound. Christmas wreaths 
and other craft items for sale. For more 
information call 410-641-2186 or email 
Bethany 21811@gmail.com. 

2023 CHRISTMAS BAZAAR 
Stevenson United Methodist Church, 
123 N. Main St., Berlin, 10 a.m.-2 p.m. 
Vendors, bake table, vegetable beef soup 
and pulled pork sandwiches, silent auc-
tion and white elephant. 

FIBER FRIENDS ANNUAL HAT SALE 
Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 10 a.m. 
Hats, headbands, scarves, cowls and 
mittens available. All are handmade 
items to benefit the Friends of the Ocean 
Pines Library. 410-208-4014, 

www.worcesterlibrary.org 

SATURDAY WRITERS 
Worcester County Library - Berlin 
Branch, 13 Harrison Ave., 10 a.m. 
Novice and established writers gather to 
share their writing projects. Structure 
includes critiques and appreciation, 
market leads and writing exercises. 
Drop ins welcome. 410-641-0650 

CRAFTY SATURDAY: WINTER WONDERLAND 
Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 10 a.m. 
Come and make some winter-ful crafts. 
All ages welcome. 410-208-4014, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

HOLIDAY ARTISAN FAIR 
Art League of Ocean City - Center for the 
Arts, 502 94th St., 11 a.m.-4 p.m. Shop 
jewelry, ceramics, fiber art and more 
from local artists. There will be art activ-
ities, a bake sale, raffle, book signings, 
and community weaving project. 
https://artleagueofoceancity.org, 410-
524-9433 

HOLIDAY PLAY TIME 
Worcester County Library - Snow Hill 
Branch, 307 N. Washington St., 11 a.m. 
Kids, 4 years and younger, can can enjoy 
toys and activities in the children’s area, 
make a craft and complete a scavenger 
hunt for a prize. 410-632-3495, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

VICTORIAN INSPIRED EARRINGS 
Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 12-2 p.m. 
Design and make earrings using semi-
precious stones and crystals. Limit 15. 
Registration required: 410-208-4014. 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

TRIMPER RIDES CHRISTMAS CARNIVAL 
Trimper Rides of Ocean City, 700 S. At-
lantic Ave., 12-5 p.m. Vendors, indoor 
rides, 2024 Summer Pass sale, Snowball 
Brawl in Elf Land, holiday music per-
formers and life-size Trimper Land 
board game. OCDC fundraiser. 
www.trimperrides.com, 410-289-8617 

LET’S GET LIT 
Cambria Hotel Ocean City - Bayfront, 13 
Saint Louis Ave., 4-7 p.m. Seasonal local 
brews and drinks, live music, light fair 
and prizes for “Most Lit” costumes. Gen-
eral admission cost is $40. VIP packages 
available. https://www.shorecraftbeer-
fest.com/lets-get-lit.html, 443-373-4093 

FARMERS & ARTISANS MARKET 
Saturdays - White Horse Park, 239 
Ocean Parkway, 9 a.m. to noon. Shop for 
everything from fresh local produce to 
unique handmade artisan goods. Open 
to the public. 

12 TOURNAMENTS OF CHRISTMAS 
Ocean Downs Casino, 10218 Racetrack 

Road, Berlin. Slot Tournaments: Dec. 1, 
2, 4, 6, 8, 9, 12. Blackjack Tournaments: 
Dec. 3, 5, 7, 10, 11. Benefits Toys for 
Tots. 
https://www.oceandowns.com/promo-
tions/12-tournaments-of-christmas-2/ 

Sun., Dec. 3 
HOLIDAY OPEN HOUSE 
Ocean City Life-Saving Museum, 813 S. 
Atlantic Ave., 10 a.m.-5 p.m. Free ad-
mission, live music and book signing 
(11:30 a.m.), snack samplings, sand dol-
lar ornament making, artifact scavenger 
hunt and 20% off purchases in the gift 
shop. https://www.ocmuseum.org 

FROSTY FAMILY FESTIVAL 
Wicomico Civic Center, 500 Glen Ave., 
Salisbury, 12-4 p.m. Live music, craft 
vendors, holiday characters, unlimited 
access to the bounce house village and 
more. Cost is $12 for those 1 year and 
older. Tickets: www.WicomicoCivicCen-
ter.org and at the door. 

TRIMPER RIDES CHRISTMAS CARNIVAL 
Trimper Rides of Ocean City, 700 S. At-
lantic Ave., 12-5 p.m. Vendors, indoor 
rides, 2024 Summer Pass sale, Snowball 
Brawl in Elf Land, holiday music per-
formers and life-size Trimper Land 
board game. OCDC fundraiser. 
www.trimperrides.com, 410-289-8617 

MID-ATLANTIC SYMPHONY - HOLIDAY JOY 
Ocean City Performing Arts Center - 
Roland E. Powell Convention Center, 
4001 Coastal Highway, 3 p.m. Festive 
selection of holiday music. Doors open 
at 2:30 p.m. Tickets cost $55. Tickets: 
https://www.etix.com/ticket/p/3716277
4/mid-atlantic-symphony-holiday-joy-
ocean-city-oc-performing-arts-center. 

12 TOURNAMENTS OF CHRISTMAS 
Ocean Downs Casino, 10218 Racetrack 
Road, Berlin. Slot Tournaments: Dec. 1, 
2, 4, 6, 8, 9, 12. Blackjack Tournaments: 
Dec. 3, 5, 7, 10, 11. Benefits Toys for 
Tots. 
https://www.oceandowns.com/promo-
tions/12-tournaments-of-christmas-2/ 

JEHOVAH’S WITNESSES MEETING 
Sundays - Berlin Congregation of Jeho-
vah’s Witnesses, 212 West St., Berlin, 10 
a.m. www.jw.org 

Mon., Dec. 4 
STORY TIME: ‘WADDLING PENGUINS’ 
Worcester County Library - Ocean City 
Branch, 10003 Coastal Highway, 10:30 
a.m. Stories, music with movement and 
crafts about penguins. For ages 2-5 
years. 410-524-1818, www.worcesterli-
brary.org 

Continued on Page 20
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SMALL SOCIETY WORKSHOP 
Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 1:30 p.m. Build 
your business from the ground up during 
this multi-day workshop (Dec. 4 and 11). 
Recommended for ages 7 years and older. 
410-208-4014, www.worcesterlibrary.org 

GREAT BOOKS DISCUSSION 
Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 2:30 p.m. 
This group meets twice a month to dis-
cuss selections recommended by the 
Great Books Foundation. Today’s focus 
is on “Masks” by George Santayana. 410-
208-4014, www.worcesterlibrary.org 

T.O.P.S. OF BERLIN - GROUP #169 
Atlantic General Hospital, Conference 
Room 1, 9733 Healthway Drive, Berlin, 5-
6:30 p.m. Take Off Pounds Sensibly is a 
weekly support and educational group 
promoting weight loss and living a healthy 
lifestyle. Rose Campion, 410-641-0157 

12 TOURNAMENTS OF CHRISTMAS 
Ocean Downs Casino, 10218 Racetrack 
Road, Berlin. Slot Tournaments: Dec. 1, 
2, 4, 6, 8, 9, 12. Blackjack Tournaments: 
Dec. 3, 5, 7, 10, 11. Benefits Toys for Tots. 
https://www.oceandowns.com/promo-
tions/12-tournaments-of-christmas-2/ 

DELMARVA WOMEN’S A CAPELLA CHORUS 
Mondays - Ocean Pines Community Cen-
ter, 239 Ocean Parkway, 6:00-8:00 p.m. 
All ladies who love to sing invited. Mary, 
410-629-9383 or Carol, 302-242-7062. 

OVEREATER’S ANONYMOUS 
Mondays - Worcester County Library - 
Ocean Pines Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 
7-8 p.m. No dues or fees. 410-459-9100 

Tues., Dec. 5 
NOURISH & CELEBRATE: HOLIDAY  
NUTRITION WORKSHOP 
Ocean Pines Community Center, 235 
Ocean Parkway, 9-11 a.m. Learn how to 
keep your diet and nutrition in check 
during the holidays with Kathleen 
Dorsch. She will also do a healthy cook-
ing demonstration. Alyce Marzola, 410-
641-9268, amarzola@atlanticgeneral.org 

STORY TIME: ‘RABBITS’ 
Worcester County Library - Berlin 
Branch, 13 Harrison Ave., 10:30 a.m. 
Stories, songs and fingerplays. For ages 
2-5 years. 410-641-0650, www.worces-
terlibrary.org 

STORY TIME: ‘LET’S EAT’ 
Worcester County Library - Pocomoke 
Branch, 301 Market St., 10:30 a.m. Sto-
ries, songs and crafts. For ages 2-5 
years. 410-957-0878, www.worcesterli-
brary.org 

OC KNITTING GROUP 
Worcester County Library - Ocean City 
Branch, 10003 Coastal Highway, 10:30 
a.m. Bring whatever project you happen 

to be working on. 410-524-1818, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

JOINT HEALTH SEMINAR WITH  
DR. THOMAS BECK 
Berlin 50plus Center, 10129 Old Ocean 
City Blvd., 11 a.m.-12:30 p.m. Dr. Beck will 
discuss joint health, the latest in treat-
ments and surgery. Alyce Marzola, 410-
641-9268, amarzola@atlanticgeneral.org 

MASTER GARDENERS PLANT CLINIC 
Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 11 a.m. Join 
in as Master Gardener Ginny 
Rosenkranz talks about all things plants. 
Bring questions and feel free to show 
your plants as well. 410-208-4014, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

BABY TIME 
Worcester County Library - Snow Hill 
Branch, 307 N. Washington St., 11 a.m. 
Songs, rhymes and stories. Stay after to 
socialize with other families. For ages 2 
years and younger. 410-632-3495, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

ANIME CLUB 
Worcester County Library - Ocean City 
Branch, 10003 Coastal Highway, 4 p.m. 
Come celebrate your appreciation for 
anime and manga. Monthly themes will 
include trivia games, Japanese snacks 
and arts and crafts. For ages 13-16 years. 
410-524-1818, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

12 TOURNAMENTS OF CHRISTMAS 
Ocean Downs Casino, 10218 Racetrack 
Road, Berlin. Slot Tournaments: Dec. 1, 
2, 4, 6, 8, 9, 12. Blackjack Tournaments: 
Dec. 3, 5, 7, 10, 11. Benefits Toys for Tots. 
https://www.oceandowns.com/promo-
tions/12-tournaments-of-christmas-2/ 

VIRTUAL POETRY READING 
Held via Zoom, 7 p.m. Wor-Wic Com-
munity College is inviting the public to a 
free virtual poetry reading by D. Nurkse. 
Visit the events section at 
www.worwic.edu for more information. 
BEACH HEROES-OC 
Tuesdays - Volunteer beach clean-up 
group meets from 9-10 a.m., year-round. 
Trash bags, grippers and gloves pro-
vided. Check the Facebook page “Beach 
Heroes-OC” for weekly meeting loca-
tions. All are welcome. 

JEHOVAH’S WITNESSES MEETING 
Tuesdays - Berlin Congregation of Jeho-
vah’s Witnesses, 212 West St., Berlin, 7 
p.m. www.jw.org 

TAKE OFF POUNDS SENSIBLY 
Tuesdays - Worcester County Health 
Department, 9730 Healthway Drive, 
Berlin, 3:30-4:30 p.m. TOPS is a weekly 
support and education group promoting 
weight loss and a healthy lifestyle. 410-
289-4725 

OC KNITTING CLUB 
Tuesdays - Worcester County Library - 

Ocean City Branch, 10003 Coastal High-
way, 10:30 a.m. 

ARGENTINE TANGO PRACTICE 
Tuesdays - Experienced dancers and 
others interested in watching or learning 
more are welcome, 7-9:30 p.m. No part-
ner required. Info: 
TangobytheBeach.com. 

ZUMBA TONING TUESDAYS 
Tuesdays - Northside Park, 200 125th St., 
Ocean City, 5:30 p.m. Zumba with optional 
light weights. zumbajoyceoc@gmail.com 

Wed., Dec. 6 
BARIATRIC SUPPORT GROUP 
Held the first and second Wednesday of 
each month. For non-surgical patients. 
Atlantic General Bariatric Center, 410-
641-9568. 

PUZZLE SWAP 
Worcester County Library - Berlin 
Branch, 13 Harrison Ave., 1-5 p.m. Bring 
your gently used puzzles and leave with 
new-to-you puzzles. All puzzles must be 
complete in their original box. Don’t 
have a puzzle but still want one? That’s 
OK too. 410-641-0650 

GLASS BLOWN ORNAMENTS 
Jeffrey Auxer Designs, 19 Jefferson St., 
Berlin, 1 p.m. Local glass blower, Jeffrey 
Auxer, teaches the group to make orna-
ments in his studio. Limit 12. Registra-
tion required: 443-783-6164. 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

COFFEE AND CANVAS 
Worcester County Library - Pocomoke 
Branch, 301 Market St., 2 p.m. Learn 
painting basics while sipping coffee and 
creating a new canvas for your home. 
Supplies provided, Registration re-
quired: 410-957-0878. www.worcesterli-
brary.org 

DIABETES SUPPORT GROUP 
Worcester County Library - Berlin 
Branch, 13 Harrison Ave., 5-6 p.m. The 
group provides discussion and educa-
tion on the topic of diabetes. Darlene 
Jameson, 410-208-9761, djameson@at-
lanticgeneral.org 

ZUMBA WEDNESDAYS 
Wednesdays - Ocean City 50plus Cen-
ter, 104 41st St., 10 a.m. Dance back-
ground not required. 
zumbajoyceoc@gmail.com 

HOLIDAY DECOUPAGE ORNAMENTS 
Worcester County Library - Snow Hill 
Branch, 307 N. Washington St., 5 p.m. 
Decoupage oyster shells. There will be 
an assortment of themed designs and 
beads to choose from. All materials in-
cluded. No experience necessary. Regis-
tration required: 410-632-3495. 

12 TOURNAMENTS OF CHRISTMAS 
Ocean Downs Casino, 10218 Racetrack 
Road, Berlin. Slot Tournaments: Dec. 1, 

2, 4, 6, 8, 9, 12. Blackjack Tournaments: 
Dec. 3, 5, 7, 10, 11. Benefits Toys for Tots. 
https://www.oceandowns.com/promo-
tions/12-tournaments-of-christmas-2/ 

KIWANIS CLUB MEETING 
Wednesdays - Ocean Pines Community 
Center, Assateague Room, 239 Ocean 
Parkway, 8 a.m. Doors open at 7:30 a.m. 
Third Wednesday meetings are offsite 
and will be updated monthly on the 
website and Facebook. Guests are wel-
come. www.kiwanisofopoc.org 

ONGOING EVENTS 
BOOKS BEHIND BARS 
Snow Hill library, 307 N. Washington 
St., during December. Donate books to 
the Books Behind Bars drive, which 
helps promote education and enrich-
ment in local facilities. 410-632-3495, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

TEEN STEAM STATION 
Berlin library, 220 N. Main St., during 
December. Drop-in for fun STEAM chal-
lenges. Create jewelry using binary code, 
construct a flying glider, design your 
own city out of recycled material and 
more. Challenges will change each week. 
For ages 11 years and older. 410-641-
0650, www.worcesterlibrary.org 

VICTORIAN CHRISTMAS AT SNOW HILL 
Snow Hill library, 307 N. Washington 
St., Dec. 4-9. To prepare for the Dickens 
Weekend in Snow Hill, the Snow Hill li-
brary will be decked out in Victorian 
decor with crafts and activities for all 
ages. 410-632-3495, www.worcesterli-
brary.org 

BUS TRIP TO NEW YORK CITY 
Bus departs Dec. 15 from Snow Hill at 
5:30 a.m. and Berlin at 6 a.m.; returning 
at approximately midnight. Spend the 
day exploring New York City on your 
own. Enjoy the holiday spirit of the city. 
Cost is $100 per person. Register: 
https://worcesterrecandparks.org/pro-
grams/motorcoach or www.playmary-
landscoast.org. Info: Kyle Jarmon, 
410-632-2144, Ext. 2519, 
kjarmon@marylandscoast.org 

WINTERFEST OF LIGHTS 
Northside Park, 200 125th St., Ocean 
City, Nov. 16-Dec. 31, 5:30-9:30 p.m. 
Admission cost is $6 for adults and free 
to children 11 years and younger. Take 
the walking tour through thousands of 
sparkling holiday lights and many ani-
mated light displays located along a 
paved park paths. Sip hot chocolate, 
take a photo with Santa, try a family 
craft, visit the gift shop and see the 50-
foot Christmas tree. There will be a Win-
terfest Express tram ride with multiple 
“trolly” stops to assist guests in making 
their way around the 58 acre Northside 
Park. Pets are welcome on Wednesday 
evenings. Purchase tickets: 
https://oceancitymd.gov/oc/depart-
ments/special-events/winterfest/. 

Continued from Page 19
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MAINTENANCE HELP  
in Ocean Pines area.  

Full or Part Time!  
Call for an appointment, 

410-641-5102. 

Hiring Licensed 
MD cosmotologist 

Full-time or part-time. 
410-390-3916 

Pool - General Maintenance 
Outdoor work, lifting heavy 
objects. Mechanical, basic, 

pool pump & motors, CPO a 
plus/not required. Able to 
pass CPO test. Summer,  

includes weekends and long 
hours; working alone and 

with others. 410-289-4902 
ask for Suzanne. 

 

Small Engine Mechanic 
Year Round 

Competitive Wages 
443-754-1047 

 

RENTALS 

2BR/2 Bath Bayfront Condo 
at 56th St., 3rd floor walkup, 

2 level condo. Fully  
furnished, full kitchen, W/D, 
2-car parking, central AC. No 
pets, no smoking, occupancy 

4. $2200 monthly, tenant 
pays cable and electric. 1st 
and last months’ rent plus  

security deposit to move in. 
Resort Rentals,  
410-524-0295. 

House to Rent. YR. N.O.C. 
4 Master BR, 1 Single BR. 

Plenty of parking, large 
kitchen, back porch, washer 

and dryer. $3200/month. 
443-880-2486 

WOC - YR Rental - 5BR, 
3.5BA, 3600 sq.ft. on pond. 

$2950/month and one 
months security plus utili-

ties. Contact Lou,  
410-713-0065. 

Fully Furnished  
Townhouse, 4BR, 2BA,  

Living Room, Dining Room. 
Water, Electric and Cable not 

included. $2100/month. 
Yearly lease. One month  
security deposit and one 

month rent upfront. Located 
at 438 Ocean Parkway, 

Ocean Pines, MD 21011. 
410-456-0272 

 

Seeking YR & Seasonal 
Rentals! Call Howard Martin 
Realty 410-352-5555. 

 

ROOMMATES 

Room for Rent, Bayside. 
Available Now. $900/month. 

$1,800 move in.  
Text only 443-614-4523. 

HOUSE SHARING 
Nice house. 94th Street 

area. Enclosed hot tub room, 
other amenities. Nice pets 

considered. Seeking  
employed males 20-30 years 

old who have their life  
together. Winter or year 
round. $600/month plus  

utilities. Text Rob,  
410-726-5200. 

Winter Rental - Ocean City. 
XL Master bedroom w/private 
bath. Fully furnished. $600/ 
month. Includes all utilities. 
No pets. No smoking. 443-
880-2486 
 

Year-Round Room For Rent 
Ocean Pines $800/month and 
$200 security. Fully furnished. 
All utilities included. 443-
880-2317 

 

COMMERCIAL 

Industrial Warehouse.  
Space: 1500 sq. ft.  

Masonry construction, 18’ 
high ceiling, large garage 

door, bathroom.  
Route 90/Bishopville.  
Call 443-497-4200. 

 

1 Office/Retail Space  
available in West Ocean  

City. Approximately        
1656 sq. ft.   

Call 443-497-4200 
 

Do you have an old bicycle 
not being used? It could 
mean a world of difference to 
a hard-working international 
student. We are looking to 
get as many bikes as possi-
ble. Your donation will be tax-
deductible. Contact Gary at 
443-975-3065. 

RENTALS ROOMMATESHELP WANTED HELP WANTED

www.oceancitytoday.com
O r d e r  Y O u r  C l a s s i f i e d s  O n l i n e !

• Convenient 
• Quick 
• No Waiting, No Calls 
• Days, Nights & Weekends

COMMERCIAL DONATIONS

Classifieds 410-723-6397

ROOMMATES

GET IT 
RENTED 
HERE! 

 
It’s not too 

late to  
advertise 

your  
winter 

rentals. 
 

410-723-6397 
 

www. 
oceancitytoday. 

com 
 

www. 
baysideoc. 

com

COMMERCIAL

NOW HIRING!!  
Production Crew  

for our WOC kitchen facility 
Up to $20/hr.  

Apply online at:  
www.delmarvadd.com

Yearly & Seasonal 
Rentals  

We Welcome Pets 
7700 Coastal Hwy 
410-524-7700 

www.holidayoc.com

Commercial Warehouses 
600 and 800 sq. ft. spaces 

West Ocean City and 
Bishopville, MD 

Yearly Leases Only 

Call 646-812-1212

Call 410-723-6397 
by Monday 5 p.m.

M A R K E T P L A C E

Classifieds appear in Ocean City Today & 
Bayside Gazette each week and online at  

oceancitytoday.com & baysideoc.com
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OFF SEASON 
RENTALS 

Utililites Included 

CONTACT US AT 
burgundyinn@gmail.com 

410-289-8581

RENTALS

BUDGET MOVERS 
443-664-5797 

LOCAL & EAST COAST MOVING 
Full Packing Service 

Piano Movers - Full Service 

www.facebook.com/OCBudgetMovers

SERVICES

ELECTRICIAN 
Full-time, year-round  
position. Established  

company. 5+ years exp. 
Service-type projects. 
Health, dental, paid  
vacation, 401K w/ 

matching. Company van. 
Hawkins Electric 

Call 443-856-2001 
Ask for John Ross

Hiring Cooks, Audio/Video 
Techs, Maintenance Staff, 

Painters, Carpenter,  
Plumber, Housekeeper,  
Liquor Store Attendant,  
Boat Mates, Receivers,  

Event Space Housekeeper  
Apply in person or online at 

seacrets.com

CLASSIFIED AD NETWORK
Serving the Newspapers of  
Maryland, Delaware and the  
District of Columbia since 1908.

MARYLAND STATEWIDE  
CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING  

NETWORK 

FOR SALE 
Prepare for power outages 
today with a GENERAC home 
standby generator. $0 Money 
Down + Low Monthly Pay-
ment Options. Request a 
FREE Quote. Call now before 
the next power outage: 1-855-
993-0969 

MISC. FOR SALE 
Switch to DISH and get up to 
a $300 gift card! Plus get the 
Multisport Pack included for a 
limited time! Hurry, call for de-
tails: 1-855-407-6870. 

 

MISC. SERVICES 
FREE high-speed internet for 
those that qualify. Govern-
ment program for recipients 
of select programs incl. Med-
icaid, SNAP, Housing Assis-
tance, WIC, Veterans 
Pension, Survivor Benefits, 
Lifeline, Tribal. 15 GB internet 
service. Bonus offer: Android 
tablet FREE with one-time 
$20 copay. Free shipping & 
handling. Call Maxsip Tele-
com today! 1-888-592-5957 

HOME IMPROVEMENT 
SERVICES 

BEAUTIFUL BATH UPDATES 
in as little as ONE DAY! Supe-
rior quality bath and shower 
systems at AFFORDABLE 
PRICES!  Lifetime warranty & 
professional installs. Call 
Now! 877-738-0991. 

 

PETS/PET SUPPLIES 
Are you a pet owner? Do you 
want to get up to 100% back 
on Vet Bills? Physicians Mu-
tual Insurance Company has 
pet coverage that can help!  
Call 1-888-928-1656 to get a 

free quote or visit  
insurebarkmeow.com/mddc 

SERVICES 
DENTAL INSURANCE from 
Physicians Mutual Insurance 
Company. Coverage for 350 
plus procedures. Real dental 
insurance - NOT just a dis-
count plan. Do not wait! Call 
now! Get your FREE Dental 
Information Kit with all the de-
tails! 1-855-337-5228  

www.dental50plus.com/ 
MDDC#6258 

VEHICLES WANTED 
DONATE YOUR CAR/TRUCK/ 
RV - Lutheran Mission Society 
of MD Compassion Place 
ministries help local families 
with food, clothing, counsel-
ing. Tax deductible. MVA li-
censed #W1044.  

410-228-8437  
www.CompassionPlace.org

Advertise in MDDC  
410-723-6397

FT FRONT DESK ADMIN - TOWN OF OCEAN VIEW

Submit resume by Dec. 8, ‘23 to: Town Manager’s Office
201 Central Avenue - 2nd Floor; Ocean View, DE  19970

Candidates must possess excellent verbal and written communication
skills; be proficient in Word, Excel, & Outlook, and be able to

multi-task & interact with information requests and services in a
professional manner. Varied duties and responsibilities will be

required.  The Town offers an excellent salary and benefits package.  EOE

Run your business card in our  

SERVICE DIRECTORY 
CALL 410-723-6397 for pricing!

Maryland, Delaware and D.C.: 106 papers with a circulation of 2.3 million and readership of 4.9 million!  
For only $495. Deadline is Wednesday of the week prior to publication.  Call 410-723-6397.

Classified  
Deadline is  

Monday @ 5pm

Classifieds 410-723-6397



COMPLETE BODY SHOP   
Auto Sales & Service • Complete Computerized Diagnostic Specialists

TRAILER PARTS, SALES & SERVICE  
ROUTE 589, RACE TRACK ROAD

410-641-5262
ROUTE 50, BERLIN

 (1/2 Mile East of McDonald’s) 
410-641-3200

AUTO & MARINE TIRE CENTER

autOMOtiVe repair

410-641-3200

BaysideOC.com

AUTOMOTIVE REPAIR cleaning services

Family Owned and Operated Since 1983

Carpet, Upholstery, Tile and 
Grout Cleaning 

Oriental Rug Cleaning and Repair 

     302-436-5652

CLEANING SERVICES
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ELECTRICIAN

EmErGEncy 
sErvicE availablE 
410-251-3153

rEsidEntial & commErcial sErvicE 
Services Include 

additions • interior/Exterior lighting 
lamp & light repair • Generator installs 

Call Turner Today 410-251-3153 
MD MASTERS LIC. #15438  M400 

BERLIN • OCEAN PINES • OCEAN CITY

ElEctricELECTRICIAN

THE 
HANDY BEACHMAN

Exterior Home Repairs 
“WE DO IT ALL”

Licensed • Bonded • Insured • MHIC 17433 
“A Family Tradition Since 1935” 
410-893-9707

• Roofing Repairs 
• Roof Cleaning 

• Gutter Cleaning & Powerwashing • 
• Deck Repairs •

• Rain Gutters 
• Gutter Guards 

• Screening 
• Painting 

• Staining 
• Caulking

PARRISH
HANDYMAN

PAUL’S HOME IMPROVEMENTS
All phases of home improvements 

No job too small - No job too large 
Handyman Home Services

FREE ESTIMATES 
Over 45 years 

experience

MHIC 
#83501 410-641-7548

HOME IMPROVEMENT

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

  
     

   
   
                             

 
               

               
 

   
     
 

ovement”roImpr
for Home 

oday!To1

ovement Design & Bert

H O M E  I M P R O V E M E N T

Home Impr

1312 Manklin Creek, Rd., Ocean Pines, MD ~ Call or Stop in T

Home Imprroovement Services Company

PipeLine 
Contracting, LLC

“One stop shop 

• Cabinets & Countertop
• Kitchen & Bath Remodeling
• General Carpentry & 

Painting 

• Flooring & TTiile
 • Residential & Commercial 
 • Servicing Maryland &

Delaware Beaches

US VVeeterans 
Administration 

Approved Contractor

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

  
     

   
   
                             

 
               

               
 

   
     
 

 (410) 208-1518 • (41
pipelinecontracting.net • info@p

MDHIC # 107489 • DE # 20141003

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

  
     

   
   
                             

 
               

               
 

   
     
 

0) 982-8368
pipelinecontracting.net
04 • Insured & Licensed

HOME IMPROVEMENT

isa VieWeW  accept MC/V

pes of Custom Remodeling.yTyAll 
Additions, Kitchens, Baths and  Specializing in 

T

home improvement

(410) 6411-3762

HOME IMPROVEMENT

DIRECTORY

mental health

Island Care Mental Health  
Mary Deborah Wilson 

PMHNP  
Avoid the Delays 

Medication & Therapy 
MD DE Lic.     410-641-5190

MENTAL HEALTH

The Area’s #1 Moving Company
BUDGET MOVERS

40+Years in Business                                                  Licensed & Insured

LOCAL • ENTIRE EAST COAST
Residential or Office or Commercial

Packing or Loading or Unloading or Complete Move 
Single Item or Certain Items or Full Home

Call Maria: 443-664-5797
Female Owned & Operated

www.Facebook.com/ocbudgetmovers

MOVING SERVICES MVA licensed
NEW TITLE AND TAGS  AND MORE 

          www.westoceancitytagandtitle.com

WEST OCEAN CITY 

VEHICLE TAG & TITLE 
TRADER LEE’S VILLAGE 

9935 STEPHEN DECATUR HIGHWAY #15

JODY PALMISANO 
410-629-5600 

NEW TITLE AND TAGS  AND MORE 

          www.westoceancitytagandtitle.com

WEST OCEAN CITY 

VEHICLE TAG & TITLE 
TRADER LEE’S VILLAGE 

9935 STEPHEN DECATUR HIGHWAY #15

JODY PALMISANO 
410-629-5600 

Open Mon., Fri., 9-2 & Wed. 9-5

MVA LICENSED

ALL FOR A F
AL  •  GVA

ASH ROOFWA
WINDOW & HOUS

RESIDENTIAL   •   C

SOFT W

TEXT OR C
POLLEN REMOV

TETIMA
VICEGUTTER SER

F CLEANING
E CLEANING

FREE ES

COMMERCIAL

9.91302.5 9020

CLEANING SERVICES

Page 22 Bayside Gazette November 30, 2023



PAINTING

Zimmerman 
& Son LLC

• CUSTOM PAINTING 
• DRYWALL REPAIRS 
• WALLPAPER REMOVED 
• DECK & HOUSE 
  STAINING 
• ALWAYS PROMPT  
  SERVICE 
     Free Estimates

10% Discount with this ad. 

Bill Zimmerman cell 443-373-4539

NOW ACCEPTING 
CREDIT CARDS!

Painting & Powerwashing 
Interior & Exterior 

Serving Delmarva for Over 35 Years 
Licensed & Insured

PAINTING
POWERWASHING

all services  
           w/this ad!

POWERWASHING / SOFT WASH
Atlantic Coast Powerwashing Services

Year round  
services 

w/yearly & 
seasonal  

rates

Hot Water, Powerwashing 
& Soft Wash Systems

• Deck Staining 
• Decks • Docks 

• Houses • Restaurants 
•  Shopping Centers  
•  Roofs •  & More

MHIC 97081 
Ocean City 34629 • Delaware 2004 222 381 

Licensed & Insured
410-603-3400 
Joe Beran/Owner Operator 
acms1st@gmail.com

Commercial & Residential • Complete Exterior Cleaning
Atlantic Coast Powerwashing Services

POWERWASHING / SOFT WASH

PRINTING & DESIGN

11065 Cathell Road • Ocean Pines 
410-208-0641 • copycentral@verizon.net

OPEN 
Mon.-Fri.  

9am-5pm

ONE STOP SHOP For ALL YOUR PERSONAL & BUSINESS NEEDS

NOT YOUR AVERAGE COPY CENTER
Full Business Center 

Custom Gifts 

Graphic Designs 

Retail Gift Items 

Wedding Print Services 

PRINTING & DESIGN ROOFING ROOFING

Your Roofing, Siding & Home Improvement  
Specialist Since 1989  

ROOFING • SIDING • DURADEK • WINDOWS • GUTTERS

Mike Moesle 410-629-1573, Fax: 410-629-1946 
   mmoesle@shoresidingmd.com 
   www.shoresidingmd.com                    *Licensed in MD, DE &VA

ROOFING

DIRECTORY
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11005 Manklin M
Ocean Pines

410.629.0089

M-F: 9am-6pm
Sat: 10am-2pm
Sun: Closed

 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 

 

 

  

  

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

  
  

    
 

  
  
  

Meadows Lane #1
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• Blister

• Durab

• Wound
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• S

• I

• C

 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 

 

 

  

  

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

  
  

    
 

  
  
  

Short prescriptio

mmunizations 

Competitive OTC

 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 

 

 

  

  

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

  
  

    
 

  
  
  

on wait time

C/Rx cash price
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