
Tub races 
fill Main 
in Berlin

Mother Nature provided a 

perfect evening for the 

Berlin Chamber of  

Commerce’s 34th Annual 

Berlin Bathtub Races last 

Friday, as thousands of spec-

tators converged under clear 

skies and mild temperatures 

on Main Street to see the 

team from Pohanka capture 

top honors. The crowd was 

among the largest ever to 

witness the event. See page 

21 for more pictures. 

 
PHOTOS COURTESY GARRETT NEVILLE/ 

BERLIN CHAMBER OF COMMERCE

Candidates 
hold forth 
at OP forum 
Format gives contenders 
opportunity to question 
each other on stances

(June 20, 2024) Ocean Pines 
Board of Directors candidates Sherrie 
Clifford, Jeff Heavner, Rick Farr, 
Amy Peck and Jerry Murphy ad-
dressed voters and each other at the 
Thursday, June 13 election forum.  

Association President Farr and 
board member Heavner are seeking 
reelection, while Peck, who served on 
the governing board from 2021 to 
2022, Clifford and Murphy are chal-
lenging the incumbents for the 
board’s two available seats.  

The forum began with opening 
statements from the competitors. 

Clifford expressed her support for 
the community’s current leadership. 
“As a proud homeowner for almost 
four years, I have had the privilege of 
witnessing the many successful de-
velopments produced by our general 
manager, John Viola, and his team,” 
she said. “I am dedicated to support-
ing their continued success.” 

Outlining her priorities as a 
prospective director, Clifford said her 
list included upholding Ocean Pines’ 
governing documents, partnering 
with the volunteer fire department, 
and “revitalizing committees through 
inclusive decision-making 
processes,” among other concerns. 

Clifford told the audience she has 
experience in contract negotiation, 
project and database management, 
and software development. She also 
said she believes her skills developed 
through building and maintaining 
team environments, advanced tech-
nology proficiencies, informed deci-
sion-making processes, and 
multi-level organizational collabora-
tion have prepared her to be an effec-
tive member of the Ocean Pines 

See OP BOARD Page 6

By Tara Fischer 
Staff Writer

JUNE 20, 2024 BERLIN • NORTH WORCESTER COUNTY• OCEAN PINES FREE 

GOLD IS AT AN ALL TIME 
RECORD HIGH!
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BETTER TIME TO SELL! 
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(June 20, 2024) At its Wednesday, 
June 12 meeting, the Berlin Planning 
Commission heard the concept plan 
for the proposed development of a 
new residential community in town.  

Main Street Homes, an affiliate of 
Natelli Communities based in 
Gaithersburg, is spearheading the 
project. George, Miles, and Buhr of 
Salisbury are slated to handle the en-
gineering aspect of the residential 
property creation.  

The housing community is pro-
posed between Tripoli and Bay 
streets along Route 113. Developers 
said the site was originally to include 
33 units. However, due to stormwater 
and wetlands concerns, the proposal 
was amended to build 27 single-fam-
ily detached lots. The concept plan in-
cludes a walking trail for the 
residents to access Stephen Decatur 
Park.  

“For the pedestrian path, the trail 
that you have between the subdivi-
sion and the park, consider con-

June 20, 2024 Bayside Gazette Page 3

SUBMITTED RENDERING/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 
The proposed single-family home community is located off Route 113 in between Bay and Tripoli streets. 

Proposed project located 
off Route 113 near park
By Tara Fischer 
Staff Writer

Commissioners    
review 27-home 
community plans 

See PLANNERS Page 4
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structing that as a 10-foot wide 
shared use path complying with fed-
eral regulation for pedestrians and 
bicycles,” Planning and Zoning con-
sultant Rick Baldwin suggested. 

The project outline specifies that 
the development requires 54 parking 
spaces, but around 73 will be pro-
vided. Engineers maintain there will 
be driveways, and while it is not guar-
anteed, the hope is also to include 
garages. According to the building set-
backs portion of the concept plan, the 
minimum lot area is 6,000 square feet 
and the maximum building height is 
two and a half stories or 35 feet.  

Since the project was presented as 
a concept plan for review, the com-
mission did not take a vote on the de-
velopment but offered feedback to 
the developers.  

Toward the end of the June 12 

meeting, the commission discussed 
the possibility of imposing a morato-
rium for commercial and lower resi-
dential developments for an 
undetermined amount of time. Coun-
cilmember Steve Green suggested the 
pause at the meeting of the Major and 
Council on Monday, June 10. Green 
said he was hoping the planning com-
mission would issue the council a rec-
ommendation for or against a 
short-term moratorium of three or 
six months. Green noted after watch-
ing numerous planning commission 
meeting the body appears to be strug-
gling with directing applicants, such 
as Wawa and the Microtel hotel, on 
the best paths forward when the zon-
ing permits the uses. Green noted the 
Wawa discussion reached the point 
the applicant was threatening to sue 
the town over the planning commis-
sion’s continuous questioning of the 

project. 
With the comprehensive plan up-

date underway as well as a process to 
create commercial design guidelines 
for applicants, Green said he would 
support a short “pause” to allow a 
planning director to be hired.  

Former Planning Director Dave 
Engelhart passed away last month. In 
the meantime, Baldwin, a town resi-
dent who worked in planning for the 
city of Salisbury before retiring, has 
stepped in as a consultant while the 
town searches for someone to fill the 
role. 

“That is how I initially described 
it,” Town Administrator Mary Bohlen 
said of Baldwin’s current position. “It 
was to make sure that property own-
ers, developers, builders, and projects 
did not just stall. That they kept mov-
ing as best they could.”  

Members of the council seemed to 

agree with Green when he broached 
the topic last week, agreeing a mora-
torium would give the town more 
time to find a new director and settle 
in without being overwhelmed with 
developmental projects. Bohlen 
maintained the town is actively re-
viewing applicants for the position.  

At the June 12 planning commis-
sion meeting, Baldwin pushed back 
on the idea of an indefinite pause. 
Currently, project developers are re-
quired to submit proposals two weeks 
before the next meeting. The consult-
ant recommended that the commis-
sion extend this timeline rather than 
proceed with a moratorium.  

“I propose we move the submittal 
deadline back to 30 days so there is 
more of an opportunity to complete 
the packages in front of me,” Baldwin 
said. “… I want to continue to move 
forward, but maybe at a pace that I’m 
not stepping on my shoelaces, and 
you all are not being asked to approve 
something you have not been given 
the appropriate support for.”  

The group agreed with the recom-
mendation with the commission unan-
imously opposed to a moratorium. 

Planners oppose short moratorium concept
Continued from Page 3

Pines police stepping up radar enforcement

(June 20, 2024) As summer heats 
up, Ocean Pines safety officials pro-
vided community updates, rules, and 
regulations during the Saturday, 
June 15, OPA Board of Directors 
meeting. 

As the neighborhood’s Fourth of 
July celebration planning continues, 
the Ocean Pines Volunteer Fire De-
partment President Joe Enste urged 
residents to leave the fireworks to the 
professionals.  

“We have had firework mishaps 
before,” he said. “With all the brush 
and how close our community is to 
one another, it can cause issues.” 

The firefighter also cautioned 
homeowners against improper bon-

fire and grill etiquette. Because prop-
erties are roughly a quarter acre and 
space between houses is limited, 
Enste reminded individuals to prac-
tice safety during these summer ac-
tivities.  

According to the OPVFD’s website, 
which outlines the organization’s fire 
pit regulations, a steady supply of 
water or a flame extinguisher must be 
nearby, an adult must always be pres-
ent, and the burning of plastic, 
treated wood, grass, rubber, leavers, 
pallets, or household trash is prohib-
ited.  

The homeowner must notify the 
property's Compliance, Permits, and 
Inspections Department of the fire 
pit. The structure must be placed on 
a level, non-combustible surface, and 

it may not be used in wind over 15 
miles per hour. Additional safety 
rules can be found on the fire group’s 
webpage.  

Ocean Pines Police Chief Tim 
Robinson addressed OPA residents at 
the June 15 meeting. The officer said 
he has received phone calls, emails, 
and social media messages about 
speeding in the community.  

The department has increased en-
forcement to address these concerns, 
and the chief is often running radar.  

Robinson said that police have re-
moved unnecessary road signs and 
are in the process of adding markings 
indicating potential safety hazards, 
like abrupt curves.  

Additionally, the police chief urged 
residents to ensure their house num-

bers are identifiable to improve 
emergency response time.  

“When seconds count, we need to 
get there,” he said. “Make sure that 
your house number is conspicuously 
displayed where it can easily be 
seen.”  

Amid July 4 festivities, the depart-
ment reminded Ocean Pines citizens 
that traffic patterns on Cathell Road 
and Ocean Parkway will be different, 
as the streets will be closed at various 
times for safety. The police depart-
ment and OPA will communicate 
these decisions as the event draws 
closer.  

“We're hoping for a fun evening on 
July 4,” Robinson said. “You'll see me 
and probably almost my entire team 
out there that night.”  

By Tara Fischer 
Staff Writer

EVERY SUNDAY 
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• Vendor Opportunities Available •  
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Board of Directors.  
“I am a strong advocate for a board 

that listens to our homeowners and 
prioritizes communication and trans-
parency,” Clifford said. “This election 
is important and will determine if 
homeowners in the future are in-
cluded or excluded in all aspects of 
our community. All homeowners 
should have an opportunity to serve 
and should not be excluded for their 
differences of opinion. I am confident 
that we can tackle the greatest chal-
lenges we currently face together.”  

In outlining his personal and pro-
fessional background, Heavener said 
he is a native Marylander who grew 
up in Dundalk and spent his sum-
mers working at his parents’ Board-
walk business in Ocean City. 

He graduated from the Naval 
Academy and went to serve as an in-
telligence officer, a position that al-
lowed him to be “entrusted with the 
highest level of information that this 
country holds.” Heavner then spent 
30 years at Exxon Mobil before retir-
ing to the Eastern Shore. 

“My wife and I do a lot in Ocean 
Pines,” he said. “We garden at the 
community garden center, we bowl 
on an Ocean Pines league, I enjoy 
walking the Pines, and we spend a 
fair amount of time in volunteer serv-

ice.”  
Heavner assured voters that if he 

is re-elected he will remain commit-
ted to the community’s growth. 
Among his priorities are negotiating 
a deal for the new South Side Fire 
Station, securing a multiyear contract 
with General Manager John Viola, 
while also engaging in succession 
planning for the day when Viola steps 
down, obtaining a long-term agree-
ment with food and beverage 
provider Matt Ortt Companies, com-
pleting the Racquet Sports Center 
Clubhouse renovations, Compliance, 
Permit, and Inspections violation ed-
ucation, and a focus on secondary 
drainage. 

“Those with an incredible vision 
created Ocean Pines,” Heavener said. 
“… Its preservation and growth, how-
ever, requires leadership from our 
general manager and board of direc-
tors to plan and spend your money 
wisely. Fortunately, we have a very 
talented general manager and presi-
dent of our board.”  

The governing body’s current pres-
ident, Farr, said, “This board has 
done outstanding service to the 
Ocean Pines community, which has 
delivered one of the most successful 
and prosperous times in its history. 
This has been a team effort with the 
collaboration and professionalism of 

six other directors that Ocean Pines 
membership voted to serve, along 
with unwavering support and part-
nership with our general manager,” 
he continued.  

This success, Farr said, has in-
cluded a positive year-to-date vari-
ance of over $1.2 million, a reduction 
of yearly assessments “while ensuring 
that all our amenities are well 
funded,” an increase in salaries and 
retirement contributions for Ocean 
Pines police officers, and a golf course 
operation revenue of over $400,000 
before depreciation.  

Additionally, Farr reported that 
the new Yacht Club Tiki Bar, which 
opened on Memorial Day weekend, 
has generated record sales, and the 
community’s amenity membership 
revenues are up more than $100,000 
over last year.  

Farr served two decades in combat 
operations in the United States Air 
Force. He holds a bachelor’s degree in 
business administration and a mas-
ter’s in human resource management 
and currently serves as the chief 
human resource officer for Easton 
government. He has been an Ocean 
Pines homeowner since 1999 and is a 
Worcester County Veterans Memo-
rial Foundation director.  

Challenger Peck said that her deci-
sion to run comes from her passion 
for protecting the community’s 
legacy.  

“I am ready to start as a director 
on day one with institutional knowl-
edge and experience,” she said. “... 
Wanting the best has me here today. 
Homeowners deserve a choice, and I 
did not want an unopposed election 
because I believe effective gover-
nance includes a respectful, open dis-
cussion with multiple perspectives, 
ideas, and solutions. I see the value of 
committee expertise and listening to 
the homeowners.”  

Peck said she wishes to protect 
Ocean Pines from a 6-1 or 7-0 board 
majority “that blindly votes ‘yes.’” 

She hopes to prioritize improved 

collaboration and restore the group’s 
relationships with the Ocean Pines 
Volunteer Fire Department and the 
advisory committees.  

Murphy first came to Ocean Pines 
in the early 1970s, when he built 
houses with the Helicon Design 
Group. He then opened a McDonald’s 
next to Stephen Decatur High School 
and another on 28th Street in Ocean 
City. On returning to Baltimore, he  
began a paper and packaging distri-
bution company before becoming an 
Ocean Pines resident and a top Real-
tor for Long and Foster Real Estate.  

He also serves on the board for a 
historic building across the bridge.  

“Ocean Pines is a place I have seen 
for 50 years plus evolve into the great 
community it is today,” he said. “I am 
here to expand on what is going on. 
We have seen tremendous progress 
in the last two or three years…I look 
forward to serving you.” 

Following the opening statements, 
the candidates randomly selected res-
ident-submitted questions. Competi-
tors were not given access to the 
inquiries beforehand.  

Ocean Pines has approximately 
8,500 properties and only two or 
three CPI (Compliance, Permits, In-
spections) inspectors. Clifford was 
asked if she supports increasing the 
number of personnel who determine 
when violations have occurred. 

“I am all for our enforcement of 
CPI and keeping our property values 
high,” the candidate said. “… How-
ever, I know we have a Design Man-
agement Associates (DMA) reserve 
study coming up, and we need to 
make sure we have the proper fund-
ing in all areas, so we need to be care-
ful where we spend and do it 
efficiently and effectively. Having 
8,500 homes and only two people to 
support going around with the viola-
tions is low … I would have to work 
on a study and figure out what we 
have and what is involved…but I 
think it’s low…it’s important to keep 
our home values high and beautiful.”  
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TARA FISCHER/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 
Attendees are pictured at the June 13 candidates forum listening to the views of current OPA 

Board candidates, with incumbent Jeff Heavner at the podium.

OP board hopefuls state positions at forum
Continued from Page 1
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Candidates debate unanimity
Regarding the claim the board 

often makes decisions contrary to the 
community’s bylaws, Heavner coun-
tered that the governing body refers 
to these documents during decision-
making.  

“…I read all those documents thor-
oughly,” he said. “I understand most 
of them very thoroughly. I constantly 
read our resolutions and our bylaws. 
Contrary to what my opponents say, 
that we don’t have independent 
thinkers on the board, we all are in-
dependent thinkers.”  

“All of us try to abide by our rules 
and regulations,” Heavner continued. 
“Most of the people on this board 
have a common vision … A vision of 
exceptional safety, finances, value, 
and quality of life. How we get there 
is by investing in our amenities … we 
strive for that every day. We may not 
be perfect, but we strive to abide by 
our bylaws. And if we don’t, we can 
learn from it.” 

Farr assured voters that OPA has 
emergency re-
serve funds. In 
the case of a natu-
ral disaster, the 
c o m m u n i t y 
would first utilize 
insurance claims, 
but additional 
savings are avail-
able to help respond to unforeseen 
circumstances.  

When asked how she would pre-
pare for Ocean Pines Board of Direc-
tors meetings, Peck emphasized her 
support for posting agenda packets 
online in advance. The candidate also 
said she intends to ask questions, re-
search, and use data in decision-mak-
ing. These practices, she said, are 
necessary to sustain transparency.  

Murphy was asked how he may in-
crease the benefit to residents during 
upcoming contract negotiations for 
the Matt Ortt Companies. The cur-
rent agreement, which provides for a 
half-million payout to the food and 
beverage service and a $19 per prop-
erty owner subsidy by the Ocean 
Pines property owners, is nearing ex-
piration.  

“Matt Ortt and his operations have 
been doing a fantastic job,” Murphy 
said. “The Yacht Club used to never 
have any good food. Matt has put to-
gether an operation that attracts…I 
would like to see it continue. I don’t 
think any homeowner would have an 
issue with a $15 assessment to keep 
Matt on board…Ocean Pines is the 
benefactor of his operations.”  

In the forum’s final round, candi-
dates were allowed to ask their oppo-
nents questions. 

Murphy asked Peck, who has spo-
ken about her desire for a board with 
differing perspectives, what value di-
versity provides when the current 
governance is in unison.  

“That is how you come up with the 
best decisions,” Peck answered. “You 
have someone asking, ‘Where is the 

data? What is the return on invest-
ment? Why is this project costing so 
much per square foot?’ We do not 
hear that from this board as a com-
munity. It is just hands up ‘yes.’ 
When coming to decisions, it should 
be a collaboration. As an independent 
thinker, I would be asking those 
questions.”  

Following an inquiry from Peck 
about OPA’s relationship with the fire 
department, Farr said that the board 
is “currently in negations with the fire 
department as far as where we are 
going with a new building” and that 
the association’s communication with 
the station has “increased im-
mensely.” 

“Once a decision has been made, it 
will be brought to the community,” 
the president said. “This is something 
the leadership of the fire department, 
the board, and the general manager 
are working through. It is happening 
as we speak.”  

Farr asked Clifford about her deci-
sion to welcome 
former Ocean 
Pines police offi-
cer Chris Tarr, 
who was ethically 
compromised for 
improper ammu-
nition and 
firearm custody, 

onto her community podcast. The 
episode was released in September 
2023.  

“He had something to say, and we 
gave him the platform to say it,” Clif-
ford said, responding to her oppo-
nent’s inquiry. “I value the police 
department and our fire department. 
I also believe in giving people a voice 
so their side of the story may be 
heard. We are open to communica-
tion…”  

Candidates had the opportunity to 
address voters after the forum. Clif-
ford emphasized her commitment to 
a board dedicated to integrity, trans-
parency, and accountability.  

She also argued that eliminating 
advisory committees is detrimental to 
the community. Notably, this state-
ment comes after the racquet sports 
group was dissolved in April after 
mold allegations made from within 
that group were proven false.  

“Ocean Pines is a wonderful place 
to live that should not be governed by 
a super majority that excludes those 
that speak or disagree,” Clifford said, 
addressing the crowd. “Your voice 
and vote are important and can make 
a difference when electing board 
members. Ones that work for you, the 
homeowner.”  

Heavner emphasized the successes 
of the current governing group. “…
Our amenities continue to be in-
vested in … our beautiful commu-
nity,” he said. “The board’s 
responsible for protecting and en-
hancing this positive momentum. I 
believe I have demonstrated the abil-

See OP Page 8

‘The board’s responsible for 

protecting and enhancing this 

positive momentum.’ 

— Candidate Jeff Heavner
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ity to keep your trust as a director.”  
Farr reiterated the positive devel-

opments the current board has se-
cured. The golf course is profitable, 
renovations for the racquet sports 
center building were approved, a 
local law firm with expertise in HOA 
regulations was hired, and the com-
munity remains financially sound.  

“There has been talk and discus-
sion about a 6-1 majority,” the presi-
dent said.  “I will remind the 
candidates here that the Ocean Pines 
residents voted for this board…”  

Peck maintained that a shakeup in 
board representation is needed to 
give homeowners greater trans-

parency.  
“If this election had gone unop-

posed, the super board majority, 
where it appears decisions are being 
made via email and behind closed 
doors, without…discussion and re-
spect for the committees, would con-
tinue …,” she argued.  

Murphy, who ran for the board last 
year, said he is running to be a part of 
a successful team.  

“I commit myself to transparency, 
integrity, commitment to our prop-
erty owners and all the residents,” the 
challenger said.  

The ballot deadline for voters is 
Tuesday, Aug. 6, by 4 p.m. The re-
sults will be announced on Thursday, 

Continued from Page 8

OP candidates take questions

Pines Elections Committee 
gets new leader in 6-1 vote

(June 20, 2024) The Ocean Pines 
Association Board of Directors voted 
6-1 to appoint Steve Ransdell as the 
new chair of the Elections Committee 
amid the current position-holder 
Tom Piatti’s departure from the com-
munity. Director Steve Jacobs op-
posed the motion.  

Jacobs claimed Ransdell, a neigh-
borhood resident who currently 
serves on the 
committee, is an 
active participant 
in a contentious 
Facebook group, 
which should dis-
qualify him from 
stepping into the 
leadership role.  

“The Facebook page holds itself 
out as being parody,” Jacobs said. “… 
it passed parody several stops ago, 
and the content is much closer to 
being insulting, demeaning, and gen-
erally repulsive … Ransdell, as it has 
been reported in the past by symbols 
or emojis, indicated that he liked a lot 
of these comments.” 

Jacobs maintains OPA Board of 
Directors election candidates Amy 
Peck and Sherrie Clifford are fre-
quent targets for the inappropriate 
comments. The Facebook group in 
question was never named.  

“It is apparent to me that this is a 
potential conflict of interest between 
his own views and the need for us to 
hold an election … the fact of the mat-
ter is, we can do better,” Jacobs con-
tinued.  

Fellow members of the governing 
body pushed back on Jacobs’ stance. 
Vice President Stuart Lakernick ar-
gued that Ransdell, who moderated 

the Thursday, June 13 candidate 
forum, has proven his professional-
ism. He also noted that Piatti recom-
mended the new chair.  

“I will not let social media dictate 
to me or this board in what we do,” 
Lakernick said.  

Director Jeff Heavner echoed the 
vice president’s sentiments. He main-
tained that everyone is entitled to 
their own opinion, as “we live in a 
free world.”  

Treasurer Monica Rakowski took 
it one step further. “Far too much cre-
dence is given to Facebook accounts,” 
she said. “We have things in place 
with our election process that should 

not allow any one 
individual to af-
fect the outcome 
of it.”  

Jacobs con-
sented everyone 
is allowed to voice 
their perspec-
tives. However, 

he said, as there was no disagreement 
that the social media page contains 
vile commentary, it points to the con-
flict of interest Ransdell’s online pres-
ence presents for his role as the 
Elections Committee chairman.  

Board President Rick Farr argued 
that any bias is a non-issue because 
the advisory group has laid out the 
voting and ballot deadlines before the 
appointment, and the election is to be 
outsourced to the Pittsburgh-based 
MK Election Services.  

Elections Committee board liaison 
John Latham also endorsed the ap-
pointment. ”I 100% support Steve as 
a chairman,” he said.  

OPA residents Cheryl Jacob and 
Patrick Lehnerd were also approved 
for their first elections committee 
term.  

The next Ocean Pines Board of Di-
rectors meeting is scheduled for Sat-
urday, July 20, at 9 a.m. in the 
Clubhouse Meeting Room.

OPA director expressees 
conflict of interest concerns 
about social media posts
By Tara Fischer 
Staff Writer

‘It is apparent to me that this is a 

potential conflict of interest 

between his own views and the 

need for us to hold an election …’ 

Director Steve Jacobs
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SUBMITTED RENDERING/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 
Members of the Berlin Planning Commission reviewed conceptual plans, which are pictured, for a structure at the corner of Bay and Jefferson streets at their June 12 meeting.

Buzz Meadery owners eye site development 

(June 20, 2024) The Berlin Plan-
ning Commission heard concept site 
plans last week for a potential home 
for the Buzz Meadery and a new of-
fice building on South Main Street.  

Business owners Brett and Megan 
Hines are proposing a permanent 
Buzz Meadery location. If the project 
is successful, the proposed building 
will be constructed between Jefferson 
and Gay streets on a triangular lot 
where a home once sat years ago. The 
private property has been used re-
cently as a community gathering 
spot.  

Megan Hines outlined her vision for 
the space for the planning commission. 

“We are thinking of it as a home 
for the Buzz Meadery, as well as Jun 
and Juice,” she said. “The Jun and 
Juice on Pitt Street is very small, and 
we would like to expand our seating.” 

The rough idea is that the establish-
ment would open at 8 a.m. each day 
and close in the early evening hours. 

The Buzz Meadery, classified as a 
winery and a brewery based on state 
and federal determinations, will han-
dle production onsite. 

“There is very little waste,” Megan 
Hines said, addressing commission 
concerns. “We just take honey and add 
it to water … Production causes no 
noise. Residents would never notice.”  

The site plans outline compro-
mises that the builders must comply 
with when construction begins. Ac-
cording to Planning and Zoning Con-
sultant Rick Baldwin, the sidewalks 
must meet the town’s standards.  

“… sidewalks constructed in areas 
where no sidewalk exists or has ex-
isted previously shall be a minimum of 
five feet in width having a one-fourth-
inch expansion joint between curb and 
sidewalk…,” the bylaws state.  

Additionally, parking and loading 
spaces must be set back at a mini-
mum of 25 feet from the street or lot 
line, and buildings must be set back 
at least 15 feet.  

The concept specifies that the pro-

posed design is to “complement late 
19th century, early 20th-century ar-
chitecture of Berlin’s historic district 
to include a color pallet and materials 
consistent or complementary of 
buildings in Berlin’s historic district.”  

The planning commission had no 
objections to the concept. 

“I have not met anyone that has 
expressed opposition to the economic 
activity the Hines are presenting,” 
Baldwin said. “We are just trying to 
get to a building footprint that is sta-

ble so we may move forward.”  
The business owners are hopeful 

that with consensus from the town’s 
historic district commission, the plan-
ning commission, and the board of ap-
peals, the project will get off the ground.  

The group also heard a concept re-
view for a new office building at 513 
South Main Street owned by Jennifer 
Lynch. According to project presenter 
Patrick Vorsteg, the plan is to add a 
detached building behind the current 
site, an accounting space, as offices. 

A stormwater management facility 
would go behind the new structure.  

Vorsteg said that developers must 
first conduct a soil analysis and a to-
pography survey to build the 
stormwater management feature.  

The commissioners approved the 
initiative and urged Vorsteg to inform 
them of potential landscaping at the 
site when he “got the general gist.”  

The town’s planning commission 
is scheduled to meet again on 
Wednesday, July 10, at 5:30 p.m. 

By Tara Fischer 
Staff Writer
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(June 21, 2024) Ocean Pines Asso-
ciation General Manager John Viola 
and his team provided their monthly 
report on current community initia-
tives and assured homeowners that 
amenities remain profitable at the 
Saturday, June 15 meeting of the 
Board of Directors.   

The Yacht Club Tiki Bar expansion 
was officially unveiled just before Me-
morial Day Weekend. Since its grand 
opening, Viola maintained that the 
additions have had a profitable im-
pact on the community. 

“I have been to the Tiki Bar on the 
aquatics and Yacht Club sides,” he 
said. “It is enhanced … the feedback 
is so positive. The original Tiki Bar 
needed a lot of renovations, more 
than I thought.”  

Recreation and Parks Director 
Debbie Donahue updated residents 
about ongoings at the skateboard 
park. Donahue said the person who 
built the ramp is expected to provide 
an assessment in the coming months. 
The Public Works Department has 
scheduled repairs, particularly for 
structural cracks and a power wash is 
anticipated.  

Unfortunately, despite skaters’ re-
quests for benches, the association 
has opted against seating installation. 
Donahue said that these types of ac-
commodations have been continu-
ously damaged and the community 
cannot justify wasting thousands of 
dollars on frequent replacements. 
Hidden cameras, often monitored by 
recreation and parks staff, have been 
positioned to deter vandalism.  

Viola said the soft shoreline proj-
ect to reduce erosion at the South 
Gate Pond is on schedule. The asso-
ciation is collaborating with the 
Maryland Coastal Bays Program on 
the project, and they have received a 
grant for $150,000. Of the funds, 
$50,000 has been allocated for site 
work. 

The initiative addresses water 
quality, shoreline erosion, parking lot 
issues, pond edge wetlands, and fish-
ing access.  

“We are going to enhance the fish-
ing experience,” the general manager 
said.  

Viola updated the community on 
maintenance efforts. Showers have 
been repaired at the Ocean Pines 
Beach Club, aquatics officials have 

conducted daily safety inspections, 
and playground equipment at Bain-
bridge and Bridgewater parks is to be 
power washed to remove oxidation.  

To beautify the neighborhood, 
Public Works has placed summer 
flowers throughout Ocean Pines and 
replaced the banners at the north and 
south entrances. 

According to Viola, the marina has 
received the Clean Marina Award 
from the Department of Natural Re-
sources. Additional merchandise has 
also been added, including fishing 
tackle, shirts, and retail items like 
snacks, ice cream, and beverages.  

The OPA general manager noted 
that the marina’s total fuel sales for 
May totaled $79,041.  

The golf course’s maintenance is 
on track, including repairs to leaks in 
the old irrigation system. For 2024, 
the amenity has secured $271,000 in 
profits, not including memberships.   

“The golf course is the economic 
powerhouse driving this engine of 
Ocean Pines,” Viola said.  

Memberships for all amenities, 
sans tennis, have increased from last 
year.  

Viola assured that the community 
“has a good product, and the num-
bers show it.”  

Director of Business Administra-
tion Linda Martin said that the rac-
quet sports center has seen an uptick 
in pickleball and tennis players over 
the past month and that there have 
been several days where all the courts 
were in use.  

The director reminded residents of 
the seventh annual Pink Ribbon Pick-
leball Round Robin on Friday, Octo-
ber 4. The entry fee is $40 per person.  

As for the aquatics department, 
Martin said that the lifeguards are 
fully staffed for the first time since 
the COVID-19 pandemic, and new 
flooring at the splash pad was in-
stalled at Swim and Racquet on June 
4.  

Board President Rick Farr pro-
vided a financial update.  

“A few months ago, John Viola and 
I had an opportunity to go in front of 
the County Council, requesting funds 
for Ocean Pines,” he said.  “I am 
happy to report that the county has 
given us for our police department 
$550,000. As for recreation, we have 
received $20,000; for the fire depart-
ment, we have received $51,000. For 
our roads, we have received 
$195,000.”  

The following OPA Board of Direc-
tors meeting is scheduled for Satur-
day, July 20, at 9 a.m. in the 
Clubhouse Meeting Room. 

Pines amenities continuing 
their revenue-positive run 
Yacht Club Tiki Bar addition 
earns solid returns in terms 
of public approval, revenue

By Tara Fischer 
Staff Writer
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Virginia company awarded    
bulkhead replacement work

(June 20, 2024) Ocean Pines As-
sociation General Manager John 
Viola and the Board of Directors ap-
proved spending for bulkhead re-
placement, two new police 
department vehicles and the historic 
task group.  

For the upcoming bulkhead re-
placement initiative, the association 
received bids from Fisher Marine 
Construction of Chincoteague, Va. for 
$900,000, Ben’s Marine Construc-
tion of Berlin for $1.2 million, and 
Ocean Pines Newport Bay Construc-
tion for $1.15 million. 

The OPA board unanimously ap-
proved hiring contractor Fisher Ma-
rine Construction for the 2024-2025 
bulkhead replacements. According to 
the business’s proposal, the company 
will “furnish labor and materials to 
construct new vinyl bulkhead as de-
signed by Vista Engineers.”  

The board also unanimously ap-
proved the staff recommendation of 
$88,000 for Hertrich Fleet Services 
for two Dodge Durango police cruis-
ers. A total of $132,400 will be spent 
to include the expenditures of radios, 
computers, emergency equipment, 
and lettering.  

Director Jeff Heavner expressed 
his appreciation to Viola for the vehi-
cle acquisition.  

“I just want to say the moderniza-
tion of our police force is awesome,” 
he said.  

Aside from capital requestions, 
the board unanimously approved 
providing $2,500 to the newly 
formed historic task group. The com-
mittee was created with support 
from director Elaine Brady so that 
the knowledge of Ocean Pines’ past 
remains intact.  

The funds will be used to print 200 
copies of History of Ocean Pines, 
Maryland, a book written by the late 
Bud Rogner, which will be resold to 
residents for $20 each.  

The publication is expected to be a 
5x7 spiraled edition of the commu-
nity’s history. According to Brady, the 
stories go up to 1998. 

“[The book] has all of the early 
history,” the director said. “We don’t 
want to lose that. We want to get ap-
proval…Bud worked very hard to 
pull all that history and the facts to-
gether, so I would like to see that live 
on.”  

While the book was not copy-
righted, the task group has reached 
out to Rogner’s family for approval. 

By Tara Fischer 
Staff Writer
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(June 20, 2024) A second arrest has 
been made as part of an ongoing child 
abuse investigation at a local day care.  

A former employee of the Berlin 
Activities Depot, Catherine Deutsch, 
32, of Ocean Pines, was arrested June 
11 on 15 charges – 11 charges of fail-
ure to report child abuse/neglect and 
four charges of neglect of a minor.  

Deutsch reportedly worked in the 
same infant classroom as Heather 
Ward, 40, of Berlin, who was indicted 
in late March by a county grand jury 
on 90 charges, including 10 felony 

child abuse charges related to nine 
children under her supervision.  

The charges were filed earlier this 
year after the Worcester County 
Sheriff’s Office and Child Protective 
Services were informed last Novem-
ber an eight-month-old had been ad-
mitted to Atlantic General Hospital 
with a broken tibia.  

“During the investigation, it was 
determined that the injured child was 
an attendee of the Berlin Education 
Station Childcare Center,” a release 
from the Worcester County Sheriff’s 
Office Bureau of Investigation read in 
March. “Video surveillance footage 
from the child’s classroom revealed 
actions by an employee identified as 
Heather Ward that appeared to cause 
the injuries to the child. The video 
footage additionally revealed other 

concerning interactions with several 
other children under her care.” 

In a statement issued in response to 
request for comment after Deutsch’s 
arrest, Berlin Activities Depot 
owner/operator Carmella Solito con-
tinued to express her disgust over the 
events that allegedly transpired inside 
her facility. Solito has been blunt with 
her outrage over Ward’s case and this 
week issued a similar comment about 
Deutsch’s charges.  

"I am outraged by the allegations 
against this former employee,” the 
statement read. “Neglect of a minor 
and failing to report suspected child 
abuse are unacceptable and go 
against everything Berlin Activities 
Depot stands for. We have zero toler-
ance for any action that jeopardizes 
the safety and wellbeing of children 

in our care. Protecting children must 
be our highest calling as childcare 
providers and as members of this 
community. I am devastated that an 
employee may have violated the sa-
cred trust families place in us. We are 
committed to upholding the highest 
standards to ensure parents feel com-
pletely confident their children are in 
a safe, secure, and nurturing environ-
ment at all times." 

Solito said her business remains 
committed to assisting police investi-
gating the case, saying, “I commend the 
tireless efforts of law enforcement in in-
vestigating these disturbing allegations. 
We will continue to fully assist their on-
going investigation in any way we can.” 

An initial appearance for Deutsch 
in Worcester County Circuit Court is 
scheduled for July 3.  
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Second woman charged in child abuse probe
Pines resident facing 15 
counts for failure to report 
observed neglect of minor

By Steve Green 
Executive Editor

(June 20, 2024) A plea agreement 

that would have ended the case of a 
former Stephen Decatur High School 
music teacher who admitted 33 years 
ago to having a sexual relationship 
with one of his students came to an 
altogether different end in Circuit 
Court in Snow Hill on Tuesday. 

The case, which has been working 

its way through the courts since last 
fall, was dismissed after a motion by 
Assistant State’s Attorney Pamela 
Correa to reduce the charges against 
Ronald Davis, 64, was denied by Cir-
cuit Court Judge Beau Oglesby be-
cause of a conflict with the statute of 
limitations. 

Davis, who left Worcester schools 
for a similar job in Somerset County 
after confessing to his supervisor late 
in the 1991-92 school year that he had 
an inappropriate relationship with a 
17-year-old female student, was ini-
tially charged with felony child abuse. 

In court on Tuesday, Correa told 

Former SDHS teacher’s charges dismissed
Motion to reduce charges 
denied due to conflict with 
statute of limitations rules

By Stewart Dobson 
Editor
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the court Davis was prepared to plead 
guilty if the state could amend the 
charges to a misdemeanor violation 
of the state education law regarding 
school security and sex offenses. 

Oglesby, noting that he had con-
sidered that possibility over the 
weekend, said he could not do for the 
prosecution and defense what they 
could not do themselves — lower the 
charges to a misdemeanor offense 
without triggering a conflict with the 
statute of limitations. 

“You’re asking me to grant a mo-
tion to do something that can’t be 
done,” the judge said. 

Oglesby said the state’s judicial 
proceedings code makes clear that 
misdemeanors must be prosecuted 
within a year of the offense having oc-
curred, while this series of incidents 
took place more than 30 years ago. 
That circumstance rendered the mo-
tion unworkable, he said. 

Although Correa, with the support 
of defense attorney John Phoebus, 
countered that the defendant would 
waive the protections the statute of 
limitations afforded him, Oglesby 
said the law was clear on its face and 
denied the motion. 

A subsequent closed-door confer-
ence between the prosecution and de-
fense produced no way around that 
decision, leading the state to dismiss 
the criminal indictment against Davis. 

Phoebus said Tuesday that the 
state’s attorney’s office has said it in-
tends to recharge Davis and will now 
have to decide whether to seek a 
grand jury indictment or to file its 
own formal charges via what’s known 
as a “criminal information.” 

The circuitous route to the case’s 
dismissal reflects the indirect route 
that led it to the circuit court docket 
this year. 

According to the charging docu-

ments, consensual sexual activity be-
tween the defendant and victim 
began when the latter was a high 
school senior and a student of Davis, 
even though both later admitted 
knowing it was wrong. 

Davis eventually confessed his in-
volvement in an inappropriate rela-
tionship to his supervisor, telling 
then-Vice Principal Lou Taylor, “He 
couldn’t live with himself” because of 
it, investigators reported. 

Taylor relayed the substance of 
that conversation up the school sys-
tem chain of command. Davis then 
resigned and took a similar job in the 
Somerset County school system, the 
charging documents reported. 

The student-teacher affair led to 
victim to three rounds of therapy over 
the years because of depression and 
nightmares about Davis, she told in-
vestigators, until she realized that 
consensual or not, the relationship 
constituted abuse. 

The charging documents state that 
she revealed the situation to an indi-
vidual in the office of Child and Youth 

Protection of the Archdiocese of Bal-
timore, which then alerted the 
Worcester County Sheriff’s office. Its 
investigation began last October. 

Davis was formally charged with 
assault and child abuse by a person in 
a custodial role in November, with 

the case placed on the circuit court 
docket in December. 

The state’s attorney’s office could 
not comment on its plans or how it 
might proceed, because even though 
the case was dismissed, it is still tech-
nically pending. 

Attorney expects charges to be refiled soon

TARA FISCHER/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 

TEACH A KID TO FISH 
The skies were clear and the attendance was solid at last weekend’s Teach A Kid To Fish Day, hosted by the Ocean Pines Anglers Club.
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(June 20, 2024) Worcester County 
is continuing to push back on a state 
initiative to shift more health depart-
ment funding to local governments.  

Currently, the Worcester County 
Health Department receives 
$5,015,910 in funding from the 
county. A shift in the local share 
match requirement for fiscal year 
2025 will increase that to 
$11,022,108. In a letter dated June 18 
to Maryland Public Health Services 
Deputy Secretary Nilesh Kalyanara-
man, County Commission President 
Chip Bertino called the 119% spike “a 

financial hardship” for the county. 
The letter reads, “The significant in-
crease compounds the financial bur-
den for Worcester County, where 
officials had to eliminate a 
$10,116,174 shortfall to balance the 
county’s FY25 budget. Reductions 
were made throughout the budget, 
with cuts in education and public 
safety, among other departments.” 

Instead of passing on this major 
funding change, the county is asking 
the state to not enforce the increased 
funding burden this year. Worcester 
County Health Officer Becky Jones 
said the CORE funding match in-
creases the county’s funding share of 
the department budget to 73%, which 
is the second highest percentage in 
the state behind Prince George’s 
County. The match is derived from 
property values. 

“There is nothing in COMAR that 
binds any of us to this required 
match,” Jones told the commission-
ers at Tuesday’s meeting. “Just as a 
reminder, we are second highest in 
the state at 73%. We are not saying 
the counties shouldn’t contribute 
something, but this is a lot. We want 
it to be more reflective of our county 
and we don’t think second highest in 
the state is not reflective.” 

In February before the commis-
sioners, Jones expressed her dismay 
with property values driving the 
equation. “Is property value really the 
best representation of our county as 
a whole or are there other metrics 
that should be looked at to define and 
determine what each individual 
county should be responsible for 
their match?” she said. “These are 
questions we have posed to the state.” 

During this week’s meeting, 
Bertino said, “There is no equation or 
formula that substantiates this in-
crease that has been hoisted upon us 
by the state.” 

Bertino’s letter to the state contin-
ues, “… The Worcester County Com-
missioners continue to advocate for a 

review of the currently required 
CORE Funding match. It is our un-
derstanding that the SFY25 budget 
bill requires Maryland Department of 
Health and the Department of Budget 
and Management to submit a report 
to the budget committees on the 
CORE Public Health Services funding 
formula to include recommendations 
to adjust the Local Share Match cal-
culation. We support this work and 
look forward to the committee’s find-
ings. In the absence of a defined 
match formula, we request that the 
State hold Worcester County harm-
less of the proposed increase and 
grant a continuation of our agreed 
upon FY24 match. ...” 

County Chief Administrative Offi-
cer Weston Young said the county is 
seeking an adjustment through 
Bertino’s letter because the burden 
on the county is significant. Young 
expects to know by November of the 
adjustment request.  

After a motion by Commissioner 
Eric Fiori and a second by Ted Elder, 
the commissioners voted 6-0 to seek 
an adjustment with Joe Mitrecic ab-
sent.  
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(June 20, 2024) An agreement has 
been made to provide some county 
inmates with naloxone upon their re-
lease. 

Before the Worcester County Com-
missioners this week was a request to 
create a Memorandum of Under-
standing between the county and the 
Worcester County Health Department 
allowing for the Worcester County Jail 
to be provided naloxone by the health 
department to disburse to “at-risk in-
mates” upon their release.  

The commissioners unanimously 
approved (with Commissioner Joe 
Mitrecic absent) the matter without 
discussion at the June 18 meeting as 
part of its consent agenda. The re-
quest allows the county to meet the 
upcoming deadline outlined in the 
STOP Act of 2022 (Statewide Tar-

geted Overdose Response). 
In his letter included in the county 

meeting packet, Worcester County 
Jail Warden Timothy Mulligan said, 
“The STOP Act of 2022 requires cer-
tain providers to offer naloxone to 
people at risk of witnessing or expe-
riencing an overdose.”  

The Maryland General Assembly 
approved the STOP Act of 2022. The 
fiscal and policy note of the bill read, 
“By June 30, 2024, a community 
services program that provides spec-
ified services, a State correctional fa-
cility, a local correctional facility, and 
the Division of Parole and Probation 
must likewise have a protocol to offer 
FDA-approved opioid overdose re-
versal drugs, free of charge, to indi-
viduals with an opioid use disorder 
(OUD) or who are at risk of experi-
encing a drug overdose when the in-
dividual receives services or is 
released from a facility (as appropri-
ate). However, these entities may 
only provide the reversal drugs if 
MDH provides them with the speci-
fied drugs.” 

Shift in health funding questioned again
Major change in local share  
formula would require $6M  
more from Worcester Co. 

Agreement would provide     
naloxone for some inmates 
MOU with county health 
department meets STOP 
Act of 2022 regulation

By Steve Green 
Executive Editor

By Steve Green 
Executive Editor

e Cl
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NOW OPEN 

SELBYVILLE 
Open 11a.m. Every Day 

Sunday: 25% OFF Entrees 
Monday: 25% OFF Pizza 

Tuesday: 25% OFF Hand Pattied Brisket Burgers 
Wednesday: 25% OFF Cheesesteaks 
Thursday: 25% OFF BBQ Sandwiches 

Friday: 25% OFF Crushes 
Saturday: 25% OFF Margaritas

DAILY SPECIALS 3-8P.M. DAILY 
(Selbyville Location Only)

Full Service Catering Available

HAPPY HOUR 12-3P.M. DAILY

. . . . . . . . . . . . $3 DOMESTICS • $3 RAILS . . . . . . . . . . . .

Wings • 1/2 lb. Ribs • Onion Rings • Chili • Candied Bacon  
Bacon Wrapped Scallops • Nachos (Pork/Beef/Chicken) • BBQ Sliders  

Chili Mac • Steamed Shrimp • Seafood Quesadilla 
Quesadilla (Pork/Beef/Chicken) • Gravy Fries • Loaded Fries

38223 Dupont BLVD., Selbyville, DE • 302-988-2220 • pitandpub.com

. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1/2 PRICE APPETIZERS . . . . . . . . . . . . . .

PUB GRUB TO GO

#1: 50 Wings, 3 Sides, 4 Cornbreads 

#2: 2 Half BBQ Chickens, 3 Sides 
      4 Cornbreads 

#3: 2 lb. Ribs, 4 Sides, 6 Cornbreads 

#4: 3 lb. Ribs, 5 Sides, 8 Cornbreds 

#5: 1 lb. Ribs & 2 Half BBQ Chickens 
      4 Sides, 6 Cornbreads

#6: 2 lb. Of Your Choice: Brisket, 
Ribs, Pulled Pork Or Pulled Chicken, 
4 Sides, 12 Slider Rolls 

#7: PUB GRUB DELUXE, 1 lb. Each: 
Pork, Brisket, Pulled Chicken, 2 lb. 
Ribs, 2 Half BBQ Chickens, 5 Sides, 
12 Cornbreads

LOCALS’ FAVORITE

— No Substitutions Please —



(June 20, 2024) Friends and family 
honored Bruce Moore with a brick 
dedication and ceremony at the 
Worcester County Veterans Memorial 
in Ocean Pines on Tuesday. 

Moore, who passed away in June 
2023, was originally from Laurel, 
Delaware. After graduating from the 
University of Delaware, he was com-
missioned as a second lieutenant in the 
U.S. Army and stationed throughout 
the country. During this time, Moore 
took courses at Clemson University 
and the University of Maryland.  

Reverend George Patterson at-
tended the June 18 ceremony to say a 
few words about the former Army cap-
tain who made a name for himself in 
Ocean City as a real estate broker. The 
pair met in 1992 when the faith leader 
was appointed to serve the Atlantic 
United Methodist Church and became 
one of his “dearest and most cherished 
friends.”  

“I remember his great love for his 
family,” Patterson said. “… As I was re-
flecting on my favorite memory of 
Bruce, it was something he taught me. 
You grow up … in an environment 
where we tell our parents and siblings 
… that we love them. I had never been 
around anyone other than family who 
told me that they loved me. Bruce 
taught me to express my love for my 
friends as well. I thank God today for 
Bruce, for his light.”  

After retiring from the military, 
Moore dedicated his time to the com-
munity. Moore was a former Ocean 
City Paramedics Foundation presi-
dent, a member of the Worcester 
Preparatory School Board of Trustees, 

served on the boards for the Commu-
nity Foundation of the Eastern Shore 
and the Ambassadors for Beebe 
Healthcare and was a volunteer for 
Meals on Wheels. 

Additionally, the military vet 
founded Moore, Warfield and Glick 
Realtors in 1981 with partners Hal 
Glick and Bob Warfield. He also served 
as president of the Ocean City Board of 
Realtors.  

At the event, a brick was placed at 
the existing memorial in Moore’s 
honor.  

The Worcester County Veterans 
Memorial, which pays tribute to each 
branch of the armed forces, broke 
ground on Veterans Day in 2004. 
Since then, it has welcomed thousands 
of visitors yearly for the site’s Memo-
rial Day event as well as students for 
annual field trips. 

“The bricks and pavers tell the 
story,” Veterans Memorial Foundation 
President Marie Gilmore said in the 
press release. “Anyone can purchase a 
brick for $75, and it’s inscribed with 
the name of someone who has served, 
or a paver for $150, which allows four 
lines of information.” 

(June 20, 2024) Ocean Pines As-
sociation Senior Executive Office 
Manager Linda Martin has been pro-
moted to director of business admin-
istration. 

“In her new role, Linda will oper-
ate as the chief of staff for the GM of-
fice,” Viola said in a news release. 
“Please join me in congratulating 
Linda and wishing her well in this 
new role.” 

Born and raised on the western 
shore of Maryland, Martin majored 

in accounting at Anne 
Arundel Community 
College and has held a 
variety of financial-
related jobs in gov-
ernment, retail, 
medical and commu-
nity-based organiza-
tions.  

Martin moved to the Eastern Shore 
in 2006 and worked for the Public 
Works/CPI Department from 2006-17 
as an office coordinator. Viola re-
cruited Martin to return to Ocean 
Pines as the Public Works office man-
ager in 2021, and she later transi-
tioned to the general manager’s office 
as the senior executive office manager. 

In May, Martin obtained a degree 
in business administration from 

Southern New Hampshire University 
and received the President’s Award 
for maintaining a 4.0 grade point av-
erage. 

“I would like to thank John Viola 
for all the opportunities that he has 
provided me since I returned to 
Ocean Pines almost four years ago,” 
Martin said in the release. “He in-
spired me to return to school to ob-
tain my degree, and I am very 
appreciative of his support.” 

Viola said by investing in the pro-
fessional growth and development of 
its staff, OPA aims to continue pro-
viding results in customer service to 
the community. 

“Recognizing our staff continues to 
be one of my favorite parts of the 
job,” Viola said. 
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Bruce Moore honored with memorial brick
Long-time resort Realtor, 
Army veteran, remembered 
for his civic involvement
By Tara Fischer 
Staff Writer

Martin promoted to chief-of-staff

Linda Martin

TARA FISCHER/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 
A memorial brick bearing the name of Bruce Moore, an Army veteran and long-time local Realtor, 

takes its place among the others at the Worcester County Veterans Memorial in Ocean Pines.

QUALITY MEANS DOING IT JUST-RITE

JUST-RITE MARINE INC. 
410-641-9961 • JUSTRITEMARINEINC.COM 

MIKE@JUSTRITEMARINE.COM 
MD MARINE 083(E) • MHIC 71561 • OC 30542 • DE 2019101403

JUST-RITE MARINE INC. 
410-641-9961 • JUSTRITEMARINEINC.COM 

MIKE@JUSTRITEMARINE.COM 
MD MARINE 083(E) • MHIC 71561 • OC 30542 • DE 2019101403

VINYL BULKHEADS 
RIP-RAP PIERS • DOCKS 

BOATLIFT PILING • DREDGING 
SKID STEER SERVICES

NOW HIRING 
CARPENTER/LABORER
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Volunteer group 
breaks ground on 
library projects

(June 20, 2024) The Friends of the 
Ocean Pines Library, a volunteer group 
dedicated to supporting the media cen-
ter, has broken ground on a new out-
door learning and presentation patio.  

According to FOPL President Jim 
Meckley, the discussion for the initia-
tive began approximately two years ago 
when dying trees at the back of the 
property were cut down. The volunteer 
leader and the Ocean Pines Library 
Manager, Harry Burkett, wanted to use 
the empty space for an inviting 
amenity. The thought flourished to cre-
ate what will now be an outside learn-
ing space.  

“There is a wall around the back 
where people can sit and then a pres-
entation area at the front,” Meckley ex-
plained. “The kids will use it more than 
anybody. Kids like to be outside. We 
will have concerts, lectures, and when 
we get a cover, it can be used even 
more. It will be used for a lot of differ-
ent programs.”  

The president maintained that the 
project will be rolled out in three 
phases. The first part, the learning cen-
ter, is being worked on now. Over the 
next two years, the volunteer group 

plans to add a cover for particularly 
stormy or hot days and finalize land-
scaping.  

The patio cost $53,000. However, 
Meckley said that fundraising efforts 
paid for the entire project.  

The branch’s annual book sale gen-
erated many of the proceeds. The 
FOPL president said the event sells 
roughly $25,000 of books each year, 
which generates $10,000 to $13,000.  

Books are priced at $2.50 or less. 
There is also a “specials room” where 
signed and rare editions can be pur-

chased for anywhere from $3 to $400. 
This sale section is located across from 
the facility’s main meeting room.  

This year, the book sale is scheduled 
for Friday, July 26, Saturday, July 27, 
and Monday, July 29. Items not sold on 
the last day will be marked half-price.  

“We are a very unique library,” 
Meckley said. “We are the only one 
with a book sale of that massive 
amount.”  

The FOPL also sells donated books 
on Amazon. Since setting up the ac-
count in 2017, the group has garnered 

$80,000.  
The Friends of the Ocean Pines Li-

brary are dedicated to supporting the 
branch. Volunteers help staff with 
shelving, inform patrons when books 
they put on hold have arrived, and per-
form other administrative tasks. Addi-
tionally, the group has secured an 
audio and visual sound system for the 
meeting room and purchased laptop-
charging-supported tables.  

“FOPL is entirely a volunteer 
group,” the president said. “…It really 
is a helping hand for the library.” 

By Tara Fischer 
Staff Writer

SUBMITTED PHOTO/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 
Pictured, from left, are Jack Duffy, FOPL Treasurer; Vicki O’Mara, Worcester Co. Library Board trustee; Eileen Leonhart, FOPL member at large; Beverly 

Castner, FOPL vice president; Sharon Puser, FOPL member at large; Jim Meckley, FOPL president; Jackie Choate, FOPL recording secretary; Jennifer 

Ranck, Worcester County Library administrator; Mary Gernhardt, FOPL corresponding secretary; Carol Rose, Worcester County Library Foundation 

member; Harry Burkett, OP Library manager; and Donna Main, Worcerster County Library Foundation member.
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landscaping 
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302-337-3346

Serving Maryland and Delaware  
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Are You Ready 
For YOUR Future?

Classes NOW 
Forming
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• Master Barbering
• Teacher Training
• Aesthetics
• Manicuring
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dermalogica®
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Skin, Hair & All Services
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Pedicures

Southern Delaware’s 
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PHOTO COURTESY WORCESTER PREPARATORY SCHOOL 
Members of Worcester Preparatory School’s Class of 2024 is pictured. A total of 37 seniors 

graduated on May 24. Worcester Prep School sees  
37 graduate in Class of ’24

(June 6, 2024) On May 24, 37 
Worcester Preparatory School gradu-
ates officially became alumni. 

According to a news release, the 
class received over $7.2 million in 
merit scholarship offers and will go 
on to attend 28 colleges and univer-
sities this fall. 

During the ceremony, Head of 
School John McDonald announced 
the Top Senior Award recipients as 
Valedictorian Vanessa Hall; Salutato-
rian Isabella Huber; and Best All-
Round Student Claire Windrow. 

Hall, who is a member of the Cum 
Laude Society, National Honor Soci-
ety, and the Spanish National Honor 
Society, will attend Stanford Univer-

sity and plans to study aerospace en-
gineering. 

Huber, who is a member of the 
Cum Laude Society, National Honor 
Society, Spanish National Honor So-
ciety, Art Honor Society, will attend 
Johns Hopkins University and plans 
to study neuroscience. 

Windrow is the 2023-24 SGA 
president, is a member of the Na-
tional Honor Society and Spanish 
Honor Society, and editor of the year-
book and newspaper. She will attend 
the University of Georgia and plans to 
study biology. 

Sen. Mary Beth Carozza (R-38C), 
presented Koda Bauer and Ava 
Conaway with Maryland Senatorial 
Scholarships, and, on behalf of Del. 
Wayne Hartman (R-38), 
presented Ava Conaway with a Mary-
land House of Delegates Scholarship. 

The Class of 2024 had a total of 37 

Hall named valedictorian, 
Huber salutatorian, major 
scholarships also awarded

CEDAR SWAMP FARM & GREENHOUSES
9211 Morris Road • Bishopville, MD 21813

Phone 410.352.5370

You’ll be pleasantly surprised by our prices.
1 Acre • Family Owned • Greenhouse Open to the Public

Directions from Selbyville: Turn on Hosier St. Ext. (Next to Arby’s). Follow to stop sign,
turn right on Morris Rd. Greenhouses approximately 3/4 mile on right.

SUMMER HOURS
Tuesday – Saturday  8:30 – 3:00

CLOSED Sunday & Monday
1 mile west of Rt. 113 on the MD/DE line near Selbyville

Why pay BEACH prices?
We have Roses, Hydrangeas, Crape Myrtles,

Annuals, Perennials, Vegetable & Herbs
Family Owned & Operated since 1985

12417 Ocean Gateway, Suite 20, Herring Creek Professional Ctr. 
West Ocean City

Open Tues – Fri 10am 5pm & Sat Call for Hours• 410 213 8266

Original Paintings, Photographs & Art Prints 
by Local Artists Make Great Gifts!

Quality Custom Picture Framing 
Fair Prices ALWAYS! 

Shop and Compare!•Personal Attention to Detail  
Wood Mouldings • Conservation Framing • Archival Mats • UV Glass 

The Framing Corner



seniors, 11 of whom entered the class 
in either pre-k or kindergarten. There 
were seven legacy students, defined 
as children of WPS alumni, and grad-
uates will attend 28 colleges and uni-
versities in the fall.  

College enrollments include 
schools in 16 states and the District of 
Columbia.  

Some of the colleges the graduates 
will attend include Carnegie Mellon 
University, College of Charleston, 
Georgetown University, the Univer-
sity of Georgia, Johns Hopkins Uni-
versity, the University of Maryland, 
Miami University Ohio, Northeast-
ern University, Sewanee: The Uni-
versity of the South, Stanford 
University, the United States Naval 
Academy, Vanderbilt University, and 
Virginia Tech 

During the commencement, local 

scholarships were also awarded.  
Two American Legion Scholar-

ships were given to William Mumford 
and Isabella Huber. 

Ocean Pines Golf Member’s Coun-
cil Scholarships went to Koda Bauer, 
Adam Hafez, Vanessa Hall, Carson 
Rayne and Claire Windrow. 

Ravens Roost Scholarships were 
awarded to Esi Mehilli and Vanessa 
Hall a Berlin Little League Scholar-
ship was given to Connor Ferguson; 
and the Ocean City Marlin Club 
Franky Pettolina Memorial Scholar-
ship was awarded to Claire Windrow.
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Colleges in 16 states selected

PHOTOS COURTESY WORCESTER PREPARATORY SCHOOL 
Senior Vanessa Hall is named valedictorian by Head of School John McDonald. 

Senior Isabella Huber is named salutatorian by Head of School John McDonald.

Senior Claire Windrow receives the award for best all-round student from Head of School John 

McDonald.
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Snapshots

PHOTOS COURTESY WORCESTER PREPARATORY SCHOOL  

BREAD SALE 
Worcester Preparatory School teachers Annie Seipp, Hannah Purnell, Alexis Absher, Maureen Raines, and their students, hosted this year’s third grade bread sale as part of a hands-on learning lesson 
combining English, science, social studies (civics and community), mathematics and philanthropy.  The project is modeled like a small business, with the young entrepreneurs baking bread and donating 
the proceeds to charity. [Aboce] Students from Seipp’s third grade class take a break from the bread sale to take a picture with Head of School John McDonald and Head of Lower School Sara Timmons. 

Students Zia Salem, Ellie Bookwalter, Emery Anthony and Adee Carmean took turns serving bread 
to guests.

Third grader Hristina Gjoni checks in with her table of second-grade guests, Palmer Hammonds, 
Carson Kenton, Estella Roberts and Michael Havhannisyan.

SUBMITTED PHOTO/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 

OFFICER INSTALLATION 
The General Levin Winder Chapter of the Daughters of the American Revolution (DAR) installed its 
2024-25 officers during a recent luncheon. Sharon Moak was installed as the chapter’s new regent 
by Maryland DAR State Editor Pat Arata. Other officers installed were Chaplain Barbara Rusko, 
Treasurer Cynthia Mancuso, Registrar Gail Weldin, Historian Jane Bunting, and Elected Special Del-
egate Christine Nanna-Lieb. Carol Wanzer was unable to attend and will be installed as recording 
secretary at a later date. Pictured, from left, at the luncheon are Arata, Moak, Rusko, Mancuso, 
Weldin, Bunting and Nanna-Lieb.

PHOTO COURTESY OCEAN CITY BERLIN OPTIMIST CLUB 

WOR-WIC SCHOLARSHIP 
Wor-Wic Community College President Deborah Casey, left, and Ocean City Berlin Optimist Club 
President Christina Dolomount-Brown award Stephen Decatur High School graduating senior 
Nicholas Hernandez Lara $1,500 to attend Wor Wic Community College. 
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 34th Annual Bathtub Races

BERLIN BATHTUB RACES 
The Berlin Chamber of Commerce’s 34th Annual Bathtub Races were held on Main Street last 

Friday, attracting thousands to the historic town to watch 20 businesses race up and down in 

search of bragging rights for the year. The event attracts locals and visitors of all ages.  
PHOTOS COURTESY GARRETT NEVILLE/BERLIN CHAMBER OF COMMERCE 
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(June 20, 2024) The 
Ocean Pines Association 
board of directors recently 
honored the legacy of two 
women who each gave three 
decades of service to the com-
munity. 

Following up on an OPA 
Board directive from April, a 
plaque was installed in the 
community center over the 
“Phyllis East Room,” honor-
ing the late executive secre-
tary who was known as a 
treasure trove of information 
about Ocean Pines.  

The room was renamed in 
her honor in 2011, but was 
widely known as “The East 
Room,” causing some confu-
sion as to whether it was sim-
ply the east-most room in the 
building.   

Another room in the com-
munity center was renamed 
for longtime volunteer Anna 
Foultz in 2019, and a plaque 
was installed at that time.  

Now, in each room, along 
with the plaques, are framed 
articles describing East’s and 
Foultz’s immense contribu-
tions to the community. 

Below is the text of each ar-
ticle: 

The Phyllis East Room 
Phyllis Clara East was the 

longtime Executive Secretary 
to the General Manager and 
Board of Directors of Ocean 
Pines. 

Born in Chateauguay, New 
York, East was the youngest of 
12 children. She met her hus-
band, James (Jim) W. East, in 
1962 and they married the 
same year. In 1980 the couple 
and their four children moved 
to the Eastern Shore of Mary-
land.  

East was hired on Sept. 8, 
1980 in the ECC Department 
as secretary to the general 
manager, at the time Art War-
ren. She was promoted to the 
position of Executive Secre-
tary in 1984 and worked 
under nine different general 
managers: Warren, Tim 
Stoner, Ralph Lashley, Tom 
Cetola, Glen Duffy, Curt Alli-
son, Dave Ferguson, Tom 
Olson, and Bob Thompson. 
She was among the first to or-
ganize, maintain and preserve 
Association records and infor-
mation.  

Ocean Pines Association 

dedicated the Phyllis East 
Room in the Community Cen-
ter in 2011, in honor of her 30 
years of service. She was 
named as a “Precious Gem” of 
Worcester County by the 
Women’s Club of Ocean Pines 
in 2010.  

In addition to their six chil-
dren, East and her husband 
spent their leisure time doting 
on their grandchildren at a 
summer residence on the 
Nanticoke River. East was a 
member of the Berlin/Ocean 
City Moose Lodge and the 
American Legion Post #123 
Women’s Auxiliary.  She en-
joyed reading, camping at 
Sandy Hill Campground, and 
spending time with family 
and friends.  

According to those who 
knew her, East had a vast 
knowledge of the history of 
Ocean Pines, and many de-
pended on her for informa-
tion – from staff, to 
volunteers, Board members, 
and people throughout the 
community.  

East passed away at her 
home on April 4, 2012.  She 
was 72 years old. 

The Anna Foultz Room 
Anna Lucarello Foultz was 

a longtime Ocean Pines resi-
dent and tireless volunteer. 

Foultz  and her late hus-
band, Carl, moved to the area 
during the 1990s. Carl was 
a World War II veteran who 
served in China, Burma and 
India, and the couple founded 
the Star Charities nonprofit in 
2007 to give back to the men 
and women of the U.S. Armed 
Forces.  

Also close to Foultz’s heart 
were the Girl Scouts, an or-
ganization she became in-
volved with after her oldest 
daughter, Betty Anne, showed 
interest as a young girl. Foultz 
became a Scout leader and 
continued to advocate for the 
organization for more than a 
half century. In 1980, Foultz 
received a National Proclama- 
tion from President Jimmy 
Carter for organizing a mas-
sive weeklong event called 
“Girl Scouts in Action” at the 
Springfield Mall in Virginia. 
Thousands of Girl Scouts at-
tended the event.   

She was also a longtime 
member and past president of 

the Sons of Italy, and in 2016 
was honored with the organi-
zation’s Ameritan Award dur-
ing a gala in Hunt Valley, 
Maryland.   

Foultz’s  memoir,  “Two 
Steps Forward,”  was pub-
lished in 2017. She co-wrote 
the book with her other 
daughter, Shirley Isbell, and 
donated much of the proceeds 
to Star Charities. 

Foultz was active up until 
her last days. She visited the 
Maryland State Capital in 
2018 and received three 
standing ovations upon being 
introduced to the Maryland 
General Assembly.  

In March of 2019 she 
toured the White House with 
a busload of local Girl Scouts. 
Foultz  then took part in 
Ocean Pines’ National Night 
Out celebration in August 
2019, again representing the 
Girl Scouts. On Aug. 16 she 
presented a $1,500 donation 
to Achilles of Maryland at 
Veterans Memorial Park in 
Ocean Pines.  

“It just breaks my heart 
when I see all these people 
suffering, and we need to 
help,” she said at the time. 
“I’m always willing to help if 
they need help!”  

Foultz passed away on 
Sept. 22, 2019. She was 93. 

Star Charities continued 
the annual “Holiday Gifts for 
Soldiers” collection for several 
years in Foultz’s honor. The 
drive was among the biggest 
endeavors of Star Charities, 
and Foultz had said collecting 
for  servicemen  and women 
made her feel closer to Carl 
and helped to honor his serv-
ice.  

Watch Anna Foultz on 
“Focus on the Pines,” circa 
2008, at 
oceanpinesforum.com/Ocean
Pines/Video/3478. 

OPA honors Phyllis East, Anna Foultz

SUBMITTED PHOTO/BAYSIDE GAZETTE 
A plaque in front of the “Phyllis East 
Room” in the Ocean Pines Commun- 
ity Center now honors the legacy of 
the longtime late executive 
secretary, who was known as a 
treasure trove of information about 
the community during her career.

As members of the Ocean Pines Association begin to re-
ceive their ballots for this year’s board of directors election, 
the two questions they will have to answer for themselves is 
whether the current board has been doing a good job and, if 
it has, can it be made even better by replacing the two incum-
bents up for reelection this year. 

In short, yes and no. 
Yes, this board has done a fine job overall. Its low-key and 

business-minded approach has served the community well. 
In its current configuration, the board’s members are  
grownups at the table. They don’t get bogged down in the 
personality clashes or operational minutiae that in the past 
have hobbled management’s ability to do its job. 

As to the second question, no, replacing Rick Farr and Jeff 
Heavner, the two incumbents seeking reelection, with two of 
the challengers would not make a good board even better. 

This is not to slight any of the challengers or to question 
their abilities, but is simply a matter of recognizing that 
transforming a good board into a superlative one is an un-
likely proposition no matter who’s running. 

Further, with the candidates’ performance last Thursday 
suggesting that they generally agree on the community’s 
goals and its direction as well as the administration’s ability 
to deliver the desired results, seeking change for the sake of 
change would be pointless at best. 

Although the board has been criticized for its frequent 
unanimity, that is more the product of business-like deliber-
ation by reasonable people than it is the absence of inde-
pendent thought. 

After all, just because people arrive at the same destina-
tion doesn’t mean they took same route to get there ... or that 
they even arrived at the same time. 

Considering how well the association has been functioning 
under its current leadership, shaking things up in the hope 
that something better will emerge is not the wisest course to 
take. It’s like betting against a sure thing in favor of a possi-
bility that probably doesn’t exist.

Return incumbents 
to board of directors
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Seabird Safaris offered through September 

(June 20, 2024) Delmarva Birding 
Weekend is teaming up with the OC 
Bay Hopper to run Sunset Seabird Sa-
faris through September.  

The cost for the two-hour cruise 
is $55/person and guests can register 
individually or in groups. Each tour 
needs a minimum of four participants 
to run and the maximum number of 
participants is 14. Tours are mostly of-
fered on Tuesday evenings, but new 
dates may be added during the sum-
mer. 

The tours will cover the bayside 
docks in Ocean City from M.R. Duck’s 
south to the inlet, and cruise by the As-
sateague jetty. From there, they will ex-
plore the bayside of Assateague Island 

south toward Castaways campground, 
then back to the harbor. The cruise will 
feature a U.S. Coast Guard-licensed 
captain and a DBW Guide. 

The OC Bay Hopper has a liquor li-
cense and cold adult beverages are 
available for purchase. Cold water is 
also available. 

The pickup location is Pier 23, lo-
cated at 12817 Harbor Road in  Ocean 
City. Those taking the tour are asked to 
park in the Pier 23 parking lot and 
should arrive at least 15 minutes before 
the scheduled trip departs. 

Trips may be canceled in the event 
of strong, gusting winds or dangerous 
weather. If a trip is canceled, partici-
pants will be notified via email 24 
hours prior to the trip departure. Full 
refunds will be provided within 15 days. 

For more information, visit 
https://delmarvabirding.com/2024-
sunset-seabird-safaris/. 

PHOTO COURTESY OF RUSS KOVACH 
Participants of a Sunset Seabird Safari from May 18 are pictured shooting photos. The bird and 

wildlife tours around the coastal bays will be offered via a partnership between Delmarva Birding 

Weekend and the OC Bay Hopper through September. 

Free turtle nest protection 
covers available to residents

(June 20, 2024) Thanks to a spon-
sorship from The Home Depot in 
Berlin, the Maryland Coastal Bays Pro-
gram is offering free turtle nest protec-
tion covers for residents who have 
witnessed turtles laying eggs on their 
properties and are interested in pro-
tecting the nests. 

June begins the nesting season for 
the Diamondback Terrapin, Mary-
land’s state reptile. Last year, MCBP 
received calls from concerned resi-
dents who had witnessed terrapins lay-
ing eggs on their properties and later, 
found the nests had been destroyed.  

One property owner reported wit-
nessing sixteen nests on his property 
predicated by crows. Crows, raccoons, 
and foxes will decimate an entire nest-
ing area.  

Terrapins are masters of concealing 
their nests to the human eye, so unless 

residents see turtles creating nests, 
they probably won’t notice them on 
their properties. But predators can 
sniff them out, or in the case of the 
crows, keep a watchful eye on a terra-
pin making a nest and when it retreats 
back to the bay, take advantage of the 
freshly laid eggs. 

With the assistance of New Jersey 
organization Project Terrapin, MCBP 
received guidance on creating simple 
protection covers for area residents 
who see nests and want to provide pro-
tection. MCBP volunteers assembled 
50 nest protection covers on World 
Turtle Day, which are now available to 
the public for free. 

For more information, or to obtain 
a nest protection cover, send an email 
to mcbp@mdcoastalbays.org or call 
Sandi Smith at 410-213-2297 exten-
sion 106.

PHOTO COURTESY MARYLAND COASTAL BAYS 
Maryland Coastal Bays Program volunteers are pictured with turtle nest protection covers that 

will be made available to residents.

Delmarva Birding Weekend, 
OC Bay Hopper partnering 
for birdwatching cruises



Page 24 Bayside Gazette June 20, 2024

“The Place That Does It All”

WE PAY CA$H!
For Like New & Used Cars & Trucks

RACETRACK AUTO SALES 

410-352-5070

NEW TRAILERS FOR SALE 
MAINE TAGS AVAILABLE

PREVIOUSLY OWNED 
VEHICLES for SALE

MD STATE 
INSPECTED

‘17 HONDA 
CRV LX

AUTO DETAILING AVAILABLE

11740 Worcester Hwy. Showell, MD 21862 • 410-352-5070 
(Located on Rt. 113 - 1 min. North of Racetrack Road) 

BEER • WINE 
LOTTERY 

PROPANE REFILLS

SMITH’S 
MARKET

TAG & TITLE 
SERVICE

No Wait  •  Walk-In 
No Appointment Neccessary 

 Mon-Sat 8am - 4:45pm

HARD – 33

Fill in the blank spaces  in 
the grid so that every vertical 
column, every horizontal row 
and every  3 by 3 box  contains 
the numbers  1 through 9, with-
out repeating any.  There is re-
ally only one  solution to each 
puzzle.

Answers to last 
 week’s puzzles

Puzzles
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Obituary
ROBERT SCOTT MILLER JR. (SCOTT)  

Ocean City 
Robert Scott Miller Jr. (Scott) 

passed away peacefully on May 11, 
2024, due to long-time health compli-
cations.   

He was the loving son of Robert S. 
Miller Sr. (pre-deceased) and 
Virginia (Ginny) Weimer; de-
voted fiancé of Mary Stal-
naker; loyal brother to Diane 
Baxter (Tom) and Glenn 
Miller (Ginger); loving uncle 
to nephews Brandon and 
Patrick, and niece, Shelby 
Miller. 

Scott grew up in Landover 
Hills on Cooper Lane, where he was 
active in Boys Club, Cub Scouts and 
church.  He had many fond memories 
of growing up there and still has child-
hood friends. In his teen years, the 
family moved to New Carrollton, 
where he graduated from Parkdale 
High School and earned his associ-
ate’s degree from Prince George’s 
Community College. 

He was a wonderful friend to many 
and still had friends from childhood 

and high school. Scott was kind, 
thoughtful and had a big heart to help 
others. He was an avid Redskins fan, 
in addition to being a fan of the former 
Washington Senators and now, Na-
tionals baseball. Scott loved to make 
people laugh and was always joking or 

talking about his favorite 
movies and TV shows. He was 
very good with dates and 
knowledgeable of all sports. 
After working 30 years in the 
computer field, he retired to 
Ocean City to help take care of 
his mother. 

In lieu of flowers, donations 
may be made in his memory to 

St. Jude’s Children’s Hospital.  
Funeral arrangements are as fol-

lows:  A viewing will be held at 11 a.m., 
on Friday, May 17, at Mayo United 
Methodist Church, Edgewater MD, 
with service immediately following at 
Noon.  Interment to follow at Lake-
mont Cemetery in Davidsonville.  

Letters of condolence can be sent to 
the family via burbagefuneralhome. 
com. Arrangements are in the care of 
The Burbage Funeral Home. 

Scott Miller Jr.

OBITUARY NOTICES 

Obituary Notices cost $50 per week for Print and Online Publications. 
E-mail: editor@oceancitytoday.net 

Mail: 11934 Ocean Gateway, Suite 6, Ocean City, Md. 21842

Annual Ocean Pines-Taylor 
Bank Golf Scramble returns 

(June 20, 2024) The Ocean Pines 
Golf Members’ Council will host the 
40th annual Ocean Pines-Taylor 
Bank Golf Scramble at the Ocean 
Pines Golf Club on July 17 with a 9 
a.m. shotgun start.  

Players and sponsors are still 
needed, and the deadline for both is 
July 12.  

The annual tournament benefits 
junior golf in the area by supporting 
junior golf clinics and an annual tour-
nament for junior golfers.   

The scramble also raises funds for 
scholarships for local high school 
seniors who have shown an interest 
in golf.  

In the last nine years, the Golf 
Members’ Council has raised almost 
$73,000 for the program. 

The public entry fee is $120 per 
person, which includes greens fee, 
cart, team prizes, men’s and ladies’ 
closest-to-the-pin prizes, door prizes, 
on-course refreshments and lunch at 
the Clubhouse Bar and Grille follow-
ing the tournament. 

Players may sign up individually 

or as a foursome. Individuals or in-
complete teams will be paired. 

Taylor Bank is the longtime event 
title sponsor. Platinum, gold, and sil-
ver level sponsorships are still avail-
able.  

Tee sponsorships are available for 
$60 for businesses and nonmembers 
and $40 for golf members. The dead-
line for tee signs is July 10.  

To download player or sponsor-
ship forms, visit oceanpines.org/doc-
uments/20124/91011/2024+trifold+
flyer+Updated+040524.pdf/9a502fa
3 - b 7 4 b - d 3 2 a - 0 d 4 2 -
d2ca33acf63c?t=1717002996007.  

The sponsorship form includes a 
tax identification number for those 
providing sponsorships or donations. 

Entry and sponsorship forms may 
also be picked up at the Ocean Pines 
Golf Club.  

Fees may be mailed to Ocean Pines 
Golf Members’ Council, PO Box 1356, 
Berlin, Maryland 21811.  

Checks should be made payable to 
“Ocean Pines Golf Members’ Coun-
cil.”  

For more information, contact 
Steve Howse at 571-239-8469 or 
stevehowse75@gmail.com, or Bob 
Long at 410-208-0606 or 
rmlong@aol.com. 

Charity event to raise funds 
for junior tournaments, golf 
clinics, and scholarships
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Thurs., June 20 
CPAP MASK FITTING 
Atlantic General Hospital’s Sleep Disor-
ders Diagnostic Center, 9733 Healthway 
Drive, Berlin. A free, mask fitting clinic 
for patients who are having trouble ad-
justing to their CPAP equipment. Ap-
pointment required: Robin Rohlfing, 
410-641-9726. 

STORY TIME AT THE PARK 
Northside Park, 200 125th St., Ocean 
City, 10:30 a.m. Wiggle, sing and read 
interactive stories together at the picnic 
pavilion by the playground. Bring a blan-
ket or sit at a picnic table. Rain location 
is the OC Library. For ages 0-5 years. 
410-524-1818 

STORY TIME: SUMMER 
Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 10:30 a.m. 
Join in to share ideas and make a bucket 
list on things you want to do this sum-
mer. For ages 2-5 years. 410-208-4014, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

PLAY TIME 
Worcester County Library - Snow Hill 
Branch, 307 N. Washington St., 10:30 
a.m. A variety of activities and toys. Play 
and socialize with other families. For 
ages 2-5 years. 410-632-3495, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

OC CHESS CLUB 
Worcester County Library - Ocean City 
Branch, 10003 Coastal Highway, 10:30 
a.m. Enjoy a relaxing game of chess 
every Thursday at the library. 410-524-
1818, www.worcesterlibrary.org 

TRIVIA: TAYLOR SWIFT 
Worcester County Library - Ocean City 
Branch, 10003 Coastal Highway, 2 p.m. 
Test your Swifty knowledge. For all ages. 
410-524-1818, www.worcesterlibrary.org 

T(W)EEN PRIDE CRAFTERNOON 
Worcester County Library - Ocean City 
Branch, 10003 Coastal Highway, 3 p.m. 
Tweens and families can join in for an 
extra special rainbow afternoon. Hang 
out, do crafts, play the Nintendo Switch 
and spend time with friends. For ages 
12-18 years. 410-524-1818 

SPOOKY SUMMER BOOK CLUB 
Worcester County Library - Snow Hill 
Branch, 307 N. Washington St., 4:30 
p.m. Choose a title from the master of 
horror Stephen King to read and discuss. 
Refreshments provided. 410-632-3495, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org. 

CONCERT IN THE PARK 
White Horse Park Pavilion, 235 Ocean 
Parkway, Ocean Pines, 7-9 p.m. Featur-
ing “On the Edge.” Free family-friendly 
entertainment. Bring chairs and blan-

kets. BYOB permitted, concessions for 
sale. Held Thursdays through Aug. 22 
(except July 4). 410-641-7052 

BEACH SINGLE 55 PLUS MEET AND GREET 
Thursdays - Nick’s Kitchen + Bar, 14410 
Coastal Hwy., Ocean City, 4-6 p.m. 215-
385-4993, BeachSingles.org 

Fri., June 21 
MAHJONG CLUB 
Worcester County Library - Ocean City 
Branch, 10003 Coastal Highway, 10:30 
a.m. Join in for a fun morning of playing 
tile Mahjong. Feel free to bring your own 
tile set. 410-524-1818, www.worcesterli-
brary.org 

ARTISTIC ARENA: SUMMER BUCKET LIST 
Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 1 p.m. Cre-
ate a bucket list to begin your summer 
kick off. All materials provided. For ages 
6-11years and 12-18 years. 410-208-
4014, www.worcesterlibrary.org 

THE ART OF DRAG - A NIGHT OF DRAG  
EXCELLENCE 
Art League of Ocean City, 502 94th St., 
7-9 p.m. Doors open at 6 p.m. Featuring 
Miss Mann, Tara Ashleigh Austin and 
Cadet Kelly. Lite fare included. Tickets 
cost $25 plus fees. Tickets: 
https://bit.ly/TheArtofDragALOC. 410-
524-9433 

Sat., June 22 
CRAFTY SATURDAY: SUMMER 
Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 10 a.m. Surf 
on over for some tubular crafts. For all 
ages. 410-208-4014, www.worcesterli-
brary.org 

ASSATEAGUE ADVENTURES 
Worcester County Library - Berlin 
Branch, 13 Harrison Ave., 10:30 a.m. A 
ranger-led adventure featuring crafts, 
puppets, stories and cool props from As-
sateague Island National Seashore. A 
different adventure each week. 410-641-
0650, www.worcesterlibrary.org 

MOVIE MATINEE 
Worcester County Library - Pocomoke 
Branch, 301 Market St., 11 a.m. Join 
everyone’s favorite beagle and his gang 
on their summer camp adventures. 
Movie and crafts. For all ages. Registra-
tion required: 410-957-0878. 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

FREE KIDS CRAFT 
Art League of Ocean City, 502 94th St., 
11 a.m.-1 p.m. Bring the kids and do 
something creative with them and for 
them. Projects change each week. No 
reservations needed. Free and open to 

all. www.artleagueofoceancity.org 

FARMERS & ARTISANS MARKET 
Saturdays - White Horse Park, 239 
Ocean Parkway, 8 a.m. to 1 p.m. Shop 
for everything from fresh local produce 
to unique handmade artisan goods. 
Open to the public. 

Sun., June 23 
SUNDAES IN THE PARK WITH FIREWORKS 
Northside Park, 200 125th St., Ocean 
City, 7-9 p.m. Live music by “Chris Sacks 
Band” (tropicana rock), kid-friendly en-
tertainment, ice cream and fireworks. 
https://www.ococean.com/things-to-
do/free-family-fun/sundaes-in-the-
park/ 

BERLIN FARMERS MARKET 
Sundays through Sept. 8 - Pitts Street, 
Commerce Street and Main Street, 
Berlin, 9 a.m. to 1 p.m. Featuring more 
than 35 farmers, food cultivators, bak-
ers, distillers, seafood, meat, eggs and 
more. 
https://berlinmainstreet.com/farmers-
market/ 

JEHOVAH’S WITNESSES MEETING 
Sundays - Berlin Congregation of Jeho-
vah’s Witnesses, 212 West St., Berlin, 10 
a.m. www.jw.org 

Mon., June 24 
MONDAY MORNING MOVIES AND 
MUNCHIES 
Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 10 a.m. Join 
the group as they become part of Ariel’s 
world. Munchies provided. 410-208-
4014, www.worcesterlibrary.org 

STORY TIME: MERMAIDS 
Worcester County Library - Ocean City 
Branch, 10003 Coastal Highway, 10:30 
a.m. Songs, stories and activities all 
about mermaids. For ages 0-5 years. 
410-524-1818, www.worcesterlibrary.org 

WRITING FOR WELLNESS 
Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 1:30 p.m. 
Writing about stressful experiences like 
illness may boost health and psychologi-
cal well-being. The group uses exercises 
to stimulate creative expression. 410-
208-4014, www.worcesterlibrary.org 

BRIDGE 
Mondays - Ocean City 50plus Center, 
104 41st Street, Ocean City, 12:30-3:30 
p.m. Reserve a spot: Tish, 410-804-3971. 
www.Worcoa.org/oceancity 

T.O.P.S. OF BERLIN - GROUP #169 
Atlantic General Hospital, Conference 
Room 1, 9733 Healthway Drive, Berlin, 

5-6:30 p.m. Take Off Pounds Sensibly is 
a weekly support and educational group 
promoting weight loss and living a 
healthy lifestyle. Rose Campion, 410-
641-0157 

DELMARVA WOMEN’S A CAPELLA CHORUS 
Mondays - Ocean Pines Community 
Center, 239 Ocean Parkway, 6:00-8:00 
p.m. All ladies who love to sing invited. 
Mary, 410-629-9383 or Carol, 302-242-
7062. 

OVEREATER’S ANONYMOUS 
Mondays - Worcester County Library - 
Ocean Pines Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 
7-8 p.m. No dues or fees. 410-459-9100 

Tues., June 25 
SUMMER READING KICK-OFF PARTY - 
BERLIN 
Worcester County Library - Berlin 
Branch, 13 Harrison Ave., 9 a.m.-6 p.m. 
Visit your library during the Summer 
Reading kick-off party to register for 
Summer Reading and go on your first 
adventure. For all ages. 410-641-0650, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

SUMMER READING KICK-OFF PARTY - 
SNOW HILL 
Worcester County Library - Snow Hill 
Branch, 307 N. Washington St., 10:30 
a.m. Visit your library during the Sum-
mer Reading kick-off party to register 
for Summer Reading and go on your first 
adventure. For all ages. 410-632-3495, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

OC KNITTING GROUP 
Worcester County Library - Ocean City 
Branch, 10003 Coastal Highway, 10:30 
a.m. Do you love to knit or crochet? 
Bring whatever project you happen to be 
working on. 410-524-1818, www.worces-
terlibrary.org 

SUMMER READING KICK-OFF PARTY - 
OCEAN PINES 
Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 2 p.m. Visit 
your library during the Summer Reading 
kick-off party to register for Summer 
Reading and go on your first adventure. 
For all ages. 410-208-4014, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

MIL COLORES (A THOUSAND COLORS) - A 
BILINGUAL FAMILY CONCERT 
Worcester County Library - Ocean City 
Branch, 10003 Coastal Highway, 2:30-
3:30 p.m. A fun and interactive presen-
tation of Nathalia’s original bilingual 
music. Fusing popular styles of music 
with traditional Latin American sounds 
and rhythms. For all ages. 410-524-1818 

BEACH HEROES-OC 
Tuesdays - Volunteer beach clean-up 
group meets from 9-10 a.m., year-round. 

Calendar Please send calendar items to editor@oceancitytoday.net 
by 5 p.m. Monday.  All community-related activities will be 
published at no charge.
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Trash bags, grippers and gloves pro-
vided. Check the Facebook page “Beach 
Heroes-OC” for weekly meeting loca-
tions. All are welcome. 

JEHOVAH’S WITNESSES MEETING 

Tuesdays - Berlin Congregation of Jeho-
vah’s Witnesses, 212 West St., Berlin, 7 
p.m. www.jw.org 

TAKE OFF POUNDS SENSIBLY 

Tuesdays - Worcester County Health 
Department, 9730 Healthway Drive, 
Berlin, 3:30-4:30 p.m. TOPS is a weekly 
support and education group promoting 
weight loss and a healthy lifestyle. 410-
289-4725 

OC KNITTING CLUB 

Tuesdays - Worcester County Library - 
Ocean City Branch, 10003 Coastal High-
way, 10:30 a.m. 

ARGENTINE TANGO PRACTICE 

Tuesdays - Experienced dancers and 
others interested in watching or learning 
more are welcome, 7-9:30 p.m. No part-
ner required. Info: 
TangobytheBeach.com. 

ZUMBA TONING TUESDAYS 

Tuesdays - Northside Park, 200 125th 
St., Ocean City, 5:30 p.m. Zumba with 
optional light weights. 
zumbajoyceoc@gmail.com 

WEIGHT MANAGEMENT AND WELLNESS 

GROUP 

Tuesdays - Holy Trinity Cathedral, 11021 
Worcester Highway, 2-2:45 p.m. Use the 
weight loss program/app/plan of your 
choice. Free and open to everyone. 410-
641-4882, www.htcanglican.org/activi-
ties. 

Wed., June 26 
MOVIES ON THE BEACH 

Carousel Oceanfront Hotel & Condos, 
11700 Coastal Highway, Ocean City, 
8:30 p.m. Featuring “Encanto.” Enjoy 
free movies on the beach every Wednes-
day through the summer. Movie lineup: 
https://www.ococean.com/things-to-
do/free-family-fun/. 

BABY TIME 

Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 10 a.m. 
Songs, stories and giggles. For ages 0-2 
years. 410-208-4014, www.worcesterli-
brary.org 

SUMMER READING KICK-OFF PARTY - 

OCEAN CITY 

Worcester County Library - Ocean City 
Branch, 10003 Coastal Highway, 10:30-
11:30 a.m. Visit your library during the 
Summer Reading kick-off party to regis-
ter for Summer Reading and go on your 

first adventure. For all ages. 410-524-
1818, www.worcesterlibrary.org 

NAILED IT! 

Worcester County Library - Ocean Pines 
Branch, 11107 Cathell Road, 12 p.m. Try 
your skills recreating a diorama. All ma-
terials provided. For ages 6-18 years. 
410-208-4014, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

FAMILY RAINBOW CRAFTS 

Worcester County Library - Snow Hill 
Branch, 307 N. Washington St., 3 p.m. 
Show your support during Pride Month 
by making a flag, button or sticker. Fam-
ilies and teens may drop in any Wednes-
day in June from 3-5 p.m. 
410-632-3495, 
www.worcesterlibrary.org 

GRIEF SUPPORT GROUP 

Atlantic General Hospital, Conference 
Room 1, 9733 Healthway Drive, Berlin, 
3-4:30 p.m. Providing participants with 
hops for the future. Gail Mansell, 410-
641-9725, gmansell@atlanticgeneral.org 

FAMILY FUN NIGHT 

Ocean Pines Yacht Club Pool, 1 Mum-
fords Landing Road, 6-8 p.m. Featuring 
swimming, DJ, games and prizes. Cost is 
$3 for swim members; $5 for residents 
and $7 for non-resident. No cost if not 
swimming. Food available. Wednesdays 

through Aug. 21. 410-641-7052 

KIWANIS CLUB MEETING 

Wednesdays - Ocean Pines Community 
Center, Assateague Room, 239 Ocean 
Parkway, 8 a.m. Doors open at 7:30 a.m. 
Third Wednesday meetings are offsite 
and will be updated monthly on the web-
site and Facebook. Guests are welcome. 
www.kiwanisofopoc.org 

BARIATRIC SUPPORT GROUP 

Online Zoom call on the third and fourth 
Wednesday of each month. For surgical 
patients. Atlantic General Bariatric Cen-
ter, 410-641-9568 

ONGOING EVENTS 
JUNETEENTH MIXED MEDIA COLLAGE 

Pocomoke library, 301 Market St., 
Pocomoke City, June 10-21. Help create 
a collaborative collage that represents 
freedom. 410-957-0878, www.worces-
terlibrary.org 

OCEAN PINES VOLUNTEER FIRE  

DEPARTMENT RAFFLE 

Win a 2024 F-150 4X4 Supercrew 5.0L 
V8. Tickets cost $100. All expenses (reg-
istration, sales taxes, etc.) covered by 
O.P.V.F.D. Drawing will take place when 
all of the tickets have been sold. For more 
information: www.opvfd.com/f-150. 

Calendar
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June 20 - 27
ADDRESS BR/BA STYLE PRICE AGENT/AGEN

on HarbourHerro r,, 120th St., Bayside 1BR/2BR/3BR/4BR+  Condos, TToowns & SF -   Nanette Pavier/Holiday

12346 Old Bridge Rd, West OC 3BR/2BA Single Family starting at $239,750 Shelly Wilson/Salt Life 

12346 Old Bridge Rd, West OC 2BR/1BA Single Family starting at $179,900 Shelly Wilson/Salt Life 

377 WWaalnut Hill Drive, Berlin 3BR/3.5 BA Single Family $774,900 Nancy Reither/Coldwell B

13 131st St. #105, Ocean City 2BR/2BA Condo $449,000 Nancy Reither/Coldwell B

eek Haven Dr36913 Crre r.., Selbyville 4BR/3.5BA Single Family $824,900 Nancy Reither/Coldwell B

81st St. 3 #706, Rivendell, Ocean City 3 BR/3.5BA Condo $780,000 Nancy Reither/Coldwell B

377 WWaalnut Hill Drive, Berlin 3BR/3.5 BA Single Family $774,900 Nancy Reither/Coldwell B

11602 S. Hills Drive, Berlin 5BR/4.5 BA Single Family $1,849,900 Nancy Reither/Coldwell B

1300 Marina View Lane #23 4BR/4BA Condo $1,399,900 Nancy Reither/Coldwell B

1300 Marina View Lane #23 4BR/4BA Condo $1,399,900 Nancy Reither/Coldwell B

iew Lane #6 W800 Mooring V Weest OC 4BR/3.5BA Single Family $484,900 Nick Prreeziosi/Long & Fo

8 60th St. Meridian, Ocean City 4BR/3.5BA Condo $999,900 Laurreen Bunting/Keller Williams R

4 94th St. Casa Del Sol, Ocean City 3BR/2BA TToown Home $524,900 Laurreen Bunting/Keller Williams R

37844 Darning Drive, Delmar 3BR/2BA Single Family $499,900 Laurreen Bunting/Keller Williams R

Mumforrdds Landing Rd., Ocean Pines 4BR/3.5BA Single Family $629,900 Sandy Dougan/BHHS Pe

                                                                                                                                                  
                                                    

                                                 

                                                 

                                                                                             

                                                                                                 

                                                                         

                                                                    

                                                                                   

                                                                                          

                                                                                               

                                                                                                

                                                                    

                                                                                    

                                                                          

                                                                                 

                                                          

                                                                             

                                                                            

 

NCY
y Real Estate

Community

Community

Banker Realty

Banker Realty

Banker Realty

Banker Realty

Banker Realty

Banker Realty

Banker Realty

                                                                                                                                                  
                                                    

                                                 

                                                 

                                                                                             

                                                                                                 

                                                                         

                                                                    

                                                                                   

                                                                                          

                                                                                               

                                                                                                

                                                                    

                                                                                    

                                                                          

                                                                                 

                                                          

                                                                             

                                                                            

 
Presented free as a courtesy to Licensed REALTORS® who are regular OC Today-Dispatch & Bayside Gazette Advertisers. 

Friday 3-5pm

Friday 10am-1pm

Saturrdday 11am-1pm 36913 Cr

Saturrdday Noon-3pm 121 81st St. 3 #706, Rivendell, Ocean City

Sunday 10am-1pm

Sunday 1-3pm

Monday 11am-1pm Nancy Reither/Coldwell Banker Realty

WWeednesday 3-5pm Nancy Reither/Coldwell Banker Realty

Saturrdday Noon-2pm 9800 Mooring V eziosi/Long & Foster Realty

Saturrdday Noon-2pm en Bunting/Keller Williams Realty of Delmarva

Saturrdday 3-5pm 674 94th St. Casa Del Sol, Ocean City en Bunting/Keller Williams Realty of Delmarva

Sunday 11am-1pm en Bunting/Keller Williams Realty of Delmarva

Saturrdday 10am-Noon 103 Mumforrdds Landing Rd., Ocean Pines 4BR/3.5BA Single Family $629,900 Sandy Dougan/BHHS PenFed Realty

Sunday Noon-2pm 7 Evergrreeen Court, Ocean Pines 3BR/2BA Single Family $384,900 Cindy Crroockett/Hileman Real Estate, Inc.

Saturrdday 10am-Noon 21 Fairway Lane, Ocean Pines 3BR/2BA Single Family $418,000 Power of 2 TTeeam/Hileman Real Estate, Inc.

Contact Renee Kelly 667.288.1233 or renee@oceancitytoday.net 



POOL DECK ATTENDANT 
PT, 3 days per week, 10am-

6pm. Summer Seasonal. 
Check guests for arm bands, 
keep pool area clean & assist 

w/other duties as needed. 
Call 410-524-9400. 

 

Night Floor Manager  
6:00-midnight. Must be  
available for weekends. 

Must be able to lift 40 lbs. or 
more. Apply in person, 

American Legion Post 166. 
410-289-3166 

Small Engine Mechanic 
Year-round. 

Competitive Wages. 
443-754-1047 

 

Cleaners - Vacation rentals 
needed for OC and Pines. 

Experience preferred but not 
required. OC Purifiers.  

Call or text 443-397-1189 
or email  

Karen@ocpurifiers.com. 

2 Professional Cooks -  
Experience. Night shift 3:30-
9:30. Flexible weekdays and 
weekends. Must be available 
for weekends. Must be able 

to lift 40 lbs. or more.  
Apply in person,  

American Legion Post 166.  
410-289-3166 

 

IES Residential, Inc.  
Licensed Electricians & 
Subcontractors Needed 
ASAP! Full Benefits for  

Employees. Please call or 
text 302-614-6944. 

Cleaners Wanted for  
Ocean City, MD  

If you are a conscientious  
individual or team looking for 
great pay and minimal hours 
on summer Saturdays in OC, 

then we are the cleaning 
company for you. Exp.  

Preferred. Cell phone and  
vehicle required.  
443-880-0525 

 

HELP WANTEDHELP WANTED HELP WANTED

PUT COLOR IN YOUR CLASSIFIEDS! 
CALL 410-723-6397 www.baysideoc.com 

www.oceancitytoday.com

HELP WANTED HELP WANTED HELP WANTED

Call 410-723-6397 
by Monday 5 p.m.

M A R K E T P L A C E

Classifieds appear in OC Today-Dispatch & 
Bayside Gazette each week and online at  

oceancitytoday.com & baysideoc.com
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O r d e r  Y O u r  C l a s s i f i e d s  O n l i n e !

• Convenient 
• Quick 
• No Waiting, No Calls 
• Days, Nights & Weekends

OC Today-Dispatch

www.oceancitytoday.com

HIRING: Line Cooks, Sous 
Chefs, A/V Techs, Painters, 
Maintenance Staff, Plumber, 
Security, Office Staff, Food 

Runners, Cashiers,  
Carpenters and more  

Apply in person or online at 
seacrets.com

NOW HIRING!!  
Production Crew  

for our WOC kitchen facility 
Up to $20/hr.  

Apply online at:  
www.delmarvadd.com

 • Line Cooks   • Food Runners 
• Bussers  

302-539-2607  
Apply In Person. Fenwick Island

 

 
Currently Hiring Manpower For: 

Carpenter | Laborer | Painters 
Stucco & EIFS Mechanics 

Concrete Work  
o Experience preferred. 
o Tools, transportation & valid driver’s license   
   are a plus. 
o Excellent pay and a competitive benefits  
   package available.   

Please Apply Online:  
https://www.allstatesconst.com/delmarva-renovations-careers   

Or Contact Our Office at 410-352-9800

THE SPINNAKER 
Now Hiring 

PT, PM (4pm-mid.) 

MAINTENANCE/ 
HOUSEMAN 

Fri., Sat., Sun. 
Apply in person 

1800 Baltimore Ave., OC

KITCHEN 
MANAGER/COOK  
postion w/salary to  

commensurate 
w/exp.   

OC ELKS LODGE  
Contact Vivian Merritt 

to apply,  
410-299-1336.

TOWN OF SNOW HILL, MARYLAND 
WATER/WASTEWATER OPERATOR 

 
The Town of Snow Hill is accepting applications for the po-
sition of Water/Wastewater Operator.  Responsibilities in-
clude but not limited to: maintenance on pumps, valves, 
motors, etc.; troubleshoot operational problems; performs 
laboratory analysis; collects samples and mixes chemicals; 
water meter readings, testing and repairs; sewer service 
connections and sewer line maintenance.  Preferred candi-
date has Class 2 Water Treatment Operator license and/or 
5A Wastewater Treatment license, and certification to col-
lect drinking water samples; has good organizational skills 
and excellent communication skills.   
Salary commensurate with experience.  This is a full-time 
position with Town benefits, health insurance and Maryland 
State Retirement.    
To request an application form, send resume with salary re-
quirements to: execadmin@snowhillmd.com or Town of 
Snow Hill, Michelle Beckett-El Soloh, P.O. Box 348, Snow 
Hill, Maryland 21863

NOW HIRING!  
• BARTENDER 
FT, Daytime 11am-5pm  

• COOK 
Day/Night  

Call Pam 
410-726-7061 

or apply within 
56th Street

Thunderbird Beach Motel 
Now Hiring  

NIGHT AUDITOR  
Midnight-8am.  

Roommaster exp. pref. 
Apply in person.  

32nd St., Baltimore Ave.  
Mon.-Fri., 9am-3pm
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Pool -  
General Maintenance.  

Outdoor work, lifting heavy 
objects. Mechanical, basic 

pool pump & motors,  
CPO a plus / not required.  

Able to pass CPO test.  
Summer includes weekends 
& long hours; working alone 

or with others 
410-289-4902 

 ask for Suzanne. 

 

RENTALS 

Seeking YR & Seasonal 
Rentals! Call Howard Martin 

Realty 410-352-5555. 

Waterfront Bayside - Newly 
remodeled 2BR, 2BA Condo 

in North OC. 4 steps to 
ground level off your private 

balcony. Full kitchen, LR, 
DR, W/D, balcony w/tables + 

seating for 6. Seasonal/ 
monthly Dec.-April, $2,000. 

Contact Julie  
443-223-4623. 

 

YR/SEASONAL OC  
4BR, 2BA Home in tranquil 

Mallard Island, 15th St.  
On-site parking in rear,  

central air, W/D.  
$4,200/mo. & sec. dep. 

Email: 
jmoses@ocrooms.com. 

 

 

COMMERCIAL 

Industrial Warehouse.  
Space: 1500 sq. ft.  

Masonry construction,  
18’ high ceiling, large  

garage door, bathroom,  
yard and storage shed.  

Approx. 10x25+/-  
Route 90/Bishopville.  
Call 443-497-4200. 

1 Office/Retail Space  
available in West Ocean  

City. Approximately        
1656 sq. ft.   

Call 443-497-4200 

 

Do you have an old bicycle 
not being used? It could 
mean a world of difference to 
a hard-working international 
student. We are looking to 
get as many bikes as possi-
ble. Your donation will be tax-
deductible. Contact Gary at 
443-975-3065. 

 

WANT TO BUY 

WANTED TO BUY: Vintage 
signs, old advertising items, 
military memorabilia, antique 

toys, decoys, and small  
antique items.  

Call/text, 443-880-3082 

 

YARD SALE 

WHISPERING WOODS 
COMMUNITY WIDE  

YARD SALE  
(WOC, off Rt. 611)  

Saturday, June 22nd,  
8am-noon.  

Items for the whole family!! 

 

BOATS/PWC 

FREE SAILBOAT  
1976, 27’ Catalina Yachts. 

Call for details,  
443-880-7453. 

HELP WANTED RENTALS DONATIONS 

RENTALS

YARD SALE

WANT TO BUY

Classified  
Deadline is  
Monday @  

5pm

www.baysideoc.com 
www.oceancitytoday.com

COMMERCIAL

BOATS/PWC

BUDGET MOVERS 
443-664-5797 

LOCAL & EAST COAST MOVING 
Full Packing Service 

Piano Movers - Full Service 

www.facebook.com/OCBudgetMovers

SERVICES

Yearly & Seasonal 
Rentals  

We Welcome Pets 
7700 Coastal Hwy 
410-524-7700 

www.holidayoc.com

4 x 5.306”

CLASSIFIED AD NETWORK
Serving the Newspapers of  
Maryland, Delaware and the  
District of Columbia since 1908.

MARYLAND STATEWIDE  
CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING  

NETWORK 

PETS/PET SUPPLIES 
When veterinary care is un-
available or unaffordable, ask 
for Happy Jack® animal 
healthcare products for cats, 
dogs, & horses. At Tractor 
Supply® & Southern States® 

FOR SALE 
Prepare for power outages 
today with a GENERAC Home 
Standby Generator. Act now 
to receive a FREE 5-Year war-
ranty with qualifying pur-
chase. Call 1-855-993-0969 
today to schedule a free 
quote. It’s not just a genera-
tor. It’s a power move. 

MISC. FOR SALE 
Get Boost Infinite! Unlimited 
Talk, Text and Data For Just 
$25/mo! The Power Of 3 5G 
Networks, One Low Price! 
Call Today and Get The Latest 
iPhone Every Year On Us! 
855-977-5719 

Get DISH Satellite TV + Inter-
net!  Free Install, Free HD-
DVR Upgrade, 80,000 
On-Demand Movies, Plus 
Limited Time Up To $600 In 
Gift Cards. Call Today! 1-855-
407-6870 

 

SERVICES 
DENTAL INSURANCE from 
Physicians Mutual Insurance 
Company. Coverage for 350 
plus procedures. Real dental 
insurance - NOT just a dis-
count plan. Do not wait! Call 
now! Get your FREE Dental 
Information Kit with all the de-
tails! 1-855-337-5228  

www.dental50plus.com/ 
MDDC #6258 

VEHICLES WANTED 
DONATE YOUR CAR/TRUCK/ 
RV - Lutheran Mission Society 
of MD Compassion Place 
ministries help local families 
with food, clothing, counsel-
ing. Tax deductible. MVA li-
censed #W1044.  

410-228-8437  
www.CompassionPlace.org

Advertise in  
MDDC  

410-723-6397

MISC./OTHER

Shoulders soft and bare, 
The sun arches for the 

moment, 
Just out of reach! 

That denied caress, 
Now gone with the dawn!

SEEKING RENTAL

Active, Retired Couple 
Married 50 yrs.!  

Seeking to Rent   
~ YEAR ROUND ~ 

OCEANFRONT CONDO 
to enjoy our last years  

together. 1 level preferred. 
Beginning October ’24. 

OC/Lewes/Bethany.   
Call Steve or Pat,  

717-969-2401



COMPLETE BODY SHOP   
Auto Sales & Service • Complete Computerized Diagnostic Specialists

TRAILER PARTS, SALES & SERVICE  
ROUTE 589, RACE TRACK ROAD

410-641-5262
ROUTE 50, BERLIN

 (1/2 Mile East of McDonald’s) 
410-641-3200

AUTO & MARINE TIRE CENTER

autOMOtiVe repair

410-641-3200

BaysideOC.com

AUTOMOTIVE REPAIR cleaning services

Family Owned and Operated Since 1983

Carpet, Upholstery, Tile and 
Grout Cleaning 

Oriental Rug Cleaning and Repair 

     302-436-5652

CLEANING SERVICES

D E N TA LDENTAL
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ial/Emergencies! 

ELECTRICIAN

THE 
HANDY BEACHMAN

Exterior Home Repairs 
“WE DO IT ALL”

Licensed • Bonded • Insured • MHIC 17433 
“A Family Tradition Since 1935” 
410-893-9707

• Roofing Repairs 
• Roof Cleaning 

• Gutter Cleaning & Powerwashing • 
• Deck Repairs •

• Rain Gutters 
• Gutter Guards 

• Screening 
• Painting 

• Staining 
• Caulking

PARRISH
HANDYMAN

PAUL’S HOME IMPROVEMENTS
All phases of home improvements 

No job too small - No job too large 
Handyman Home Services

FREE ESTIMATES 
Over 45 years 

experience

MHIC 
#83501 410-641-7548

HOME IMPROVEMENT
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H O M E  I M P R O V E M E N T

Home Impr

1312 Manklin Creek, Rd., Ocean Pines, MD ~ Call or Stop in T

Home Imprroovement Services Company

PipeLine 
Contracting, LLC

“One stop shop 

• Cabinets & Countertop
• Kitchen & Bath Remodeling
• General Carpentry & 

Painting 

• Flooring & TTiile
 • Residential & Commercial 
 • Servicing Maryland &

Delaware Beaches

US VVeeterans
Administration 

Approved Contractor

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

  
     

   
 
                             

 
               

               
 

   
     
 

 (410) 208-1518 • (41
pipelinecontracting.net • info@p

MDHIC # 107489 • DE # 20141003

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

  
     

   
 
                             

 
               

               
 

   
     
 

0) 982-8368
pipelinecontracting.net
04 • Insured & Licensed

HOME IMPROVEMENT

Ceramic • Marble • Glass • Installations 
Specializing in Showers and Bath Renovations

John 
443-497-1351

Free Estimates / Insured 
C.S.G.

HOME IMPROVEMENT

DIRECTORY

Dirty Ducts, LLC 
HVAC Duct & Dryer Vent Cleaning

Joseph Payne 
Manager 

jpayma200@gmail.com

5 Southwind Court 
Berlin, MD 21811 
Family Owned & Operated 484-744-9309

HVAC

The Area’s #1 Moving Company
BUDGET MOVERS

40+Years in Business                                                  Licensed & Insured

LOCAL • ENTIRE EAST COAST
Residential or Office or Commercial

Packing or Loading or Unloading or Complete Move 
Single Item or Certain Items or Full Home

Call Maria: 443-664-5797
Female Owned & Operated

www.Facebook.com/ocbudgetmovers

MOVING SERVICES MVA licensed
NEW TITLE AND TAGS  AND MORE 

          www.westoceancitytagandtitle.com

WEST OCEAN CITY 

VEHICLE TAG & TITLE 
TRADER LEE’S VILLAGE 

9935 STEPHEN DECATUR HIGHWAY #15

JODY PALMISANO 
410-629-5600 

NEW TITLE AND TAGS  AND MORE 

          www.westoceancitytagandtitle.com

WEST OCEAN CITY 

VEHICLE TAG & TITLE 
TRADER LEE’S VILLAGE 

9935 STEPHEN DECATUR HIGHWAY #15

JODY PALMISANO 
410-629-5600 

Open Mon., Fri., 9-2 & Wed. 9-5

MVA LICENSEDmental health

Island Care Mental Health  
Mary Deborah Wilson 

PMHNP  
Avoid the Delays 

Medication & Therapy 
MD DE Lic.     410-641-5190

MENTAL HEALTH

isa VieWeW accept MC/V

pes of Custom Remodeling.yTyAll 
Additions, Kitchens, Baths and  Specializing in 

T

home improvement

(410) 6411-3762

HOME IMPROVEMENT

Arrive In Style

Airport Service ~ Special Events ~ 
Fun Night On The Town  

410-251-0870 
www.arriveinstyle.com 

Locally owned & operated

CAR VALET & TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

HOME IMPROVEMENT
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PRINTING & DESIGN

11065 Cathell Road • Ocean Pines 
410-208-0641 • copycentral@verizon.net

OPEN 
Mon.-Fri.  

9am-5pm

ONE STOP SHOP For ALL YOUR PERSONAL & BUSINESS NEEDS

NOT YOUR AVERAGE COPY CENTER
Full Business Center 

Custom Gifts 

Graphic Designs 

Retail Gift Items 

Wedding Print Services 

PRINTING & DESIGN REAL ESTATE ROOFING

Your Roofing, Siding & Home Improvement  
Specialist Since 1989  

ROOFING • SIDING • DURADEK • WINDOWS • GUTTERS

Mike Moesle 410-629-1573, Fax: 410-629-1946 
   mmoesle@shoresidingmd.com 
   www.shoresidingmd.com                    *Licensed in MD, DE &VA

ROOFING & SIDING

ROOFING

DIRECTORY

POWERWASHING

all services     
           w/this ad!

POWERWASHING / SOFT WASH
Atlantic Coast Powerwashing Services

Year round  
services 

w/yearly & 
seasonal  

rates

Hot Water, Powerwashing 
& Soft Wash Systems

• Houses 
• Deck Staining • Decks  

• Docks • Restaurants 
• Shopping Centers  

• Roofs • & More
MHIC 97081 

Ocean City 34629 • Delaware 2004 222 381 
Licensed & Insured

410-603-3400 
Joe Beran/Owner Operator 
acms1st@gmail.com

Atlantic Coast Powerwashing Services
Reasonable Rates • Commercial & Residential • Complete Exterior Cleaning

FREE ESTIMATES

POWERWASHING / SOFT WASH

Zimmerman 
& Son LLC

• CUSTOM PAINTING 
• DRYWALL REPAIRS 
• WALLPAPER REMOVED 
• DECK & HOUSE 
  STAINING 
• ALWAYS PROMPT  
  SERVICE 
     Free Estimates

10% Discount with this ad. 

Bill Zimmerman cell 443-373-4539

NOW ACCEPTING 
CREDIT CARDS!

Painting & Powerwashing 
Interior & Exterior 

Serving Delmarva for Over 35 Years 
Licensed & Insured

PAINTINGPAINTING
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SERVING DELMARVA FOR OVER 20 YEARS 
888-ZWEEMER • 302-363-6116

Call Us Today For Your 
FREE EstimateMention This Ad

10% OFF ANY JOB

Residential • Commercial • Licensed & Insured

for All First Responders & Active Military
15% OFF ANY JOB

Low  Maintenance  Cost Effective  Driveways Installed Quickly   CALL TODAY! 

DRIVEWAY & PARKING LOT  
INSTALLATIONS & MAINTENANCE

Berlin and Ocean Pines Most Trusted Source  
For All Your Paving Needs For Over 20 Years!

• Seal Coating 
• Patching 

• Black Top 
• Millings Grading 

We Fill Pot Holes, Fix Root Problems  
and Install Drains For Water Problems

• Stone 
• Tar & Chip
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